
I 

CITY OF SHERWOOD, OREGON 

RESOLUTION NO.~ ""7'if 

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING FOR THE CITY OF SHERWOOD THE FIRE PREVENTION CODE 
FOR TUALATIN RURAL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN LOCALLY 
DESIRED AMENDMENTS TO SAID FIRE PREVENTION CODE. 

WHEREAS, the Tualatin Rural Fire Protection District services the 
City of Sherwood and its inhabitants therein; and 

WHEREAS, the Tualatin Rural Fire Protection District has submitted 
its "Ordinance Adopting a Fire Prevention Code for Tualatin Rural Fire 
Protection District Prescribing Regulations Governing Conditions Hazardous 
to Life and Property from Fire or Explosion and Providing for Administration 
and Enforcement Thereof, Establishing a Bureau of Fire Prevention, Providing 
Officers therefor and Defining Their Duties and Powers and Other Pertinent 
Provisions"; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council for the City of Sherwood has reviewed said 
Ordinance and has received the recommendations and comments thereon from 
city staff and representatives of the Tualatin Rural Fire Protection District; 
and 

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Sherwood finds that the 
adoption of the aforementioned ordinance, together with certain locally 
desired amendments as set forth below would be in the best interests of the 
health, safety and general welfare of the city's citizens; 

NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS HEREBY RESOLVED: 

1. That the City of Sherwood adopts .the Ordinance Adopting a Fire 
Prevention Code for Tualatin Rural Fire Protection District Prescribing 
Regulations Governing Conditions Hazardous to Life and Property from Fire or 
Explosion and Providing for Administration and Enforcement thereof, Establish­
ing a Bureau of Fire Prevention, Providing Officers therefor and Defining 
Their Duties.and Powers, and Other Pertinent Provisions, a copy of same 
marked Exhibit "A": being attached hereto and by reference incorporated herein 
as if fully set forth, save and except those amendments thereto as set forth 
below. 

2. The City of Sherwood hereby adopts the following amendments to 
the aforementioned Exhibit "A": 

(a) Section III - DEFINITIONS (d): The term 
"the appropriate City Attorney" shall be 
stricken so DEFINITIONS ( d) reads, "Where­
ever the term 'corporation counsel' or 'city 
attorney' is used in the Codes adopted herein, 
it shall be held to mean the attorney for 
Tualatin Rural Fire Protection District or 
the appropriate County District Attorney, 
whichever is deemed to be suitable by the 
Fire Chief." 

(b) There shall be added to Section X - PENALTIES 
the following sentence to the end of the last 
paragraph: "The Fire District will provide 
copies of all inspection notices to the city 
by address of location of property inspected." 

I. RESOLUTION NO.~ 



(c) There shall be added an additional Section XV -
PREMISES: 11 For purposes of this ordinance 
'premises' means all structures which are subject 
to the jurisdiction of the State Fire Marshal 
under ORS 476. 

(d) Section VIII - APPEALS, Board Member Qualifications, 
for purposes of appeals relating to premises 
within the City of Sherwood, shall be amended to 
read as follows: 

"The Fi re Code Advisory and Appeals Board ( here­
inafter called the "Board") shall consist of five 
regular members and five or more alternative_ 
members jointly appointed by the Chief of 
Tualatin Rural Fire Protection District and the 
City Council of the City of Sherwood •11 

Add to the end of paragraph two of Section VIII: 

11 Any member may be removed by the Chief of 
Tualatin Rural Fire Protection District and 
the City Council for cause. Upon the death, 
resignation, or removal of any member, a succes­
sor shall be appointed by the Chief of Tualatin 
Rural Fire Protection-District and the City 
Council to serve the balance of the unexpired 
term." 

(e) Section VII - A. - Section 1.102-(d): Change 
"District" to "City". 

(f) Section VII - E. - Section 10.207-(g): Add 
"unless fire fighting access is not directly 
affected by this requirement". 

(g) Section XI: Revise second paragraph to read: 

"In order to assist in defraying expenses in 
examination of construction plans and subsequent 
on-site inspection of actual construction, 
a fee shall be paid at the time the application 
for a fire, life and safety permit is filed 
with the District. This fee shall be 40 percent 
of the building permit .fee, pursuant to ORS 
456.760. 

2. RESOLUTION No.d-.-1~ 

INTRODUCED AND ADOPTED THIS ~day 
of December, 1983. 

CITY OF SHERWOOD, OREGON 

By ~ o(;;/d..;, 
Mayor ' 



Kt.;>VLUl1Ul1 O't-'t 

' Rf ~ .NXPrllG FIRE CIUS AND STANill'\ROO ~ Blll.1Ll\TlWS 
OOYEllt:D:OO a:::m>rrIOOS BAZARIXll) 'IO LIPE AND PlOPERlY FlOf FIRE CR 

EXPIJ.X:;ICU, PRJVIDINJ FCE. 'l1IE :r.s&Wa CR l'Em1.rrS Fal HAZARIXll:i USES CR 
CPmwrIWS, AND ES'l'1\BLISHINl A WRF.NJ CR FIRE PmVmrl:00 AND PRJIIIDIOO 
CE?I~ '1HEREEOO AND t.EFm'IW 'lHEIR PCMERS AND WTIES, AND REP&!\I..ID'.; 

OODlNAOCE(s) ----------
WHERFAS, the District, p.irsuant to the auth:>rity granted um.er ORS 
198.510 to OOS 198.600 and ORS 478.910 to ORS 478.940, has the ~ 
to adopt a fire prevention oode. 

WHEREAS, the District desires to and fioos it necessary to adopt the 
follCMi.ng regulations to provide maxi.mun fire safety arrl that a plan 
for inspections and maintenance will upgrade existing structures, 
thereby reducin;J hazams of fire, thus does hereby adopt the following 
regulations. 

'Ihe W10le of this ordinance including the Codes hereby adopted have 
been and are OCM filed in the record of the District arrl in the 
Office of the Cbunty Clerk as prescribed in ORS 478.560 arrl with the 
state Fire Marshal's Office and fran the date on \rvhich this ordinance 
shall take effect, the provisions thereof shall be cx:ntrolling within 
the limits of the area krXJwn as the District arrl the whole of this 
ordinance shall be kn:::Mn as the Fire Prevention Code of the District. 

'lbere is hereby adopted by the District for the purpose of prescribin;J 
regulations governing cxnlitions hazardous to life arrl property fran 
fire or explosion, tb:>se certain Codes arrl Staooards krv,m as the: 

A. Uniform Fire Code, including Af:perxlix Ola.pters II-D, III-A, III-C, 
V-A, VI-A, and the Uniform Fire Code staooards published by .the 
Western Fire Chiefs Association arrl the International Cbnference of 
Building Officials, being particularly the 19~2 editions thereof arrl 
the whole thereof save and except such portions as are hereinafter 
deleted, m::xlified or amerxied by Section 7 of this ordinance. 

B. Uniform Building Code, 1982 Edition, including appendix chapters, 
as amended arrl adopted by the Building Cbde Division of the State of 
Oregon, Department of o:mnerce arrl the Office of the State Fire 
Marshal as the State of Oregon Structural Specialty Code arrl Fire arrl 
Life Safety Regulations, only to the extent of adoption as has been or 
shall be adopted by the Office of the Oregon State Fire Marshal, save 
and except for porticns as are hereinafter deleted, m:::xiified or amerrled 
by this ordinance. 

c. Uniform ~cal Code, 1982 Fdition, as amended arrl adopted by 
the State of Oregon, Department ·of o:mnerce, an:i the Office of the 
State Fire Marshal as the State of Oregon ~ical Specialty a:de 
arrl Mechanical Fire arrl Life Safety Regulations arrl the whole thereof, 
save and except for portions as are hereinafter deleted, m:dified or 
ameooed by this ordinance. 

o. State of Ore:Jon Muinistrative Rules, Oregon State Fire Marshal, 
Chapter 837. Divisions 11-010 through 11-030, 41, 43, 44, 45, arrl 80, 
of Oregcn .Administrative Rules, Oregon State Fire Marshal are herein 
adopted arrl as such beccrne a part of this Fire Co:ie. 



.. 

' :c:: ~ 'l98l 

TUfllHll~ HUHHl Flflf PR~1f~1l~~ ~1~1Rl[1 
P.O. BOX 117 • TUALATIN, OREGON 97062 e PHONE 681·1601 • RUSSELL WASHBURN, CHIEF 

October 3, 1983 

TO: All Cities an::l Counties wit.hin Tualatin Fire District 

RE: Fire Prevention Ccxle ORS 478.910 

Every 3 years Fire Districts are required to update their Fire 
Prevention Code. Enclosed is a copy of t.he revised and adopted Fire 
Preventicn Code. Tualatin Fire District is askin;J each city an::l 
county t.o approve this Fire Prevention Ccxle by resolution in 
acoordance with ORS 478.924 (see attachment). This revised Fire 
Prevention Code adopts the 1982 Edition of t.he Unifonn Fire Code, 
Uniform Building Code arxl the Uniform Mechanical Code. 

In an effort to standardize code enforcement Tualatin Fire District 
has adopte:i the same Fire Preventioo Code as Washington County Fire 
District tl aoo the City of Beaverton. This means t.hat t.he same 
fire and life safety r8:JUlations will be enforced through::>ut east 
Washington County an:i part of Clackamas O:>unty. Standardization of 
code enforcenent should assist architects, developers arxl builders 
.\t.bQ are required to utilize these codes. 

You will note mi.oor--word-changes-tl'ID::xlglx:>ut:t.ru:s document as the 
result of canbini.ng 3 fire district codes (Tualatin Fire District, 
Washington County Fire District #1 am the City of Beaverton) • No 
amendments have been made in the Unifonn Building Code or the 
Uniform Mechanical Cede. 'l.welve amenanents t.o the Uniform Fire Code 
are listed in Section VII on pages 4, 5, 6 and .part of page 7. 

The only significant change fran our old document is a water flOd 
requirement in Section VII.G. This amendment provides a reasonable 
requirement for fire protectioo in newly constructe:i high-rise 
buildings or large Wustrial·occupancies \<.here a good municipal 
water SUI=PlY is rot available. This 3000 GPM water flo.,., requirement 
has been in affect in Washington C.ounty District #1 an:i t-.he City of 
Beaverton for sane t.ime. It reduces the need t.o provide additional 
equipnent am manpower to canbat fire in high-rise occupancies • 

. In the interest of standardized codes in the metropolitan area we are 
asking each city or county to adopt this code wit.hout amendments. 
Please place this Resolutioo oo your agerrla as so:n as possible. If 
you have any questions regarding the Fire Prevention Code, please 
feel free to call at any time. 

cc: Chief Washburn 

Sincerely, 

~~ 
Tan Thonpson 
Fire Marshal 



.. . . .. ..,, 
, · .... ~, . ,, .. 

J. \'llenever the tem "ex>rperaticn counsel" or "City Attomey" is 
. used it shall be held to mean the Att.omey fur this fire district, or 

·:,..,,,. · ··:· m-·:7-tlle#"'~te~- City· Attomey i' or· the · ·appropriate · <l:>unty. · District: 
Attorney, · \fflichever is deemed ·to be suitable or appropriate by the 
Fire OU.ef. 

I<. "4lenever the teDn "jurisdiction", "city, "cx:,unty", 11state11
, or 

"municipality" is· used . it shall . be held to nean this fire district or 
the City or County of \ffli.ch this department is a part thereof. 

L. Whenever the teDn "Structural Specialty Oxle" is used.it sha.11 be 
held to the same definition as may appear in any other section of 
this Oxle or municipal code of the City of "41.ich this fire department 
is a part thereof. 

M. "4lenever the term "hazardous vehicles" is used it shall be held 
to mean vehicles blockio] public or-private right-of-way fire hydrants, 
vehicles with leaking gas tanks and vehicles located in violation of 
the fire code. 

si:x::r!Ct:il rY ~ CR LIMl'l'S CR DISTRICl'S m WHICll SIQRN.;E CE 
~ 00 CXM3CETIBr.E LI<J,JIIS IN CXJl'SilE ~ID 'mtilK, IS 
P1UitBl'lE) 

'lhe limits referred to in Section 79.501 of the Unifonn Fire Code 
relat.irg to storage of Class I ard II flarnnable or ccm:.,ustible liquids 
in outside above-grouoo tanks is prohibited except the fullCMing 
areas: 

All areas other than tb:>se currently described in the Washington O::lunty 
1.Cni.rg Otdinance as J\F-5, J\F-10, J,,F-20, EFU, EFC and ~-2 zcnes or 
their equivalent zc:nes and then only \tAten the location and storage 
facilities have been first approved and a pennit d:>tained p.1rsuant to 
Sectico 79.103. 

SEX:TIW V ~ CE LIMrrS· CF DISTRICTS IN WEIIaI S'lUWiE OF 
EXPIOOIVES RID BrA5Tim ~ IS PREIBrl"ED 

'lhe limits referred to in Section 77 .106(b) of the Unifonn Fire Oxle, 
in 'thich storage of explosives and blasting agents is prohibited, are 
hereby established as follChlS: 

All areas other than those currently described in Washington County 
7,oning Ordinance as EFC and MA-2 zcnes and then only when those 
distances prescribed in the hnerican Table of Distances for the 
storage of explosives (Unifonn Fire Code Table No. 77 .201) are 
maintained and a permit is obtained pursuant to Section 77.104. 

~CN VI ESTABLI.SaU:Nl' CF LIMITS IN WEIIO:I SlURJ\GE CF LIOOEFIED 
PElRLEllt ~ IS 'IO BE RESTRICI'ID 

'!he limits referred to in Section 82 .105 of the Uniform Fire Code, in 
wu.ch storage of liquefied petroleun gas is restricted, are hereby 
established as follows: 

All areas other than th:,se currently described in the Washington <bunty 
ZOning Ordinance as AF-5, AF-10, AF-20, EFU, EFC, an:i MA-2 zones arrl 
then only when ai:proval has been obtained pursuant to Section 82.102. 

3 



. . . 
-~ . -~-

~cu n ~ Nm wrIES CR WREN1 CR FIRE PREVENriail 

• :··-t·:-. ·r.,·;"!-A~ .. 1lblf'·:un:11xmn·Fire eode,:the Unifotm Buil.din:'J Code, and the Unifom 
Mechanical O:>de, shall be enforced by the Bureau of Fire Prevention in 
the fire department in the District, \fflich was previously established 
am wu.ch shall be q:ierated under the supervision of the arl.ef of the 
fire department. 

SECrIW III IEFINI.T.IOE 

Definitions set forth in the State of Qrega1 Structural Specialty Co:le 
and Fire am Life Safety Clxle, the state of oregon ~ 
Specialty O:xle am Mechanical Fire and Life Safety O:xle, the Unifonn 
Fire Co:le and the Naticnal Fire Code (N.F.P.A) are hereby adopted save 
and except for the followings 

A. ~ever the tenns "administrator" or "director" are used, they 
shall be held to mean the Fire Orl.ef or his authorized representative. 

B. Whenever the term· ·11Ebard of Afpeals" is used, it shall be held to 
mean the Boam_ of Afpeals that is provided by the Fire Prevention Co:le 
of this fire district. 

c. Whenever the term "B::>ard of O::>unty O:mnissioners" or "City 
O:>uncil" is used it shall be held to mean the Board of Directors of 
this fire district. 

D. Whenever the term "building oode" is used it shall be held to mean 
't.hichever build.in; oode is currently in use in the particular juris­
diction served by this fire department or the particular building 
·oode-or codes adopted by this fire district. 

...... ~, 

E. Whenever the tex:m ''building department" is used· it shall be held to 
mean the Fire Prevention Division of this fire district or the 
buildirg department of the City·or County.of w\:dch this fire department 
is a part thereof. 

F. Whenever the tenn ''buildirg official" is used it shall be held to 
mean the Fire Mll'shal of this fire district or his authorized 
representative or the build.irg official of the City or County of which 
this fire department is a part thereof. 

G. Whenever the tenn "Orl.ef of Bureau of Fire Prevention", "Fire 
Prevention Engineer", "State Fire Marshal" are used they shall be held 
to mean the Fire Marshal of this fire district or his authorized 
representative. 

H. Whenever the tenn ''Orl.ef" or "Ori.ef of the fire department" is 
used it shall be held to niean the Orl.ef of this fire district. 

I. Whenever the term "Ori.ef of Police" is used it shall be held to 
mean Wlichever Sieriff or Chief of Police has jurisdiction within the 
geographical area so affect.e:i. 

2 



. . ~ 
E. SecUon 10. Z!J7 is mnended by ~ paragrafh ( g) , 

(g) 'lbe.grede slope of required access, roads, streets and 
driveways shall rot exceed 15 percent. 

Article 1£1 is ameo:ied by adding a new sub-secticn 10. 210: 

F. Section 1£1. 210 Al.1lBJIU'lY 'ro 'ltM Hl\ZARIXXJS VflllCIBS 

The Chief or other officer of the fire department may inmediately 
cause a vehicle to be ~ without prior ootice at the c,..,mer's 
expense if the vehicle is det.emdned to be a hazaroous vehicle. 

G. Section l0.30l(c) is ameooed to read: 

(c) Required Fire Flow: No building shall be CXX1Structed, 
altered, enlarged, or repaired m a manner that by reason of size, 
type of CCDStruction, n\J'Cber of stories, location on property, 
occupancy, or any catlbi.nation thereof creates a need for a fire flow 
in excess of 3000 gallons per minute at 20 p:>UOi per square inch 
residual pressure. 

Existi.DJ ooildings that require a fire flow in excess of 3000 
gallons per minute are oot. required to a:mply with the fire flow 
requirements of this section; however, alterations, additions or 
repairs shall oot further increase the required fire flow for the 
build:in3s. rurthei:m:»:e, if alterations, additions, or repairs made m 
any 12 ncnth period exceed fifty percent ( 50%) of the area of the 
building, the entire building shall be made to CXXlfonn with the fire 
flow requirements. 

Fire fl.CM requirements m excess of 3000 gallons per minute may 
be all.C1Ned if, m the opinion of the Oti.ef, all reasonable methods of 
reducing the required fire flCM have been :included within the 
developnent an:l oo unusual hazaro to life an:l p~perty exists. 

In detennining the required fire flows the Cri.ef may be guided 
by the starrlard plblished by the Insurance Set-vices office "Guide 
for Detenni.nation of P.equired Fire FlCM''. 

An approved water supply capable of supplying required fire flow 
for fire protection shall be provided to all premises upon which 
buildings or portions of buildings are hereafter cx::nstructed. Water 
supply may o::nsist of reservoirs, pressure tanks, elevated tanks, 
water mams or other fixed systems capable of supplying the required 
fire flow. other water supply sources may be counted as contributing 
to the StWlY if, m the ju::lgment of the Otl.ef, the source is 
deper'.dable, readily accessible am adaptable to use by public fire­
fightinJ equiµnent. 

5 



'lbe. Uliform .Fire COde is mnerded and dlanged · in the foll<:Ming · 
respectsz 

A. Section 1.102 is ameoded by adding a new paragraiil ( d) : 

'(d) hhere the cx:o:li.tions inp:>sed. by a provision of this O:::xle 
differ fran tb:>se imp::>sed by arx>ther oroinance, law or 
regul.atioo·havin;J awlicatioo m the District, the provision 
'nhich is m::ist restrictive shall govem. 

B. Secticn 2 .101 is amerxled by addin;J paragra{ils ( i, j , k arrl 1) 

( i) Adequacy of means of ai;proach to buildings am. structures by 
m::oile fire apparatus, am firefightln:J personnel.· 

( j) Providing fire fightuY:J water supplies arrl fire detection 
aoo sui;:pression apparatus adequate for the protection of 
buildi.n3s ~·structures. . 

(k) Issuance of permits before burning trash or waste 
materials. 

(1) Inspection of premises by officers designated by the Poard 
of Directors arrl requirin; removal of fire hazards foutrl en 
premises at such inspecticns. 

c. Section 2.102 is arnerx:led as follows: 

'1he Quef, by executive order, is authorized to make, pranulgate 
ax¥i enforce such rules arrl regulations for the prevention arrl 
oontrol of fires and hazards as may be necessary fran time to 
time to carry out the mtent of this C'Ode. Certified copies 
of such rules arrl regulations shall be . filed with the County 
cierk arxi be available fur public inspection pursuant to ORS 
478.940, am. shall be in effect inmediately thereafter an:i 
additional cq,ies shall be kept m the Fire Prevention Bureau 
office for distribution to the public. 

D. Section 2.104 is amended as follows: 

(a) The Oti.ef (or the Fire Marshal) in charge of the Bureau 
of Fire Prevention shall be ar:pointed by the appropriate 
auth::>rity of the District, on the basis of examination 
to determine his qualifications. 

(b) '!he Orl.ef of the fire department may detail such manbers 

.. , - . ---~~--... = ... --,----

of the fire department as inspectors as shall fran time to 
time be necessary. 'Ihe Cllief of the fire department shall 
reccmnend to the District the employment of technical 
inspectors, wb:>, when such authorization is made, shall be 
selected through an examination to detennine their fitness 
for the p::,sition and appointments made after examination 
shall be for an irrlefinite tenn with rEm'.)Val only for cause. 

4 



• • c' ,,./, 
. ( \, 

, 

N. Section 82.103 is mnellded to read: 

It shall.be the duty of the Fire Marshal to inspect a reasonable 
nunber of liquefied petroleun gas installations to deteilll.ine if cxropliance 
is beir)3 made with the provisions of ORS 480.450(2), (3) and (5). 

o. Section 82.104 is amerrled to read: 

All liquefied petrole\.lU gas equipnent inclooin:J such equipuent 
installed at utility gas plants, shall be installed in aC"O:>rdance with 
the provisions of ORS 480.410l2). 

Whenever the Fire Orl.ef, Fi.re Marshal, or their aut:h::>rized represent­
atives shall d.isaa,rove a construction or alteration pl.an, or deny a 
permit applied tor under this ordinance, or W1er1 it is claimed that 
the provisions of these regulations do oot. appl.y, or that the true 
intent and meanin3 of these regulations have been misconstrued or 
wro03ly interpreted, the aggrieved person may cq:peal the decision of 
the Fire Oli.ef or Fi.re Marshal or their auth::>rized representatives to 
the Iba.rd of AJ;:peals of the fire protection .district, in care of the 
district offices. Said written ootice shall be filed within thirty 
l30) days of the date of the decision by the Fire Qlief, Fire Marshal, 
or their auth:)rized representatives. 

In order to detennine the suitability of al.temate neti¥:xis, materials, 
~ types of ccnstnx:tion, am to provide for a reasonable 
interpretation of the provisions of these regulations, there shall be 
and is hereby created a Iba.rd of A{:peals consisting of five mEmbers 
and five alternate members appointed by the Board of Directors, who 
are qualified by experience and trainin:J to pass tJEX)tl pertinent 
matters. 'lbe Fire Marshal shall designate, fran time to tirne as 
necessary, a person to act as Secretax:y to the Board t'or the purpose 
of recording minutes of a~s hearings am such other clerical 
functions as may be necessary to keep accurate records of all 
proceed.irX]s ~ before the lbards, and shall se:rve as ex-officio 
member of the Ibard without vot.iO:J privileges. 'lhe Iba.rd shall 
oonsist of five members \\i1o are qualified D'I experience arrl training 
to rerx'.ler decisions oo fire ani life safety matters. 

Tne manbers of the Board of AR:>eals shall be appointed by the Poard of 
Directors ror three year tenns tilled oo a rotating basis. No member 
or al terna.te menber shall hear ar:peals or rerder a decision on an 
appeal on any matter in Wlich he or she may have a personal or 
pecuniary interest. The Board of Afpeals shall establish rules tor 
the cooouct of its meetings ani ootice thereof. 

SEX:TIOO IX NEW Ml\TERIALS, P~ES CR OXlJP~ WEUOI Mi\Y RFOJIRE 
~ 

Tne OU.ef am the Fire twarshal shall act as a cx:mnittee to deternune 
and specify, after givin;J affected persons an q,portunity to be heard, 
any new materials, processes or occupancies ~r which penru..ts are 
required in addition to th:>se OCM enunerated in said Oxle. 'lhe OU.ef 
of the Bureau of Fire Prevention shall p:,st such list in a conspictX:>us 
place in his office am distribute copies thereof to interested 
persons. 

7 

.. 



. . .. .. 

Fire Hydrants: Fire hydrants shall be located so that 
oo part of a cx:mnercial building is nore than 250 feet fran a fire 
hydrant ( exception i ~ approved by the arl.ef this distance may be 
exten::ied to a maxi.mun of 500 feet as measured al003 a route accessible 
to vehicles, Mien the buil~ is equipped with an <1R?roved fire 
protection system) • Fire hydrants shall be placed at intersections 
unless auth::>rized by the Ou.ef. Where required single family residen­
tial buildin3s may oot be nore than 500 feet fran a fire hydrant as 
measured al003 a route accessible to vehicles. For the p.irpose of this 
sub-section, a "cxmnercial building" means a buil~ used for other 
than R-3 or M o:cupancy. Fire hydrants on private water mains that are 
serving autanatic sprinkler systems ard are pressurized by a fire 
department camection shall oot be a::nsidered to contribute to the 
above requirements unless specifically approved by the Ori.ef. 

All systems or ai:pliances required to be installed uooer Section 
10. 301 as amended shall be installed by the developer am. shall be 
approved by ard meet the specifications ard requirements of the Orie£ 
as to location, size afr:1 type of materials an1 manner of installation. 

H. Section 10.301 is amended by adding a ne-« paragrai:h (f}: 

( f) Fire Department Connections. When structures are protected 
with an autanatic sprinkler system, the location of the fire 
department c;xxmection shall be <lR?roved by the Ou.ef arrl be within 
seventy (70) feet of a staooard fire-hydrant assembly. It shall 

· oot be attached to the structure protected unless otherwise awroved 
by the Chief. 

I. Section 25.118(b)4. is amended to read: 

4. When in the opinion of the Chief adequate safe.:Juards have been 
taken, flame lighted ham-held carrlle may be pennitted. Harrl-held 
can:lles shall oot be passed fran one perscn to arx:>ther when lightErl. 

J. Section 45.702 is amended to read: 

All spraying operations involving the use of organic peroxides 
and other dual-canp::,nent coatings shall be corx:iucted in awroved roans 
provided with autonatic fire protection ...tu.ch shall include but shall 
rot be limited to autanatic sprinkler systems, autanatic dry chemical 
systems, autanatic carbon dioxide floc::rling systems, autrn,atic halon 
extinguishing systems, am. autanatic foam extinguishing systems. In 
addition, an approved means for pranpt notification of fire to th::>se 
within the plant an:i the fire department shall be provided. 

K. Article 78 is arrerxied by adding a ne-« sub-section 78 .107 : 

78.107 Where there is a ccnflict between this Article arrl 
OFS 480.110 throU:Jh 480.122 the ORS shall prevail. 

L. Section 81.107 ( a) is amended as follc:,.,.,s: 

'!be Exceptioo to 81.107(a) is deleted. 

M. Section 82.102 is arnerxled as to read: 

For a pennit to install or maintain an LP-gas container or 
operate LP-gas tank vehicles see ORS 480.450(1). 

6 



• I ( 

In order to assist in defraying expenses in examination of construc-
tion plans ~ subsequent en-site inspection of actual construction, -~n~ ('. /l 
a fee shall be p:i.id at the time the awiication for a bt:13:.l.ai.R3 pel"'l'Mlt., Y\, l t tuCh.Dl-. 
is filed with the 03\mt.y I?tti:ldiug BepalE t:. • .&nt. or Ute Dtl:i.ldifl'!J De~t.- <;~ .fl ?«) 
R'l8fte: 0£ arl'.t' mwa.i-8:i.paJit;v withiH the jtm'1Elieti'-A gf t:hQ canmistrict. · 
'Ibis fee shall be 40 percent of the bui.ldin; pennit fee, pursuant 
to ORS 456. 760, ..AQ e..11 ucnies o;;,J J ectw tnla Uti.e eeeaGn by a 
Co•m¥ Bt.alding f)epa:r bueut ori auy Bl::l:i..lding ElepH b1~t ~ a mqQici:--­
palit.y;..i.Ji.larin:::tihe jt11=iedicttlon of the E>.iet:rid? .!halJ Liii faid---to ~ 
Disa::igt, CA O£ beiG£"-e :the ~Ur ctiy of Ute itot,Ut £ol:l:ow-i11g the-:IOC?Qth 
.m • hicl:l the menies. ace col:leet.ed :se:oc --f!br a~is eKpeose1o ifie~oo l.n 
the aoJ J ecUoa:.: tl=lera:;f e.:r tla. Oe\:lAt:y · Buil~tng rx::patA 11ent:.. or ~ 
Bt.Jj Jd~ ~tmer-tt of any ,municipal i:ty 'ed.thiR tj:\e; jm::isdiet.ioR of ., 
~ 

All fonner ordinances or parts thereof conflicting or inconsistent 
with the provisions of this ordinance or of the Code or Starrlards 
hereby adopted are hereby repealed ----------------
sa:::TICN XIII VALIDITY 

The City/District hereby declares that should any section, paragrafh, · 
sentence or 'i.Ord of this ordinance or of the Ccrle or Standards hereby 
adopted be declared for any reason to be invalid, it is the intent of 
the City/District that it "WOuld have passed all other p::>rtions of this 
ordinance in::leperxlent of the elimination herefron of any such p::,rtion 
as may be declared invalid. 

'llus ordinance shall take effect and be in force fran and after its 
approval as required by law. 

r:w, 'IHEREFORE, an emergency is hereby declared to exist and this 
Ordinance shall be in full force and ef feet inmediately up::,n its 
passage by the Board of Directors, approval of the.President. 

PASSED by the District this ,.,.? l",1/.. day of 

APPRJVED by the City/County this 

TUALATIN RURAL FIRE PROTECTION 
DISTRICT 

FIRE DISfRICT 

CITY or CXXJNI'Y MAYOR/ AIMINISTRA'IDR 

9 



/ 

:::::-1:<-,: :;w::::x ::z w 

Any person ~ shall violate any of the provisions of these 
regulations hereby adopted or fail to cx::mply there«ith, or shall 
violate or fail to canply With any order made thereun:ier, or wh::> shall 
build in violation of any detailed statement, specification or plans 
sutrnitted and ~ed hereunder and fran \..hi.ch no appeal has been 
taken, or.~ shall fail to caaply with such an order as affirmed or 

.m:xlified by the Board of AJ_:peals or by a court of cx::mpetent 
jurisdictioo Within the time affixed herein, shall severally, for each·. 
and every such violation and non-canpliance respectively, be guilty of 
a misdemeanor as provided in ORS 478.930 punishable upon conviction as 
prescribed by ORS 478.990. 

The corp::,ration counsel, the Fire Oti.ef, or any Fire M:lrshal or his 
designated representative may bring a oc:mplaint in law or inequity 
to alleviate a violation of this ordinance as ~11 as in addition to 
the rights to enforce said ordinance urrler the provisions of ORS 
478.930 arrl ORS 478.990. 

Penalties shall .te as so provided by oregon Revised Statutes, O::>unty 
Ordinances, or city Ordinance. 

Any building lexclusive of one and t:wo family dv.ellings, fann barns, 
and outbuildings); flamnable liquid storage utilization, trans­
p::>rtation or dispensing facilities; and facility for the storage, 
handling, trans{X)rt arx1 use of explosive and blasting agents; 
dry-cleaning plants; facilities for the storage, han:lling, use an::l 
transportation of liquefied petroleun gases; or any other building, 
structure or facility ~erein highly canbustible or hazardous 
materials are manufactured, utilized, dispensed, conveyed or stored;·· 
the plans and specifications therefor shall be subnitted to the Fire 
Marshal of the district or·· his auth::>rized representative for 
examination am approval with respect to confonnance with these 
regUlations and ro construction shall proceed prior to such aR)roval. 
When the Fire Marshal or his auth::>rized representative approves any 
such plan, he shall so signify by means of a stamp arrl signature. All 
construction or alteration shall thereafter canply with the approved 
plan, in all respects, unless m:x:lified by sUbsequent written pennit or 
order of the Fire Marshal. Plans and specifications shall be drawn to 
scale up:>n substantial paper or cloth am shall be of sufficient 
clarity an::l detail to pennit the Fire Marshal to detennine the 
question of contormity with these regulations arrl shall incllrle a plot 
plan showing type, location of the proposed buildings, structures, 
facilities arrl fire hydrant locations arrl access ways, in relationship 
to the property lines, and all other buildings, structures aoo. 
facilities proposed or existing CXl the premises. Afproval of plans 
shall rot be construed as to be a permit to violate any applicable 
law or regulation of the State, County, or fire district. 

8 



. ;.:, .. 
.:-.:: .. 1.; .. • .. 

:.··. 

478.760 PROTECTION FROM FIRE 

· .«78.7-40 [Amended t,y, "1969 c.667 HS; rei-Jed by' lums, hospitals, ctiurcfies; echools, halls, the-
197_l·c.727 G203J ~,~.:~". ·' .. :'Fl':J:.,j.·~·--¥~· . ·· : · ··: ."'·: .' · aters ·:amphithea. ters all bull~'-...;. , ..,..,....... ·. ,·, , ~ . , .... , ............. \.~'"'"·-···· ~ .. '\: . . , .. ~, . ,.. . . ,. , . ~o,, ..,-.......,.t'.., 

.. : . .C7&71SO ~~ b);:1~-~a.l~ :'.u:. i969 c.667 1•9; ; ptj!.~~:-:~d~~~.-. w~ch are_ occup!~· Jor 
. repealed by 1971 c. 727. ·~pr·.~m"'-" ·li_~:;:•· • '. '.; ' ''.i\~;., -;: · · · sl~in.g ~ and all other puwes where ' 

_.. : . ·· , .. ~ :}~:::~:~~Jt;~;-_-;-··:~~-~ ~~-~ ;_.,: ·. :~'.';·::··.\_!_'~ ~ ·=j~==t·=tr~=-~~ 
CONSOLIDATEDDISTRICI'S·,· .. , .· : .... : ... :,. .. .. .. . .· ''.J· :- ,: . · 

. . .. ; . . . . . . . . (7) Requiring the fasuance oC: permits by 
478.7~ . Tax.levy 0~ COWJ?li~ted. dis- the f°lre chief. of 'the district before burning 

trict. A district f onned by consolidation of two · trash or · · aste ·· · · te ·a1 · .. · · · - • ... 
distrl . th r· iscal f 1 w ma n s. or more eta, m .. e. irst_f year o - ' · . 

lowing the consolidation, shall not levy upon (8) Providing for the inspection of prem-
property in the consolidated district a tax ises by officers designated by the board of 
greater than the a.mount, plus six percent directors, and requiring the removal of fire 
thereof, of the 6Ulll of the taxes levied by the hazards found· on ·premises at such inspec­
consolidating districts in any one of the last tions. (Amended by 1969 c.667 G55; 1977 c.292 m 
three years in which a tax was levied. This 
section does not prohibit a consolidated dis- 478.924 Approval of code by city or 
trict from levying a tax in excess of constitu- county. required. The provisions of a fire 
tional limitation when such excess levy is prevention code adopted by a district after 
authorized by a vote of the people· of the con- ." ~ 4, 1977,. shall not apply within any 
solidated di.strict in the manner prescribed by city or county within the district unless the 
law. [1965 c:.316 §3; 1969 c:.667 §50] · governing body of the city or county approves 

<478.810 [Amended by 1969 c:.667 §51; repealed by • the fire code by resolution. (1977 c:.292 §5] ~ 
1971 c. 727 G203J 478.927 Building permit review for 

'478.820 [Amended by 1969 c:.667 §52; repealed by fire prevention code. A district adopting a 
1971c:.7Z712031 . fire prevention code shall provide plan review 

'478.830 [Amended by 1969 c.667 §53; repealed by · at the agency of the city or county responsible 
1971 c:.7Z7 §2031 for the issuance of building permits for the 

FIRE PREVENI'ION CODE; 
FIRE PERMITS 

478.910 Adoption of fire prevention 
code. A . district board may, in accordance 
with ORS 198.510 to 198.600, adopt a fire 
prevention code. [Amended by 1969 c:.667 §5-C; 1971 
c:.268119) 

478.920 Scope of fire prevention code. 
The fire prevention code may provide reason­
able regulations relating to: 

(l} Prevention and suppression of fires. 
(2) Mobile fire apparatus means of ap­

proach to buildings and structures. 
(3) Providing fire-fighting water supplies 

and fire detection and suppression apparatus 
adequate for the protection of buildings and 
structures. 

(4) Storage and use of combustibles and 
exploai ves. 

(5) Construction, maintenance and regula­
tion of fire escapee. 

(6) Means and adequacy of exit in case of 
fires and the regulation and maintenance of 
fire and life safety features in factories, asy-

orderly administration of that portion of the 
fire prevention code that requires approval 
prior to the issuance of building permits. [1977 

c:.292 §.CJ 

478.930 Violation of code, failure to 
remove hazards, burning waste without 
permit pro~ibited. When a district hnB 
adopted a fire prevention code as provided in 
ORS 478.910:. 

(1) No person shall violate the provisions 
of the code or fail to remove hazards found on 
inspection within the time set by the inspect­
ing officer, after written notice to either the 
owner or occupant of the premises. 

(2) No person shall burn waste materials 
or trash in an unguarded manner without a 
permit, when a permit is required by the 
district code or this chapter. (Amended by 1969 

c:.667 §56) 

478.940 Copies of code to be filed 
with State Fire Marshal and posted at fire 
stations. Copies of the fire prevention code 
shall be filed with the State Fire Marshal's 
office and a copy shall be posted at each fire 
station within the district. 

182 

' . . 

( 

( 


