The Balles

e Yacify,

Annnal Budget
1985 - 1986

“A government is an instrument of service only insofar as it is based upon
the will and consent of the people. . ..”



CITY OF THE DALLES, OREGON

ANNUAL, BUDGET

FISCAL: YEAR 1985-86

BUDGET COMMITIEE

Bill Ward Dan Williams
Jerry Christensen Dennis Rogers
Sue Woods Peggy Fadness
Dewanda Clark Dave Lutgens
Merritt Probstfield Terry Cochran

Mayor John Mabrey
City Manager Del Cesar

"The legitimate object of government is
to do for a community of people
whatever they need to have done,

but can't do it all

or cannot do so well for themselves ..."



CITY CF THE DALIES, OREGON

Annual Budget
Fiscal Year 1985-86

TABLE OF CONTENTS

Pages

Budget Message 4 @ ©® © e @ & & @ ® ® @& @ e ® ° ®© ® @ © @ ® & °© © e @ e 1“4
Recapitulation « s o o @ 4 4 5 & 5 6 & 5 8% 6 8 b & = » ® » = o =

GENERAL FUND -~ (Code 40-49)

Res ources = ©® & @ ® © ® 6 @ ® e ®© @ © © @ @ ® @& ® & 8 ° ®B @ © e @ 6_10
Expenditures:

Administration - (40)

Smry L & L ) L * - L] > - L L - L L L L L a2 L] L L - K ll
Personnel SUMMAYY « ¢ o o « o o s s o « o o« s o « o o @ 12
E}(pendit‘.]reg ¢ @ e ® @ e © © ® ® © © ® ® e e e e ® & @®@ w© 13_14

Finance & General - (41)

COMmMENtaryY » « = e o a © o 5 s 8 « s« s s« s o o s o s o » 15

SUMMATY o i« o o o o 8 s o # o s & 9 o & 6 & & & & & & & 16
Personnel SWiMAYY o o o o o o o o s s o o o o « « o o o 17

BXperklitures . o o o & & 6 o & o o o 5 8 4 & » o o » « « 18=23
Account Description o« « o o o« o o o ¢ o o o o « s o« s = 24

Planning/Building -~ (42)

COMMENTAYY o o o o o s s 5 o s a s s o o o = o s o s o « 25
SUNMMAYY o o o o o o o s s o a o a o o o o o o o o u & = 26
Personnel SBUMIEIY .+ « = « o w0 = 5 o @ ® w5 oW & w @ s 27
EXpenditules . o « o ¢ s s v 6 v s s s ¢ 6 &« # 5 5 & & » 28=30

Iegal & Judiciary - (43)

COMMENLATY « ¢ ¢ o o ¢ o = s o s s o« s o s s o 2 « =« o o 31
SUTMALY o « o o o o 5 o & & 6 & & & & & & s s & & & & 32
Persone]l SUNKMAYY o« « « s o o & & s = & & 5 § o 6 5 & & 33

BRpenditures o o o o o 4 o 6 & & 4 6. 5 5 5 6 8 b b e - 34-35
Account Description . ¢« o ¢ o ¢ ¢ o o o o ¢ o s o o o = 37

Police - (44)

COMMENtary « s« o w o 5 % % & & & 6 § 9 & 5 4 & 8. 5 & & » 38
SUMMALY =« o o s o o o o s o o s 2 o o o s s s o o o = 39
PErsSonnel SUIMALY .« o o o » s o & o o o o & & 5 & & & & 40

EXpenditUI'eS e o ® e © @ ® @& ® ®8 ® & ® ®© @ © ® & @ © © ° 41_4 3
Account Description & o o o o o @ o ¢ o o o o a o a o = 44



GENERAL FUND - (cont'qd)

Police Meter - (45)

Fire

Sumary . . . . . .
Personnel Summary .
Expenditures . . . .

Department - (46)

Commentary . . . . .
Summary . . . . . .
Personnel Summary .
Expenditures . . . .
Account Description

Ambulance - (47)

Commentary . ., , . .
Summary . . ., . ., .

Personnel Summary .
Expenditures , ., , .

Account Description

Communications - {48)

Commentary . . . . .

Summary . ., . . .
Personnel Summary .

Expenditures . . . .

Librarz - (49)

Resources . . . . .
Commentary . . . . =
Summary . ., . . .
Personnel Summary .
Expenditures . . ., .
Account Description

WATER FUND - (Code: 61-62)

Resourcesg

° @ ® o e e e s u @

Expenditures:

Water Treatment g Supply -

Commentary . . . . .
Summary ., . . . . .
Personnel summary

Expenditures ., ., , .

Account Description

—-i3=

Pages

45
46
47-49

50
51
52
53~56
57

58
59
60
61-63
64

65
66
67

« 68-69

70
71
72
13
74-77
78

79-80

81-82
83
84
85-89
S0



WATER FUND - (cont'd)

Water Distribution - (62)

Commentary « « « o «
SUNmary e« « = = s o«
Personnel Summary .
Expenditures . . « .
Account Description

Bonded Debt Statement . .

SEWAGE TREATMENT FUND - (Code: 63)

Resources . ¢« ¢« o o« o o o & &

Expenditures:

Sanitary Treatment Plant - (63)

Commentary « « « « «
Summary . . v - %
Personnel Summary .
Expenditures . . . »
Account Description

Wastewater Collection - {67)

Commentary . « « « »
Summary . . &
Personnel Summary .
Expenditures . . . .
Account Description

STREET & STORM SEWER - (Code: 64)

Resources . ¢ « o o s« = & o »

Expenditures:

Street & Storm Sewer — (64)

Commentary « « « «
Summary . . i @
Personnel Summary .
Expenditures . . .

Account Description

AIRPORT - (Code: 65)
PeSOUICES & ¢ o o o o o o & s

Expenditures:

e b

e e o 8 5 & & ® =w e & e
@ 5 & @& ® @ a e e e ° e
e e © e ®© s ® e o @
e & o @ e ©° e wu e ©o =
a ¢ © e ® © 2 @ 2 ® @ @ e

¢ @ e & ®B ® s @& ® ®© e © @
e & @ ° e @ ® e & & ©o o
® 8 ¢ @ e @ L] e & a ®
8 o © @ e @ s e ©o ®» ® o @
e 8 @ ® ® e ® e e ® © & ®
e & & ¢ o @® e & ® ©8 @ ® ®
e e e e @ e e ® e o @ @
e 8 ® ® © @ e & » e @ o
“ 2 @ © e @ ® e & ¢ e o
e © ¢ @ w @ L] e o e © @
e e e @ » e e & e e e °
------ © ¢ ® e @
® e ® © e a « 2 e @ B e
@ & e v a » e a a °
® @ e & = @ ® e & @ e ©
e ® a e @ @® s & w 8 @ e =
¢« e e a o e e ® ©® @ e °
e o e & e @ ® & 5 o °
e e e e ® @ © e e & 8 w®

Pages

. 91
. 92
. 93
. 94-98
. 99

. 100

101-102

. 103
. 104
. 105
106~1190

111

. 112
. 113
. 1i4
115-118

119

.120-121

. 122
123
124

. 125-129

., 130

131-132



AIRPORT ~ (cont'd)

Airport - (65)

Commentary « « o o = o » o o o

SUMMATY o o o o = o o

Expenditures « « « o o = o o o

PARKS & RECREATION - (Code: 66)

ROSOUILCES « o o o s« o s & & o @
Expenditures:

Parks & Recreation - (66)

SUMMAYY &« o « o o = o
Expenditures « « = «

-----

------

Pages

’ 133
. 134
135-138

139-140

. 141

. 142-145



March, 1985

BUDGET MESSAGE

Members of the Budget Committee
City of The Dalles
The Dalles, Oregon 97058

ladies & Gentlemen:

Transmitted herewith is the proposed 1985-86 budget for the City of The Dalles.
ORS 294.331 states that the governing body of each municipal corporation shall,
unless otherwise provided by County or City Charter, designate one person to
serve as Budget Officer. The Dalles’ City Charter in Section 24 paragraph (c)
(5) states that the City Manager shall be respornsible for preparing and submit-
ting to the Budget Committee the annual budget estimates and such reports as
that body recuests. It is upon this authorization that your City Manager has
met with each of the City Department Heads to discuss the operation and costs
of their departments for the upcoming fiscal year.

This proposed budget is truly a tentative proposal. It is not a balanced
budget which all public bodies are required to have by State law in that our
anticipated revenues do not meet or exceed our anticipated expenditures. 1In
order to balance the budget, a vote of the citizens for a one year levy will be
required if we are to have sufficient revenues to offer the same services as we
have offered in the past. This proposed budget will require your very careful
consideration so that when you complete your portion of the budget process for
the City of The Dalles, we will have a justifiable amount to submit to the
people for their approval in order to operate for one more vear in the fashion
that the citizens wish from cur level of government.

My sincere thanks are extended to the department heads who have worked so hard
to come up with a budget which, though conservative in operational costs, will
allow each department to give a service to the citizens that you are represen—
ting and that we, as employees, are serving.

The budget process consists of several steps. The first step is for the City
Manager to request the department heads to submit their anticipated expendi-
tures for their operations during the next fiscal year. Step two is for the
City Manager and the Finance Officer to meet and discuss the expected revenues
for the upcoming year. The third step is for the City Manager to meet indivi-
dually with the department heads to go over the budgets to pare them down o
that a balanced budget is presented to you. For the past two years we have
given to you a balanced budget for your consideration, but unfortunately,
because of many things, this is still not a balanced budget even though we have
pared down the departmental budgets. This last step in the process is for the
Budget Committee to review, discuss, modify, approve and finally recommend to
the City Council a balanced operating budget. This step is your responsibility
and we now place in your hands the document with which the City will operate
for the next year, the document with which the City will offer its citizens the
services that have been requested and with which our level of government may be
the most efficient and effective as money will permit.



Budget Message
Page 2

Oregon, I believe, is unique in that Budget Committees for cities in ocur State
are not composed only of Councilmen but rather State law dictates that a like
number of citizens sit with the city Council as equal members of the Budget
Committee. This is done so that citizens, as well as elected officials, will
have an equal say as to how much money will be spent in given departments
throughout the City, thereby protecting the rights of the citizens in deter-
mining how their tax dollars will be used. It is very important that all 10
members of the Budget Committee (5 Councilmen and 5 citizens) understand that
they are on an equal basis and may ask any questions or request any reports
necessary for them to more clearly understand the budgeting process. With this
thought in mind, I hope each of you will understand that no question is toco
simple or ridiculous to be asked. Quite possibly other members of the
Committee might have the same questions in mind and for some reason have not
stepped forward to ask for an answer.

It is with a great deal of sincerity that I submit this proposed budget to you
with the knowledge that we are all working toward the same goal - good, honest
government! Through your efforts, this will be accomplished. My staff and
each of the department heads for the City of The Dalles are at your disposal
and will attend budget meetings to answer your questions. They major portion
of my work is now completed. The most important part of the budget process is
now underway. That process, as stated before, is your study, discussion,
modification and recommendation of the final budget for the operation of the
City of The Dalles for 1985-86.

FINANCIAI, POSITION

Our General Fund financial position as presented to you in this document is not
good, in that it is not a balanced budget as prescribed by law. For the past
two years we have lived within the 6% limitation; unfortunately we could not do
it again this year. At the present time we are $283,687 out of balance. We
have two alternatives to correct this problem: 1) Go to the voters for a one—
year levy in the amount of $329,872, which includes the 14% of uncollectibles,
or 2) cut $283,687 out of the budget. We feel this is a very tight budget, cne
that cannot be cut without serious cutbacks in personnel and programs. This
year's revenue of $2,510,029 compares with last year's revenues of $2,606,834
or $96,805 less this year than we had last year. The expenditure for this vear
are estimated at 2,793,716 or 186,882 more than last year. This budget
represents a 7.17% increase over last years.

So you can see, not only haven't we added anything new into the budget, we have
tried our best to hold back, department by department, to keep from being too
far out of balance. The major revenue cutback is in the beginning balance;
last year we estimated $500,000, this year we estimated $250,000. All the
other funds - the water, sewer, street and airport are balanced. Of those
funds only the street fund will be in difficulty if general revenue sharing is
eliminated as per President Reagan's recommendation. This budget has only five
funds for you to work on this year: 1) the General Fund which has Administra-
tion, Finance & General, Legal & Judiciary, Planning & Building, Communica-
tions, Library, Police, Fire and Ambulance; 2) the Water Fund which has Supply
& Treatment and Distribution; 3) the Sewer Fund which has Treatment Plant and
Collection; 4) Streets; and 5) Airport.



Budget Message
Page 3

This year you will note that this Sewer budget is split into two budgets
similar to the water fund in that we have the treatment plant separate form the
collection system.

PERSONNEL

As mentioned previcusly, we are negotiating with two of our three employee bar-
gaining units. That being the Firefighters union and the Employees Associa-
tion. The Police are currently in the second year of a 2-year contract.
Because of negotiations, I must apologize to yvour for the fact, that the Per-
sonnel Services pages in all departments are missing. We do not know at the
present time how the negotiations will come out and therefore, I am not typing
any of the figures in for the positions. We are still two employees short in
the Police Department, inasmuch as 4 years ago the Budget Committee eliminated
three of the Patrolmen positions in that Department. One of the positions has
been refilled but we feel we are still 2 short. If our levy this year does not
pass, probably 90% of the cuts will be in personnel. We can ill afford to lose
any more people at this time. We have the minimums necessary to operate each
of the departments. For the past few years, we have been, through attrition,
losing employees in different departments. We are to that point now where we
must stop losing, and in some cases possibly gain.

PROSPECTS

If ever the City of The Dalles was facing a bleak future, it certainly is this
year. As you know we have lost cur Martin Marietta Aluminum Plant. Rumors
persist that if the BPA does not lower the rates to the D.S.I.'s that the
Goldendale plant will be closed shortly after the beginning of the fiscal year.
We have lost one of our two Payless Stores, and our unemployment rate in our
area is probably as high as it has ever been. By driving up and down our City
streets you will see many more houses for sale than ever before. It is not
that more people are moving month-to-month, but rather people that have moved
six or nine months ago still have not sold their home. This does not help the
posture of a City in having so many for sale signs out for such a long periog
of time. We will be asking the people to vote on a one-year levy at an esti-
mated $300,000, and yet many of our citizens are looking at the possibility of
being laid off from their employment, or realistically having already been laid
off from their employment, and it is difficult for them to support levies when
in fact they do not have a job to pay their bills. But, by turning down the
levy, only brings about more unemployment in that we will have to probably lay
off anywhere from 12 to 15 of our employees. This is not a very nice picture
to paint for the Budget Committee as we being this year's budget discussions,
but the facts are the facts; there is no fat in this budget; there is no where
to cut except to cut personnel. o

In another part of the budget we are looking at losing our General Revenue
Sharing if President Reagan's plan of eliminating revenue sharing to cities is
carried out by the congress. If in fact we lose this amount of money, then the
street department will be losing approximately $234,500 or about 32.5% of its
total budget. It is absolutely necessary that the Budget Committee recommend
to, and the City Council carry out, another source of funding for the street



Budget Message
Page 4

There is a Somewhat sunny sige to this dreary picture; that being that we have
been meeting now for the past two to three years discussing with Wasco County
and Wasco Rural Fire Protection District the feasibility of having a joint
9-1-1 Communications Center. I believe that by July 1 this will pe a reality.
We do not presently have the final location of the Communications Center, nor
all of the equipment purchased for it; this will Come later. Our latest pro-

pPosal is that the City will lend its facilities to the newly formeq Communi -

that we now receive. It is imperative that each of you on the Budget Commjt-
tee, as well as each and every employee for the City of The Dalles, get out ang
sell our levy for the year 1985-86 and also come up with an alternate source of
funding for our street department if revenue sharing is eliminated,

Del Cesar
City Manager



RECAPITULATION 1985-86

PROPOSED OTHER TAXIES

FUND LXPENDITURES RESCQURCES TO BALANCE
GENERAL FUND

Administration S 126,330

Finance and Ceneral 679,925

Planning and Building 109,201

Legal and Judiciary 123,866

Police 746,434

Fire 517,321

Ambulance 139,028

Communications 136,155

Library 210,228
TOTAL GENERAL FUND $2,788,488 $1,761,044 $1,027,444
WATER FUND

Water Supply and Treatment S 564,132

Water Distribution 704,626
TOTAL WATER FUND 51,260,758 $1,260,758
WASTEWATER TREATMENT AND SANITARY

SIWER

Treatment Plant S 323,857

Sewer Collection System 403,143
TOTAL WASTEWATER PUND S 727,000 S 127,000
STREETD AND STCRM SEWER S 724,000 724,000
AIRPORT 72,000 72,000
BRIDGE REPIACEMENT 60,000 60,000
SENICOR CENTER GRANT 346,500 346,500
IMPROVEMENT 546,000 546,000
DEBT SERVICE 303,790 314,302 260,000
WATER TMPROVEMENTS 1,308,262 1,308,262
CRIME PREVENTION 3,000 3,000
TOTAL, RESERVE FUNDS 967,632 967,632
SLIDE ARFA GRANT 98,000 98,000
FEDERAL REVENUE SHARING FUND 284,000 284,000
L.C.D.C. 6,375 6,375
TOURIST PROMOTION FUND 25,200 25,200
SWIMMING POOL/BATHHOUSE GRANT 96,500 96,500
STATE HISTORIC GRANT 4,000 4,000
DOWNTOWN GRANT 2,275 2,275
GRAND TOTAL ALL FUNDS $9,936,492 $8,646,048 $1,287,444
*******************l_‘f”_‘#**(_t_#i* * % % k k K k A A Kk k k F X * %
1985-86 TAX BASLE $ 972,397
ONLE YEAR LEVY 199,693 Total Taxes to
Balance Budget 51,287,444
Total General Fund 1,172,090
Estimated Taxes not

Exempt Water Bonds and Interest 296,400 to be received 181,046
TOTALS 51,468 .490 $1,468,490

5



REPARED: 30 JULY 1783 DEFT: (01 A5 OF 30 JULY 19495
GENERAL FUND-REVENUE
Flpp: 011
BENERAL FUND

% 4%PROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET#¥* f 00
ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY URRENT LINE
FRIOR=2 PRIOR-1 GUDGET  EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROFOSED  REVISED  ADOFTED
REVENUE
TRYES
a55,207.00  778,541.68  B17,270 0 0040010 TAXES FOR CURRENT YEAR : 027,444 | 1,027,444
995,207,00  778,541.68  €17,%7 0 TOTAL TAYES 855,700 1,027,444 1,827,444
OTHER REVENUE
TN, e e e oo )
[ £70,758.00 )  540,413.74 L 500,000 / 0 0040101 REGINNING BALANCE (20,000 ) 750,000 250,000
e N S _ ‘
e
47,101.00 94,345,13 70,000 0 0040107 BACK TAXES AND INTERESY | 5,000 85,000 85,009
i
£7,344.86 33,443.,69 50,000 D 0040521 INTEREST OR SAVINGS 45,00 45,000 45,000
293.868.24 20,790.50 18,000 0 00413110 COY TV - FRANCHISE TAX ! 19,000 19,000 19,00
00 §50,567.25  450,000 b pOA1111 PUD - FRANCHISE ThH 140,000 140,000 140,000
00 51.612.79 57 006 0 0041112 FACITIC M EBELL-FRANCRISE TAX 55, 500 55 500 55



CRORT # 111

REFARED: 30 JULY 1783

00
00
$3,889.00
9,500.00
5, 500.00

A0

+AE NI DA
ELATIREF T R

24,752,795

A A
.'.‘L;»DT.

s

76,998.29
.00
68,000.00
7,500.00
00

00

00

00
81,447.03
106,775.06
22,708.17

19,660.71

DEFT:

FUND:

01
GENERAL FURD-REVENUE

01t
GENERAL FUND

CITY OF THE DALLES

XAHPRORDSED/REVISED/F INAL EUDGET##¥

CURRERT

BUDGET  EST YR EX

80,352
9,500

EEY

0
0

0
78,000
120,000

24,500

20,000

L1

NE

1TER

DOA111T NP NATURAL GAS-FRANCHISE TAX

DESCRIFTION

0041114 THE DALLES DISPOSAL

D042202 COUNTY FOR L1ERARY

(042203 CITY SHARE OF LIERARY

DO47204 COURTY SHARE OF LIBRARY

0042

40472

0042

(04322

0043

Doad

0043

205

204

207
.
222
224

e
225

REATY O-LIRBRARY

LSCA GRANT-LIBRARY

WREFD FOR 913

{ STATE LIBUGR & AMUSERENT TAX

HOTEL/MOTEL TAX FUND

STATE CIGARETTE TAX

STATE GHARE OF 7 1 1

PROPDSED

90,00
140,500
24,000

30,000

Fab

T

B8 OF 30 JULY 195

REVIGED

62,000
19,500
81,780
2,500
9,500
3,000
24,468
12,000
90,000
140,000
74,000

30,000

A
4

00

ADCFTED

62,000



ERORT ¥ 111 CITY OF THE DALLER FRut

o

=3

EPARED: 0 JULY 1985 DEPT: 003 kS OF 30 JULY 1935
GENERAL FUND-REVENUE

FUND: 01t
BENERAL FUKD

2 EAPROFOSED/REVIGED/FIHAL BUDGETH#* & 00

ACTUAL EXPEND. RISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRiGR-2 FRIGR-1 EUDGET  EST YR EXF 1Tl DESCRIFTION PROPGED REVIGED AOCFTED
Rl 00 25,000 D 0043227 SATF REFUNDS 0 0 0
A0 1,450.00 4,200 0 0043228 STATE SHARE-CRINE ASSISTANCE 3,000 3,000 3,008
L0 00 0 0 0044310 PARKING FERWIT REVENUE 5,000 5,000 I,000
3,064,085 5,844,504 4,000 O 0044311 WISC. FEES AND LICENSES 4,809 4,000 4,600
27,017.12 33,525.15 27,000 0 0044312 BUILDING PERMITS 30,000 30,000 30,000
24.854,22 2%,330.27 14,500 0 044313 PARKING REVERUE 5,000 5,000 5.4450
5,760,468 b, 555,65 4,500 0 0044314 TOWING SER/ZUNATTENDED CARS 5,000 5,000 5,000
74,319.83 48,748.99 75,000 0 0044315 MIBULANCE SERVICES 115,000 115,000 115,000
R 00 5,000 0 0044320 REIMEURSEMENT-COURT AAL FEES 1,509 1,500 1,500
71,668.67 73,8553 75,000 0 0044321 COURT FINES AND FORFEITURES 119,000 119,000 110,005
6,255.91 3,891.19 3,000 0 Q044322 LIBKARY FINES 3,500 3,500 3,500
6.187.54 3,807,465 2,000 0 0044374 HISC. SALES AND SERVITE 2,000 2,000 2,004



REFORT # 11l

PREFARED: 30 JULY 19835

ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY

Fr10R-2

2,540,00

33,500.00

FRIOR-1

.00
00
1,100,00
56,954.85
93,000.00
54,999, 00
36,288,00
25,000,060
2, 430,00
00

00

1,157.00

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEPT: 001

BENERAL FUND-REVERUE
FUHDy 011

GENERAL FUND

RAERROFDSED/REVISED/F INAL BLOGETHx¢
CURRENT LINE
BUDGET  EST YR EXF ITEW  DESCRIPTION

0 0 0044441 ATH OF JULY CELEERATION
15,000 0 0044601 LAND 5ALES
1,200 0 0044730 RENT FROW ART CENTER
85,000 0 0046208 STRTE REVENUE SHARING
40,000 0 0044253 FEDERAL REVENUE SHARING FUNDS
38,299 0 0047712 RECETVED FROM WATER FUND
38,4465 0 GOA7713 RECD FROM WASTE WATER TRTHT.
26,500 0 0047714 REC'D FROM FUBLIC UORKS
2,974 0 0047714 REC'D FROM WATER TREATHEWT
0 O 0047717 REC’D FROM AIRFORT FUMD
17,172 0 0047720 REC'D FROM IMPROVEMENT FUND
3.300 0 0047727 REC’D FROM AGENCIES/TELETYRE

0

15,000
1,209
5,000

49,000

38,300

40,773

26,500
2,800
3,000

17,000

3,300

40,000
58,300

40,773

20,600
17,000

3,300

A 0D

RDI“F Tl"l'\

18 GO0
ldlﬁkh

1,200

65,007

o, g
44,773
26,500

2,500
20,000
17,000

1 41n

per Ruy



{EFARED: 30 JULY 1985

LTUARL rYFEhD HISTORY

FRIOR-

14,742.00
113,838,35
00

FRIOR-

|—--I

WA W Uk MMkl bd

DEPT: 004
GENERAL
FUND: D11
GENERAL FUND

FUND-REVEMIE

RERPROPOSED/REVISED/F THAL DUDGET#3%
CURRENT LINE
BUDGET  EBT YR EXP FTEN

DESCRIFTION

0 0 0047730 REC'D FR CIVIC CENMTER FUND
24,000 0 0047734 KEC'D FROM PROPERTY RENTALS
0 0 0047736 REC FROW STATE QFFICE BLDG
g O DOA7TIS REC'D FROM SEL EHFDRCEMENT
1,789,544 f TOTAL OTHER REVEMUE
2,604 B34 0 TOTAL REVENUE

TOTAL DEFARTHENT

24,000
0
0

FHOLC i)

£S5 OF 36 JULY 17835

AF{)

REVISED ALOPTED
73,22 7223
24,000 24,000
) 0
0 ]
761,044 1,761,044

2,788,488 /2,768,480
A%l 2ac



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1885~-1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Administration

CODF: 040
Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1982-83 1983-84 1984-85 Classification 1985-86
82,603 72,801 106,489 Personnel Services 116,550 —
6,915 6,772 7,680 Supplies & Maintenance £,780
- - 9,000 Capital Outlay 1,000
89,518 79,573 123,169 TOTAL 126,330 -

11

r22 50



CITY OF THE DALILES
ANNUAT, BUDGET

DEPT: Administration

CODE: 040
BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAT, MONTHLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SALARY SATARY * PERSONNFL SERVICES *k SALARY SATARY BODY
1 City Manager 3,355 40,260
1 Administrative Secretary 1,353 16,236
1 Personnel/Purchasing 2190/2281 26,371
TOTAL REGULAR SALARILES 82,867
Part-time & Temporary 500
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 500

PAYROLL, EXPENSES:

Iong Term Disability 936
Social Security 5,842
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 6,927
Industrial Accident 576
Retirement 18,728
Life Insurance 174
TOTAL PAYROLIL EXPENSLES 33,183



SEPAREDY 30 JBLY 1935 DEPT: 040 A5 OF 30 JULY L7395
HDMIMISTRATION
FUND: 11
GENERAL FUMD

FERPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL EUDGET## A 6D
ACTURL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRICR-1 RUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION PROPOGED REVISED ALOFTED
REGUIREHENTS

PERSONSL SERVICES

64, 466.37 33,498,200 77,922 D 0080111 REGULAR SALARIER &, 645 2,847 a2,367
142,74 78.08 a0 G 0060112 PART TIME/TERF/QT SALARIES w00 0 )
21,993,450 19,225.24 28,047 O 004OLTT PAYROLL EXFERSES 30,484 35,183 33,183

82,602,508 72.801.4% 106,489 9 TOTAL FERSONAL SERVICES 12,811 1id,350 114,858

AATERTALS AND SERVICES

2,434,527 1,470,085 2,000 0 ODAZICL OFFICE SUFPLIES 2,000 2,000 2,008
283,25 Sa.79 &30 § 0062351 FFICE EQUIFHENT HATNTENANCE 750 750 g

240,21 fi o {70 0 DDAITTL VEHICLE FRRTS AMD SERVICE 170 190 &t
100,65 71.48 ) 006237 TIRES AHD TIRE REPAIR 179 156G 1

13



FURT # 118

{EFARED: 30 JULY 1985

00

D0

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEFT: 049
ADHINISTRATION
FUND: 01t

BEMERAL FUND

HARPROFDSED/REVISED/FIHAL BUDGET#x%

CURRENT LIRE
FRIOR-1 PUDGET  EST YR 2XF  ITEM  DESCRIPTION
1,042,572 1,800 0 0042405 COMMUMICATICNS
2,282.49 1,700 0 0DA2411 TRAINING & CONFERENCES
484.25 1,000 0 0042412 MEMEERSHIP DUES/SUBSCRIFTIONS
00 0 O Q0A2480 NICROFILHING
i01.45 150 0 0062481 WISCELLANEOUS EXPENSES
b 771,82 7,480 0 TOTAL HATERIALS AMD SERVICES
CaPITAL QUTLAY
L0 1,000 0 D0ATELY PURCHASE HEY OFFICE EQUIFMENT
.40 3,000 0 0045821 PURCHASE NEW CARS & AGRESSCRY
00 7,000 0 TOTAL CAFITAL CUTLAY
79,573.1 123,169 0 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS
79,573.38 123,167 9 TOTAL DEFARTHENT

14

7,080

45 OF 30

1,500
2,500
1,500

0

FRGE 7

JULY 1593

A 40

ADOFTED

10 +30
1,500 T5¢

L R
oyl

iy )

124,335



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Finance & General CODE: 041

FINANCE SOURCE

The revenue to operate this department comes from the various resources of the
General Fund.

PERSONNEL

The personnel for this department consists of the Clerk-Treasurer, Computer
Services Director, and three Account Clerks.

The functions of this department are varied and include maintaining of the
official records of the City (Council minutes, City property records, ordinances,
and resolutions). This department also provides payroll service to the 100+ City
employees. The department does the billing and collecting for the 4,000+ water
and sewer customers. Special assessments are processed through this office. A
part of this department's function is the accounting and budget reporting for the
entire City. Also, the accounting and reports for the various federal and state
grants are provided by this office. The billing and collecting for the ambulance
service is another function of this office.

The non-departmental portion of the Finance and General Department contains the
major expenditure items for the entire City; such as insurance and bonds, street
lights, annual audits, the contingency account, and the City's contribution to
other governmental services. Currently we are in the process of switching our
accounting from a posting machine to our new data processing eguipment and
progranms.

The following figures are from the 1984-85 audit. It gives you an idea of the
activities of the Finance and General Department:

Total City Revenue - all Funds $4,831,857
Total City Expenditures - all Funds 4,809,751

15



CITY OF THE DALLIES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: FPinance & General CODE: 04
Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1682-83 1983-84 1984-85 Classification 1985-86
96,053 126,339 137,882 Personnel Services 141,555
160,266 201,790 197,800 Materials & Services 243,900
- 51,347 35,200 Transfers Qut 35,200
103,904 68,590 56,500 Capital OQOutlay 58,000 _
- - 124,667 Contingencies & Balance 165,770
12,060 15,000 Contract Services 70029 28,000
6,605 6,600 Property Taxes 7,500
360,223 466,731 573,649 TOTAL 679,925
il (//’ ~ ¢ <
—

16



CITY OF THE DALLES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Finance & General
CODE: (41

BUDGET FOR NEXT YLAR: 1985-86

PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAL MONTILLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SALARY SALARY & PERSONNEL SERVICES ** SALARY SALARY BODY

1 City Clerk/Treasurer 2,098 25,176
1 Computer Techician/Finance Supvr 2,281 27,372
2 Account Clerk 1,211 29,064
1 Account Clerk 1,170 14,040
TOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 95,652
Part—-time & Temporary 8,500
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 8,500

PAYROLL EXPENSLES:

Iong Term Disability 1,080
Social Security 6,745
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 13,064
Industrial Accident 297
Retirement 15,927
Life Insurance 290
TOTAL PAYROLL IFXPENSES 37,403

17



ACPARED: 30 JULY 1988

67,248,230

4 NN
J..u'ii

a1

~

51 E0n 3T
112,\_' r_'-32

T20.00

0

£

126,337,720

11,000.00
810.47

00

DEFT: 041

FINANCE & BGEMERAL
FUiD: 011

GEHERAL FUND

FARPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL RUDGET##H

CURRENT LINE
BUDBEY  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION
REQUIREMENTS
FERGONAL SERVICKES
97,032 0 0060111 REGULAR SALARIES
60 9 0040112 PART TIME/TERP/OT BALARIES
40,350 0 0060193 PAYROLL EXPENSES
137,882 0 TOTAL PERSONAL SERYICES
CONTRACTUAL SERVICES
12,000 G 0061701 REGULAR AUDITING
2,000 0 0041203 ACCOUNTING ADVISORY SERVICES
G 0 0081206 COMPUTER FROGRAMS

18

AS OF 30 JULY 1945

ARG
FROFDSED REVISED ADOFTED
94,629 9%, 452 95,452
8,500 8,500 8,500
35,607 37,403 37,403
134,758 141,550 141,555
13,000 13,000 13,000 2=
3,000 3,000 3,000 —
10,000 10,060 40,000
a3 {; i) i —



SFORT # 14 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGE 7

REFARED: 30 JULY (985 DEPFT: 041 AS OF 30 JULY 1945
FINANCE & GENERAL
FUnD: 0l
GERERAL FUND

¥XAFROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL EUDGET#4% & DO
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR=2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YREXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROPOSED  REVISED  ADOPTED
11,383.00 12,060.47 27,400 0 TOTAL CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 28,009 23,000 28,000 = 5%
MATERTALS AND SERVICES
2,407.09 3,331.16 3,000 0 0062241 HOTICES & FUELICATIONS 3,500 3,500 3,500 —
5,102.47 §,445.34 15,000 0 0062301 OFFICE SUPPLIES 10,000 10,000 10,000 —
00 00 0 0 0062303 PERSONNEL PROGRAM COSTS i 0 9
1 ,455.5 831,55 2,000 D 0062311 JANITORIAL SUPFLIES 2,000 2,000 7,000 —
10,198.55 17,194.94 12,000 0 0062357 BLOG & GROUNDS HAINTEMANC 12,000 12,000 12,000
2,862.34 5,938,588 16,000 ¢ 0062361 OFFICE ERUIFNENT MAINTENANCE 11,000 11,000 11,000
8,353.97 16,497.30 9,000 0 0DA2405 COMMUNICATIONS 19,000 19,000 19,000~ 2 ¢
817.91 1,415.50 1,200 0 0062411 TKAINING & COMFERENCES 2,400 7,400 7,400 = 7
3,908.39 §,5%5.,50 4,100 0 0062417 MEMEERSHIP DUES/SURSCRIFTIONS 5,000 5,000 5,000
39,472.1 50,043.40 40,000 0 0DAZAZ1 INSURANCE AND EONDS 75,000 75,000 75,000 +&5

19



REFARED: 30 JULY 1785

ACTUAL EXPEND. HIS
1

FH1OR-2

8,476.79
00

2,794,632

2,475.49
47,82
4,000.00
£.000.00
5,40
5,301.30

1 L
A.,:OJ.!._'

DEPT: 043

FIMANCE & GENERAL

FuND: ol

GUNERAL FUND

SEREROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL GUDGET®R

CURRENT LINE
BUDGET EST ¥R EXF YTE DESCRIFTION
43,000 2 0082422 STREET & TRAFFIC LIGHTING
12,500 0 0062423 UTILITIES
0 O 0062461 L12GTH BIRTHDAY CELEBRATION
12,000 0 0042471 LEGISLATIVE EXPENSES
0 G 0062480 NICROFILMING
4,000 § 0042481 MIGCELLANEOUS EXPENGES
0 0 (042482 CASH LONG DR SHORT
1,560 9 0042491 CITY SHARE - MOSQUITO CONTROL
6,500 0 0042472 CITY SHARE-DALLES MUSEUH COMM
1,060 0 Q042493 CITY SHARE - Enp EOUTATION
&, 000 O 0062475 CITY SHARE-LOC COUNCIL OF GOV
3,000 0 0042494 LGPT SERVICES
" Uit T ¢ F ’

45 OF 30 QLY 198%

& 00
PROPOSED  REVISED  ADOPTED
45,000 45,200 45,000 —
12,500 12,500 2,500 - 35
b p 0
14,000 14,000 14,000 ~*7
5 0 9 Al
5,000 5,000 5,000 ~ 2°
B ) f
1,500 1,590 1,500 —
4,500 4,500 508 &
1,000 1,000 1,000 —
5 500 5,500 5,500 -
5,000 5,000 5,000
- HESs



‘REFRRED: 30 JULY 1983

ACTURL EXFEND. HISTGRY

FRI0R~2

157,321,415

CURRENT

PRIOR-1 BUDGET
%, 000,00 5,000
A0 4
201,790,390 197,800
0 0
00 0
:]Q 0
00 0

DEFT:

041

FINANCE & GENERAL

FUND:

0l

GENERAL FUND

KERPROPOSED REVIGED/FINAL BUDBET##3

EST YR EXF

g

b ]

LINE
ITEM  DESCRIFTION

0042497 CITY SHARE-DOWNTOMN DEVELGR

2042470 ECONCKIC DEVELOFMENT

TOVAL HATERIALS AND SERVICES

DEET SERVICE

0063517 FRIN REVENUE SONDS/STATE OFF

0043522

INT-5TATE CFFICE BLDG REVENUE

Q06361% TRUSTEE FEE STAHTE OFFICE HLDG

T0TAL DEBT SERVICE

21

FROFDSED

243,70

AS OF 30 JULY 1943

REVISED

L)

A Do

I

AREFTED



TRORT 4 111 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGE 12

RERARED: 30 JULY 1995 DEFT: Q41 45 OF 30 JULY 1953
FINANCE & GENERAL
FUND: 011
GENERAL FUMD
FHAPROPOSED/REVISED /F IHAL BUDGETHH% A 00
ACTUAL EXPERD. HISTORY CURRENT L IHE
FR10R~2 PRIOR-L BUDGET  EST YR EXP 1TEM  DESCRIFTION PROFOSED REVISED ADOFTED

TRANSFERS OUT

.00 .00 0 0 0044710 LOAN FROM GF TO AIRFORT FUND 0 0 9
L0 11,500.00 0 0 Q044715 TRANSFER TO AIRPORT FUND D 0 0
.00 21,970.00 0 0 0044717 TRAMSFER TO ENEKGY DEPT. 0 0 9
00 10,000.00 10,000 D 0044730 TRAN TO UNEKFLOYMENT INS RES 10,000 10,000 10,000 —
7,478,67 7,876.85 25,200 0 0044731 TRAN TO TOURIST FROMOTION 25,200 25,200 2570
b R
7,428.67  51,346.85 35,200 0 TOTAL TRANSFERS OUT 5,200 35,200 35,200
CAPITAL DUTLAY
11,700.00 21,428.12 2,500 0 005301 PURCHASE LAND/ELDG/EASEHENTS 10,000 10,000 10,600 = &
14,301.62  45,523.51 30,000 0 005303 IMFROV TO BLDG OR ADDITIONS 30,000 30,000 30,000 7 1%
69,505 .64 1,117.34 18,000 0 0065811 PURCHASE NEW OFFICE EQUIFHENT 13,000 18,000 18,000-3"
00 121,24 b 0 0065815 ITY ORDINANCE BOOKS 0 9 4%

22



SEFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPERD. M1

FRI0R-2

4%7,548.57

DEFT: 04l

FINANCE & GENERAL
FUND: 011

GENERAL FUND

RAXPROPOGED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET##¥

STORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-1 EUDGET ~ EST YR EXP  YTEM  DESCRIPTION
00 0 0 0083827 CROW CREEK WATER STUDY
68,570,214 56,500 o TOTAL CAPITAL OUTLAY
CONT [HBENCIES
O 35,767 O 0084900 DPERATING CONTINGENCIES
00 0 0 0046911 MALL EXPENSE
00 75,000 0 0064951 UNAPFROFRIATED BALANCE
D0 110,787 0 TOTAL CONTINGENCIES
TAYATION
6,404.38 4,400 0 0087942 FROPERTY TAYES-WAREHOUSE FROF
4,404.38 b, 600 0 TOTAL TAXATION
466,731,481 572,14% 0 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS
468,731.41 572,149 b TOTAL DEFARTHEHT

FROPOSED

b

40,000

155,000

#5 OF 30 JULY 1965

470 anc
B77,740

94,770
3

75,000

;;;;;;

479,925



DEPT:

CODE,

CITY OF THE DATIES
Annual Budget

1585-1986

ACCOUNT

Finance g General

ITEM

61203

62411

62471

62496

65801

65803

DE s ¢

RIPTION
CODE: 041

EXPI.ANATION

Accounting Advisory Services

Training and Conferences

Legislative Expense

LGPI Services

Land Acquisition g Improvements

Building ang Additions

24

To assist in setting up the new
Programs on the new computer,

Increase to pay for training of office
bersonnel on the new computer
pPrograms.

Training & Conferences for Mayor and
Council members, commission meetings.

Cost of hiring a negotiator for the
City to meet with the 3 employee's
unicn Iepresentatives.

Purchase of Property as per City
Council directive or to pay
assessments on City owned pProperty.

Repairs to City Hall, State Cffice

Building, or Warehouse buildings., New
City Hall, remodel
Council Cahnbers, new front doors City



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
19851986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Planning/Building CODE: 042

FINANCE SOURCE

The Planning/Building Department's operating budget is derived from the General
Fund.

SERVICES

The Planning Director has the responsibility to administer the City's land use
and development regulations. The Department is also responsible for
Comprehensive Plan implementation and updating, community development, and
disseminating information to the general public. The Department processes
applications for variances, rezones, land partitions, site plans, conditional use
permits, annexation requests, and referrals from Wasco County (pursuant to Urban
Area Joint Management Agreement). Community development activities include work
with area economic development organizations, historic preservation (including
staff support to Historic Landmarks Commission), downtown development work, and
+he senior center project.

The function of the Building Department is primarily the enforcement of those
codes and ordinances relating to the construction of buildings and other
structures. The Building Official enforces all of these adopted codes for the
purpose of protecting the public from substandard construction through the
enforcement of the Uniform Building Code, Uniform Plumbing Code, Uniform
Mechanical Code, and assures that all building permit applications are provided
an adequate level of inspection and plan review service for fees paid. In
addition to the building function, the Building Official serves as staff,
enforces the Dangerous Building Ordinance, Sign Code, Mobile Home Placements,
Mobile Home Electric and Plumbing Hookups and issues all permits for the above.
The Building Official has also started a maintenance program for City buildings
such as the City Hall, State Office Building and the Library.

PERSONNEL

Permanent staff menbers: 1) Plamning Dirvector; 2) Building Official; 3) Planning
Secretary.

HIGHLIGHTS

Planning Department priority will be given to code enforcement, maintaining
conformity with Oregon legislative and case Jaw, and services to community groups
and the general public.

Building Department priority will be given to further develop and streamline our
permit system, to provide amendmesils and update our Sign Code and to develop a
Fuilding Maintenance program for all City Buildings and to keep adequate records
s0 an on-going maintenance program can be implemented.



DEPT: Planning/Buillding

CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

SUMMARY

~ODE: Q42

Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1982-83 1983-84 1984-85 Classification 1985-86
68,379 89,281 96,440 Personnel Services 100,301
5,740 6,318 8,800 Supplies & Maintenance 8,450
5,180 100 400 Capital Outlay 200
50 250 Contractual Services 250
79,299 95,749 105,890 TOTAL 109,201

26

4237
- Eb‘"’c?{_)
— {'C ad

»1¢



CITY OF THE DALLES
ANNUAT, BUDGET

DEPT: Planning/Building

CODE: 042
BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1884-85
PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAT, MONTHILY ANNUAL COVERNING
SALARY SALARY * PERSONNEL: SERVICES * % SALARY SALARY BODY
1 City Planner 2,368 28,416
1 Building Official 2,281 27:372
1 Secretary 1,211 14,532
TOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 70,320
Part-time & Temporary 100
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 100

PAYROLL EXPENSES:

Iong Term Disability 794
Social Security 4,958
Health, Visicn & Dental Ins. 7,578
Industrial Accident 485
Retirement 15,892
Life Insurance 174
TOTAL PAYROILIL, EXPENSES 29,881



“HIT UF THE DALLES FAGE 14

REFARED: 30 Juvy 1985 DEPT: p42 A5 OF 30 JuLy 1985
PLQNHING/HUILDING
FUND: 01y
GENERAL FUMD

H*F'RDF‘DSED/REUISED/F]NAL RUDGET A 00

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENY IHE

FRIGR-2 FRIOR-{ EUDGET 57 v EXF o 17ey DESCRIFT 10N FROPOSED REVISED ROOFTED
REQUIREHENTS

FERSOMAL abky g

40,078,023 44,055, 0¢ 83,094 0 0040111 REBLL AR GALARIES 70,584 70,320 70,300

56,490 09 100 G 0060112 pary TIRE/TEMP /07 SALARTES 100 104 159
18,244,732 25,278.03 28,244 0 Godotes FAYROLL EXPENSES 29,859 27,881 29,38
68,378.44 87,281.03 Pé, 440 0 TOTAL PERSONAL SERVICES 160,543 140,304 100,301

CONTRACTUAL SERVICES

09 =0.00 250 0 pos1ain SFECIAL 1rGaL SERVICES 250 ak 230

00 20,09 250 2 TOTAL CONTRACTUAL SERVICES a0 259 a3

s

28



ALFRRED: 30 JULY 1783

318,

~3

s,

bds,

ol

el
o

&b

09

B

04

el
e
i
"

i
~0

800,46

337,03

549,17

205,01

78.22

CURRENT
BUDGET

1,400

1,600

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEPT: 042

PLANNTNG/BUTLDING

FUHD: D11

GENERAL FUND

RAAPROPOSED/REVISED/FIHAL BUDGET#¥#

LINE
ITEW  DESCRIPTION

MATERTALS AND SERVICES

0052241 NOTICES & PUBLICATIONS
0047301 OFFICE SUPPLIES

0042331 SPECIAL DEPT. SUPPLIES
0062341 OFFICE EQUIPNENT MATWTENANCE
0042371 VEHICLE PARTS AND SERVICE
0042372 TIRES AMD TIRE REPAIR

0062373 GAS, OIL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS
0042405 COMHUNICATICNS

0042411 TRAINING & CONFERENCES
0042412 MEMBERSHIF DUES/SURSCRIFTIONS

0062480 HICROFILHING

29

£S5

FROPOSED REY

350

1,200
£40
850
350
100

£, 300

1,300

1,800

OF 30

15ED

350
1,200

600

FAGE 15

JULY 1985

fOo

AOOFTED

=)



EFORT # 111

REFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND, HISTORY

FRIOR-2 PRIOR-1
55.32 87.77
5.740.43 6,318.32
185,00 100,00
4,995.00 20
5,180.00 100,00
77,2990 95, 749.35
AT 95,749.35

CITY OF THE DALLES

042
PLANNING/BUILDING
011
GENERAL FUMD

SREPROFOSED/REVISED/F IHAL

LINE

®OEXP ITEW  DESCRIPTION

0 TOTAL WATERIALS AND SERVICE

CAFTTAL DUTLAY

0 0085811 PURCHASE MEW OFFICE EQUIF
O 0065021 PURCHASE NEW CARS & ASSESSORY

G TOTAL CAFITAL DUTLAY

i TETAL REQUIRENENTS

Q TOTAL DEFARTHENT

RS OF 30 JULY 1995

TREY

REYISED ADOFTED

150 100
5,450 3,450

260 209

0 g

200 200
195,200 169,201
169,200 109,204



CODE

ANNUAL BUDGET
1584-1985
ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION

ITEM

DEPT: Planning/Building
CODE: 042
EXPLANATION

212

241

331

361

Special Iegal Services

Notices and Publications

Special Department Supplies

Office Equipment Maintenance

31

Iegal work as may be required in
addition to that provided by the
City Attorney.

Iegal publications for zoning, sub-—
division/partitioning, sign code,
and other land use public hearings.

Printing forms (building permits,
etc.), new building code books,
maps, and reprinting of ordinances.

For Copier, typewriter, and adding
machine.



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Iegal & Judiciary CODE: 043

FINANCE SOURCE

The revenues for operation of this department come from the various resources of
the General Fund.

PERSONNEL

Personnel include: Municipal Judge, Court Clerk, City Attorney and a Legal
Secretary.

SERVICES

The Municipal Judge presides over the Recorder's Court each morning and holds
court on Tuesday evening, plus other special courts as required. The Court Clerk
handles all trial settings and payments of fines. The City Attorney composes all
ordinances, resolutions, contracts, easements, agreements, and other legal
instruments for the City, plus provides continual legal counsel for Mayor, City
Council, City Manager and Department Heads. Special court cases, bond issues,
etc., are an extra service and charge.

32



CITY OF Typ DATIFRS
Annual Budget
1985-198¢

SUMMAR Y

DEPT'; Legal g Judiciary CODE: 043
Actua] Expendi tures Current ) Estimateqg
1982-g3 1983-84 1984:?5 Classification 1985-g¢
74,191 71,188 80,593 Personnel Services 98,866
19,139 22,904 23,800 Contract 12,100
5,274 5,192 8,700 Supplies & Maintenance 8,400
4,850 7,125 5,500 Capital Outlay 4,500

T o
_ 103,454 106,409 118,593 TOTAL 5 123,866 |

33



CITY OF THE DALLES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Iegal & Judicial

CODE: 043
BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PROPCSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAT, MONTHLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SALARY SALARY * PERSONNEL SERVICES *x SALARY SALARY BODY
1/ court Clerk 1211 + 75 15,432
/1 City Attorney 2,550 30,600
// 1 Iegal Secretary 1,208 114,496 ./
! TOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 60,528 ot
% q )
1[ /}} A
‘\ Part—-time & Temporary 17,150
. =atpdy
“‘--.\_\TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 17,150
PAYROLL EXPENSES: _ \/
Long Term Disability 684
Social Security 4,267V
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 5,051&&
Industrial Accident 335
Retirement 10,677 \/
Life Insurance 174 V/
TOTAL PAYROLL EXPENSES 21,188 . 300
[0
\

34



UL G O o B &

REFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY

FRIOR-2

75.00

LU0

.60

FRIOR-1

03,345,53
1,668.02

16,154,097

CURRENT

RUDGET

59,629
1,700

19,264

1,000
3,000
300

1,834

GENERAL FUND

<

(=)

L]

aa T LRIy - o
SPECTAL LIGAL 5F

CITY OF THE DALLES

LEGAL & JuDICIARY

***PRGPDSED/REU;SED/FIHAL CUDGE T

DESCRIFTION

REQUIRENENTS

FERSONAL SERVILES

0080111 REGULAR SALARIES
0 0040112 paRT TIHE/TEME/QT SALARIES

0050195 PRYROLL EXPENSES

TOTAL PERSOMAL SERV)CES

CONTRACTUAL SERVICES

0061205 DATA PROCESSING EXPENSE

0061210 COURT AFPOINTED AAL FEES

0061211 PROTEN £lTY ATTORNEY EXPENSES

35

FAGE 17

A5 OF 30 JLY 1935

REVISED FOOPTED

40,528 40,503
17,15 17,15
21,188 21,189

93,864 98,356

1,500 1,009
5,800 5,800
500 509



I
el

WEU R THE DALLES
EFARED: 20 JULY 19as DEFT. 043

PAGE
LEGAL 4 JUDICIARY
011

A5 Or 1p JiLy 15
FUND:
GENERSL FUNG

ACTUAL EXFEND, H]

*ﬁﬁPRDPDSED/REUISED/FINAL BUDGE T4#% 4 50
STORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR~2 FRIOR-1 BUDBET g1 v ;e TEH DESERIPT O FROPOSED  peyyor, ADOFTEL
14,834,132 14,0000 15,000 00081213 wpygy g SERVICES 0 0 j
543,59 111,49 509 0 004124c CONTRACTUAL SeRurcps 500 500 539
.00 1,450.09 0 P 0081216 CRINE y1ppyy ASSIST Expenses 2,500 2,500 2,500
19,139,13 22,904, 32 23,800 0 TOTAL CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 12,100 12,199 12,160
HATERIALS Anp SERVICES
2,011,472 1,871,94 3,000 0 0052301 perpe SUPELES 2,500 2,500 2,500
575.54 614,51 £,000 0 0062361 oFrype EQUIFNENT MAINTENANCE 1,000 1,000 1,00
83,07 937,74 1,500 0 0043405 COMHUNICAT 10w 1,700 1,700 1,709
921,39 923.51 2,000 00062411 Thamng CONFERENCES 1,700 1,700 1,705
912,50 790,75 1,200 0 0082412 Wewgepgyp OUES/SUBSCRIFT 1 s 1,200 1,200 {20
0 .09 0 9 0062489 HICROF 1L K 1ng 300 300 B
8 70.78 ) 0 004243 NISCELL ANEgs EXPENSES 0 0 0

36



EPORT # 110 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGE 19

REPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: D43 A5 OF 30 JULY (785
LEGAL & JUDICTARY
FUMD: D11
GERERAL FUND
RAXEROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET### £ D0
ACTUAL EXFERD. HIBTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIGR-2 FRIOR-1 RUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTIOM FROPDSED REVISED ADOFTED
3,273.%4 5,171,083 8,700 0 TOTAL MATERIALS AND SERVICES 8,400 4,490 8,400

CAFITAL OUTLAY

.00 00 1,000 O 0045803 IMPROY TG BLDG OR ADDITIONS 1,000 1,000 1,040

2, 262.50 4,840.24 2,000 0 0065811 PURCHASE NEW DFFICE ERUIFHENT 0 0 i

2,588,900 2,285.20 2,300 0 0065814 LEGAL & JUDICLARY ROOKS 3,500 3,500 3yl

4,850.50 7,125.44 Tenh G TOTAL CARFITAL OUTLAY 4,500 4,500 4,500
103,454,22 104 ,40%.21 118,593 0 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS 129,804 123,866 123,886

103,454.20 106,409.21 118,593 ] TOTAL DEPARTHENT 129,804 123,844 123,984

37



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION

DEPT: Iegal & Judiciary CODE: 043
CODE ITEM F¥PLANATION
803 Legal Building & Additions To purchase new carpet for secretary's
and attorney's office.
814 Books Continuation of Oregon Cases and
supplements.

38



CITY OF THE DALLES
Anmual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Police CODE: 044

FINANCE SOURCE

The Police Department budgeted appropriation for personnel services, supplies,
maintenance, and a capital outlay is derived from the General Fund.

SERVICES

The Police Department is responsible for the public safety within the City Limits
of the City of The Dalles. Services provided include the protection of life and
property, the prevention of crime, the detection and apprehension of criminals
and offenders, the enforcement of traffic laws and City ordinances. Other
non-enforcement services include crime prevention, community affairs, and school
programs designed to make citizens aware of how they can assist their police
department, and themselves in making the community more secure from criminal
attack. The Police Department as a twenty-four hour operation provides a
resource to other agencies and service organizations.

PERSONNEL

The organization of the Police Department is as follows: Chief of Police; one
Police Manager II (Deputy Chief); four Police Manager I (Commander); ten Patrol
Officers; one Police Secretary; one Police Clerk; and one Parking Patrol Officer,
for a total complement of nineteen members. The previous separate budget of
Police Meter, Code 45 is abolished and is incorporated in Police Code 44. The
reduction of three regular budgeted Police Patrol Officer positions from the
fiscal budget 1982-83, and the termination of the Selective Enforcement Grant and
its three Police Patrol Officers and one Traffic Clerk severely impacted the
ability of the department to provide adequate response to citizens needs. The
request in this budget for three Police Patrol Officers will restore those lost
in 1582-83 and permit us to be proactive in responding to citizen calls for
assistance.

Continued increases in the demand for law enforcement services in the City of The
Dalles can be expected if the crime trend is upward. The primary goal of the
Police Department will be™to respond effectively to the challenge of change, and
to continue to serve the public in the best professional manner.

39



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985~-1986

SUMMARY

DEPI:  Police CCDE: 044
Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1962-83 1983-84 1984-85 Classification 1985-86
452,866 494,579 558,163 Personnel Services 597,734
75,406 85,900 97,300 Supplies & Maintenance 114,400
45,099 34,498 30,228 Capital Outlay 34,300
573,371 614,977 685,691 TOTAL 746,434

40




CITY OF THE DALIES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DiPT: Police

CODE: 044
BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PRCPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL,  CGOVERNING
SALARY SALARY bl PERSONNEL SERVICES fadid SALARY SALARY BODY
1 Chief 2,637 31,644
1 Manager 11 Deputy Chief

1 Manager II Inspector 2:217 26,604

2 Manager I Commander 2,116 50,784

1 Manager I Commander 1863/2043 23,446

1 Mamager I Comnander 1882/1963 23,070

3 Patrel Officer Corporal 1,851 66,636

1 Patrol Officer 1,749 20,988

1 Patrol Officer 1633/1698 20,246

1 Patrcl Officer 1563/1633 19,316

1 Patrcl Officer 1563/1633 19,176

1 Patrel Officer 1429/1498 17,769

1 Patrol Officer 1498/1563 18,041

1 Patrol Officer 1429/1498 17,562

1 Clerk/Secretary ), 211 14,532

2 DPolice Clerk 1,187 28,488

TOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 398,302

Part—-time & Temporary 15,000

TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 15,000

PAYROLL BEXPINSES:

Tong Term Disability 4,161
Social Security 28,067
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 46,412
Industrial Accident 16,590
Ret 1rement £8,100
Iife Insurance 1,102
TOTAL PAYROLL BEXPENSES 184,432

41



CEET UF fHE DALLES FAGE 20

f

REPARED: 30 JULY 1785 DEPT: 044 4
FOLICE
FUND: 014

GERERAL FUND

(o3
£
e
Lt
o
fass
s
=
—
—

<2
&n

REAFROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET##4
ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY EUFRE‘T LINE
FliOR-2 FRIOR-1 RUBGET  ESTYREXP  17p DESCRIPT N FROFDSE REVISED ADGFTED

I>
=
=3

RLGUTRERENTS

PERSONAL SERVIM:S

315,387,324 344,4629.3 375,104 0 0040111 REGULAR SALARIES 397,038 374,367 378,302

7,988,467 11,6481.88 15,000 0 0060112 PaRY TIME/TENP/OT SALARIES 15,000 15,840 13,609

147,607.48 138,268,19 158,059 0 0080195 FAYROLL EXPENSES 143, 564 184,432 184,432
450,845 474,577,494 Gl 163 0 TOTAL PERSONAL SERVICES 397,590 597,734 997,734

RETERIALS AND SERVICES

i8,135.00 24,150.,00 20,000 0 0062251 CUSTODIAL CARE & KEALS 25,500 28,500 259,504
FALE - 449,71 1,006 0 0042252 CUSTODIAL MEDIC AL EXPENSES 1,009 1,000 1
2,485.47 2,630.34 2,000 0 0082301 OFFICE SUFPLIES 5yu00 3,500 0,50
EREE 2,418,061 3000 0 2052314 TAWING 4,000 4,004 405G

42



REFARED: 30 JULY 1985

wn
"

oA T
VMG

3,105.18
18,480,24
7,168.74
2,39%.00

467,39

5,421

1,87

54,

AL EXPEND, HISTORY
R= FRIGR-1

Al

.3

41

1,033.75

149 £0%
13,507

2,089,

5,001,

g1

19

DEFT: 044
FOLICE

FUMD: 011
GERERAL FUND

RURPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET##
CURRENT LIKE
BUDGET  EST YR EWF ITEM  DESCRIFTION

o000 0 00&ZF3L SPECTAL DEFT. SUPFLIES
700 O 0042352 ELDG & GROUNDS MAINTENANCE
geo G 0052381 QFFICE CQUIFHENT HATMTENANCE
1,500 0 0062364 RADIO REPALR
12,000 0 0042371 VEHICLE PARTS AND SCRVICE
5,000 0 0062372 TIRLS AND TIRE REPAIR
25,000 0 0082373 GAS, OIL, DIESEL, LURRICANTS
7,000 O 0042405 COHRUKICATIONS
3,000 0 Q042411 TRAINING & COMFERENCES
00 G 0062412 HEMEERSHIP DUES/SUBSCRIFTIONS
a,000 0 DOA2A3L CLOTRING -NEW, REPAIR ALLEAN
] O 0DA2ABD MICROFILHING

43

rHoL £

£5 OF 30 JULY 1985

FROFOSED REVISED
6,000 4,000
1,000 1,000
1,700 1,200
2,500 2,500

10,400 10,600
Gy 300 5,500
75,400 ;600
5,000 9,000
5,000 5,000
300G a00
5,200 5,200
9 0

f 0Lh

ADOFTED

4,000

0



ZPORT # 14l

ACTURL EXPE

FRIOR-Z

AT ADL) 0T
4C,098.95

€t ETHY AN
g S0

SETRRED: 30 JULY 1985

wh. RIS
Rl

00

23,705.00

[~ n) A
978,44

414,977.29

CURRERT
BULGET

57,300

1,000
2,500
800
16,000
9,978

O 4 1
D'Dd_.\‘)?;

EAT YR EXF

CITY GF THE DALLES

DEFT: 044
POLICE
FUND: 011

GENERAL FUND

¥AXPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET
LINE

ITEW  DESCRIFTICN

HISCELLANEQUS EXPENSE

45

O 0062484 SPC INVESTIGATIONS

] TOTAL MATERLALS AND SERVICES

CAPITAL DUTLAY
0 0065343 IMFROV T0 BLDG OF ADDITIONS
0 0065811 PURCHASE NEW DEFFICE EQUIFHENT
0 0045012 PURCHASE CFFICE FURN &FIXTURE
0 00838Z1 FURCHASE REW CARS & ASSESSORY
0 0065028 GTHER MACHINERY & EQUIFMENT

0 TOTAL CARITAL QUTLAY
4 TOTAL REAUIREMENTS
) TUTAL DEFARTHENT

b

FROFOSED

114,460

746,290

A5 OF 30

REVISED

1,000

,500

L

800
29,000
3,600

PRGE 2%

JULY 1985



DEPT':

CODE

CITY OF THE DAILES
Annual Budget

ACCOUNT

Police

ITEM

1985-1986

DESCRIPTION

CODE: 044

EXPLANATION

251

252

811

812

828

Food Supplies & Services

Medical Supplies & Services

Office Lguipment

Passenger Vehicles

Other Machinery & Egquipment

$10,500 ~ Cost booking and lodging
City of The Dalles prisoners in the
Wasco County Jail at per diem charge
of $30.,

$1,000 - Cost of medical services for
City of The Dalles prisoners while in
custody at Wasco County Jail.

$4,500 = Purchase 10 MEG hard disk
computer hardware. To provide greater
information storage capability and
enhance law enforcement data system of
the City of The Dalles Police
Department.

$25,000 - Replace two marked police
patrol vehicles.

$3,000 -~ To enhance the weapons
arsenal and provide ongoing training
for officers which will provide the
capability to respond and deal with
tactical situations.

45



D A

REFARED: 30 JULY §98%

ACTUAL EXPEND, HIEBTOR

FRIOR-2

10,743.00

16,085, 14

FRIOR-1

18,167,390

Wwa | Wi LTS = | | S

DEFT: D45
FOLICE METER
FUND: 011
GEMERAL FUN

REAPROFOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET¥R
CURRENT LIHE
BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION

RERUIREMENTS

PERSONAL SERVICLS

17,848 O 0060111 REGULAR BALARIES

00 O 0060112 PART TIME/TEHP/OT GALARIES
6,434 0 0040175 PAYROLL EXPENAES
19,922 D TOTAL PERSONAL SERVICES

HATERTALS AHD SERVICES

7,500 0 0067301 OFFICE SUPPLIES
5 0 0042362 GENERAL EQUIFNENT MAINTENANCE
750 O 0042344 RADID REPAIR
0 8062371 UFRICLE PARTS AMD SCRVICE

PROFOSED

i)

0

REVISED

0

L)

A A
A ul

ADGRTED

9



SPORT & LU CITY OF THE DALLES FRGE 24

RUPARED: B0 JULY 1985 DEFT: 045 A5 OF 30 JULY 1945
POLICE HETER
Fukb: i1
GERERAL FUND

FAXPROPOSED/REVIBED/F INAL BUDGET#A# & 00
ACTUAL EXFEND, HISTORY CURRER LINE
FiibR~2 FRIGR-1 BUDGET  EGT YR EXF VTEM  DESCRIFTION FROFOSED REYISED ADOFTED
00 132,84 it 0 0042373 GRS, OIL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS g ) 0
102,13 241.082 A0 0 0042405 COMHUNICATIONS 0 7 4
144,18 227,05 200 O DD&ZAA1 CLOTHING -NEW, REPAIR SCLEAR 0 0 )
1344 0254 1540 § 0042481 NISTELLANEOUS EXPENSES i 0 G
4.054,08 5,149,574 3,300 i TOTAL MATERIALS AND BERVICES 0 4 )
TRENSFERS DUY

] 5.406.47 & 0 0054731 JOINT USE OF MEW & EGUIPMERT 9 i i
20 9,808, 47 g 0 TOTAL TRANSFERS QUT f 0 3



- OEROERT ¥ 11 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGE 2%

it

REFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 045 AS OF 30 JULY 1hus
POLICE METER

Fumds 011
GENERAL FUND

THPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET R A bb
ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY CURRERT LINHE
Fi10R-2 FRI0E-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROFOSED REWISED ADOFTED

CAFITAL QUTLAY

470,400 b,374.47 12,000 O 00453828 OTHER KACHINERY & EQUIFHENT ] f G

490,00 $,396,49 12,000 { TOTAL CARITAL CUTLAY 0 i i)
22,611,22 35,169,082 36,242 0 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS 0 ] 9
22,618,702 35, 189.82 36,222 0 TOTAL DEFARTHENT 9 0

48



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-19286

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Fire conk: 046

FINANCE SOURCE

The Dalles Fire Department budgeted appropriation for all personnel services,
supplies and maintenance, transfers out, and capital outlay is derived from the
various resources of the General Fund.

SERVICES

The Fire Department is responsible for the public safety within the City Limits
resulting from fires of a hostile nature. Fire suppression services include the
protection of life and property of the citizens. Both Automatic-Aid and Mutual
Aid agreements with near-by fire organizations and other with agencies of the
Mid-Columbia Mutual Aid District assist our firefighting operations. In addition
to the Fire Suppression activities, the Fire Department maintains an active Fire
Prevention Bureau with personnel enforcing fire and life safety codes,
ordinances, inspection and plan reviews. The Fire Department provides a year
round effort in public education and fire safety through scheduled activities at
service groups, schools, institutions, and through the news media. The Fire
Department also provides numerous support functions to insure effective
operations and essential services to the Community.

PERSONNEL

The Fire Department operates with a Fire Chief, Fire Marshal, Training Officer,
three Shift Captains, three Lieutenants, one IEngineer (three Engineers paid
through Ambulance Budget}, two Firefighters and one part—time (50%) Secretary.
These full-time permanent personnel are augmented by approximately fifteen (15)
Velunteer Firefighters. The Fire Department is in dire need to increase this
complement to maintain adequate coverage in serving our community with an
effective response.

49



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Fire CODE: 046

Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1982-83 1983-84 1984-85 Classification 1985-86
342,392 373,544 419,486 Personnel Services 417,721
27,373 27,648 35,770 Supplies & Maintenance 38,850

- 15,000 16,500 Transfers Out 16,500

4,629 78,179 45,150 Capital Outlay 44,250
374,394 494,371 516,906 TOTAL 517:321

50

r

-70&



CITY OF THE DALIES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Fire
CODE: 046
BUDGET FOR NEXT YBEAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SALARY SALARY * PERSCNNEL SERVICES F*k SALARY SALARY BODY

1 Chiet 2,637 31,644

1 Assistant Chief 2052/2143 25,261

1 Fire Marshal 2,319 27,828

3 Captains 2,072 74,592

2 ILieutenants 1,812 43,488

1 Lieutenant 1,830 21,960

1 PFirefighter 1458/1525 17,764

1 Firefighter 1325/1392 16,637

1 Firefighter 1,351 14,861

50% Secretary 573 6,276

TOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 280,311

Part-time & Temporary 15,000

Volunteer Callback 2,000

TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 17,000

PAYROLL EXPENSES:

Long Term Disability 3,097
Social Security 19,320
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 30,312
Industrial Accident 8,412
Retirement 58,573
Life Insurance 69
TOTAL PAYROIL: BEXPENSES 120,410

51



REFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 044 B8 OF 30 JULY 1985
FIRE
FuMps ol
GENERAL FUND

RRAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET#A: LY
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LIKE
FUiOR-2 PRIGR-1 BUDGET  EST YR ExF ITEM  DESCRIFTION FROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED
REQUIRENENTS
PERSONAL SERVICES
$54,377.40 247,259,348 281,404 O 0080111 REGULAR SALARIES 278,823 280,311 280,318
14,242,846 27,761,448 17,000 & 0080112 PART TIHE/TEHR/OT SALARIES 17,000 17,400 17600
71,770,132 ¥8,523.07 120,880 ¢ 00aD170 PAYRDLL EXPENSES 123,462 126,410 120,411
342,352,538 373,041,089 417,464 0 TOTAL PERSCNAL SERVICES 41%, 285 417,741 417,721
MATERIALR AND SERVICES
L Re 1. 058,84 200 O 006230Y OFFICE SUPPLIES 750 750 7o
2,008 .45 3,742,594 3,506 O COAZI3] SRECIAL DEPT, SUPPLIES 4,200 4,700 4, i)
7961 ;100,52 3,000 0 DOSZAZY ELDG & GROUNDS HAINTENANCE 3,150 3,150 3,150
v a4 G GOAIEAL TFVIDE EQUIPNENT MAINTINANCE it 250 78

52



ACTUARL EXFEND. HIBTORY

FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1
716,30 a837.27
161.52 447,93

00 1,191.47

¥ 2515 2,702.93
440,97 193,15
2,332,05 1,750.31
6,455,029 4,998.26
1,738.62 901,67
367.40 353.97
2,217.94 1,285, 03
{,889.50 2,073.58
3,171.81 8,148.54

CURRENT

BUDGET

CITY OF THE DALLES PAGE 27
DEFT: 044 AS OF 30 JULY 1943
FIRE
FUHD: 011

GEHERAL FUND

#¥APROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL EUDGETH¥¥ A 00
LINE
EST YR EXP ITEW  DESCRIPTION PROPOSED  REVISED  ADCCTED
0 0062362 GENERAL EQUIFHENT M&INTEMANCE 1,000 1,000 1,000
0 0042363 SHOP TOOL & SHOP TOOL REPAIR 400 800 630
0 0062364 RADID REFAIR 7,500 2,500 2,500
0 0062371 VEHICLE PARTS AND SERVICE 4,000 4,000 4,090
0 0067372 TIRES AND TIRE REFAIR 1,500 1,50 ,500
0 0062373 GAS, OIL, DIESEL, LUERICANTS 1,000 3,000 3,600
D 0062405 COMMUNICATIONS 5,500 5,500 %500
0 0042411 TRAINING & CONFERENCES 2,500 2,500 2,500
0 0062412 HEMGERSHIP DUES/SURSCRIPTIONS 500 500 500
0 0062415 VOLUNTEER TRAINING/ACTIVITIES 2,900 2,500 2,50%
0 0067473 UTILITIES 2,200 2,200 7,200
0 0062431 CLOTHING -NEG, REFAIR ACLEAN 3,500 3,500 3,500

53



“rurl F 111 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGE 2t

'REFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 044 A5 OF 30 v 1935
FIRE
FUND: iy

GENERAL Fimp

***PRUFDSED#REU]SED/FIN#L CUDGET#4% il
LIKE

ACTUAL EXPEND, HISTORY CURRENT {
FitioR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  gsy YR EXP ITEN DESCRIFT 1M FROPOSED REYIZED AOOFTED
0o D0 il U D0a2480 HICROF 1L M1 g 9 0 0
204,44 430,53 $09 0 0062481 MISCELLANEGUS EXPENSES 400 bl i)
A7 27,643.25 35,770 ] T0TAL HATERTALS AND SERVICES 38,850 38,350 38,059
TRANSFERS nyt
18,540, 00 15,000, 00 15,000 0 0044730 TEAN T0 Finr EBUIP RESERYE 15,000 15,000 19,604
B 00 1,500 0 0044751 JOINT gsE pF HEN & EQUIFNENT 1,500 1,500 1,500
1, 000,00 5,900,00 14, 500 2 TOTAL TRANSFERS put 16,500 L4, 504 L&, 500
CAFITAL cuviay
00 o4, 07 3,500 0 0045803 JUFROY T0 ging Ok ADBITIONS &,560 8,500 by 500
; 1,813, 89 7,006 U 045005 CORETRUCT HEW HYDRAWT BVALUES 8,040 b, 000 &,
188,04 230,00 275 U 004581y PURCHASE npy OFFICE EQUTPHEYT 1,250 1,750 1,250
: Povnaaltn pe CEURN AR LT i

54



LPORT + 111 CITY OF THE DALLES PRGE 29

REFARED: 30 JULY 1925 DEFT: 044 A5 OF 30 JULY 1945
rIRE
FUND: 011
GENERAL FUND

RAXPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET### & 00
AoTUAL EARERD, HISTORY CURRENT LINE

Fr0E-2 FRIOR- BUDGET  EST YR EXF ITEW  DESCRIPTION FROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED
1,2946,10 3,620.25 3,700 0 00DAZBII NEW COMHUMICATIONS EGUIFPMENT 3,700 3,700 3,70
200 00 0 0 0DABEZ0 NEW FIRE EGUIFAASSESSORIES 10,500 10,500 10,500
(0 b3, E87.00 0 G D0DASBIZ3 PURCHASE NEW TRUCK/¥ICHUFS f i 9
.00 329.03 20,000 O 0063828 OTHER NACHINERY & EQUIFMENT 5,500 5,900 iy v
2:01 7,50 9,601.80 7,825 0 0045880 HAJOR REFAIRS & REFLACEMENTS 7,750 7,750 7,750
4,628.71 78,175.17 45,130 o TOTAL CAPTTAL QUTLAY 44,250 44,250 44,250
167,354,348 494,371,311 316,904 0 TOTAL REGUIRENENTS 18,883 217,324 a17,324
38%,3%4.34 454,371,314 o1a,706 0 TOTAL DEPARTHENT 518,885 wi?,3 917,34



CITY OF THE DALILS
Annual Budget

1985-12986

ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION

DEPI': [Fire Copr: 046
CODIE ITEM FXPLANATION

62331 Special Department Supplies Self-Contained Breathing Apparatus
(SCBA} bench kit. Camera SLR and
Photo Supplies (Training and Fire
Prevention) .

62361 Office Fguipment Maintenance Increase in service contracts for
machinery.

62372 Tire & Tire Repairs Replace Engine #3 tires damaged by
snow chains. Replace two of Truck #2
tires - badly worn.

62373 Gas, Oil and Diesel, etc. Increase in fuel consumption — driving
drills for new and repowered vehicles.

62405 Communications Increase in telephone billing and
postage expenses.

62423 Utilities Increase dve to higher rates in
billings.

62431 Clething & ILaundry Increase in laundry service billing.

65803 Building & Additions Restoration of building - amnex floors
and insulation.

65811 Office Egquipment Replace worn typewriter — officers
usage.

65821 Purchase new vehicle Medium size 4 door sedan or station
wagon - Chief's car.

65828 Other Machinery & Replacement Replace skid mount. unit for Booster
vehicle.



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1586

COMMENTARY

DMET: Ambulance CODE: 047

FINANCE SOURCE

The Dalles Fire Department Ambulance Service budgeted appropriation for personnel
services, supplies and maintenance, lransfers out, and capital cutlay is derived
from the various resources of the General Fund and is subsidized through charges
billed to patients utilizing these services. This department is established
separate from the Fire Department to properly record the costs associated with
its operation.

SERVICES

The Ambulance Department provides twenty-four hour emergency medical care and
transportation services, manned by State certified Emergency Medical Technicians
(EMT-1s) . This department has two fully certified Basic Life Support (BLS)
ambulances and a reserve ambulance for back-up duty (scon to be cualified as BLS,
also).

PERSONNEL
Three full-time permanent EMT-1 or EMI-2s are supplied from the Fire Department
personnel to complete the required crews necessary for response on all emergency
medical and transportation calls {in addition to three provided within this
department to maintain two (2) personnel per 24 hour shift).

HIGHLIGHTS
There are nine (9) personnel certified as EMT-2s in addition to EMT-1s, serving
our community with improved medical care. We now have an EMS Officer (Assistant

Chief/Training Officer) certified as an EMT-3 to further improve our services.

The LUKAS Rescue Tool will now be carried on Ambulance #4, providing more
efficient service.

57



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1885-1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Ambulance CODE: 047

Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1982-83 1983-84 1984-85 Classification 1985-86
101,079 88,755 98,810 Persomnnel] Services 101,670
4,759 6,482 9,475 Supplies & Maintenance 10,000

Cd 5,000 5,000 Transfers Out 5,000

1,444 2,591 7,405 Capital Cutlay 22,358
107,282 102,828 120,690 TOTAL 139,028

un
e



CITY CI' THE DALLES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Ambulance
CODE: 047

BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1S585-86

PRESENT PROPOSED ADCPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SALARY SALARY * PERSONNEL SERVICES *K SALARY SALARY BODY

2 Engineers 1,660 39,840
1 Engineer 1,693 20,316
TOTAL REGULAR SALARILS 60,156
Part-time & Temporary _ 16,500
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 16,500

PAYROLL EXPENSES:

Long Term Disability 680
Social Security 4,240
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 4,477
Industrial Accident 1,848
Retirement 13,595
Life Insurance 174

TOTAL PAYROLL, EXPENSLS 25,014

59



PURT §

CITY OF THE DALLES

et
[
et

ARED: 30 JULY 1985 DERT: 047
ARGULANCE
FURD: 011
GUNERAL FUND
ERAPROPOSED/REVISED/F THAL DUDGETH¥
ACTUAL EXPEMD, HISTORY CURRENT LIRE
FRIOR~2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET EST YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIFTION
REGUIREHENTS
FERSORAL SERVICLS
5 052,45 55,736.30 58,188 0 D0a01tl REGULAR SALARIES
24,861.95 10,778,190 14,500 0 DOSOLL2 PART TIME/TEWP/0T SALARIES
19,164.75 22,040.8 24,122 0 0OAGIRE PAYROLL EXPENSES
101,077.45 88,755,214 78,810 D TOTAL PERSONAL SERVICES
HATERIALS AND SERVICES
282,00 788.03 374 0 0042301 OFFICE SUFPLIES
426,73 9. 43 1,454 0 0042331 SPECIAL DEPY. SUFFLIESR
Ré 117,10 760 ¢ 00AZ3&4 RADID REPATR
e 135,58 L, 304 G 0042371 VEHICLE PARTS Aeh SERVICE

60

16,500

101,407

-
aI»
c2
i
ot
<

£S5 OF 30 JULY 1985



SPORT £ 111

REFARED: 30 JULY 1783

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY

FRIOR-2 £R10R-1
55,39 237,80
968,07 1,800.74
598,55 278,41
401,04 178.44
3,67 432,33
489,94 343,29
04,70 127.95
4,758.50 6,481.51

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEPT: (47
AMELLAHCE
FUND: Q1

BENERAL FUND

YERPROFD

£2T YR EXP

SED/REVIGED/FINAL BUDGET##

LINE
ITER  DESCRIFTION

O062372

TIRES A&ND TIRE REPAIR
0062373 GRS, 0IL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS
0042405 COMMUBHCATIONS

00634

—

1 TRAINING & CONFERENCES
Q082414 AMEULANCE HEALS/PATIENT TRANS
0062431 CLOTHING -NEW, REPAIR GCLEAN

0042481 MISCELLAWEDUS EXPENSES

TOTAL MATERIALS AND SERVICES

61

3t

]

FAG

#5 OF 30 July 1545

N R
& DG

PROFDSED ~ REVISED  ADCPTED

750 750 750

7,000 2,000 2,040

400 400 400

£,300 1,300 1,300

£00 400 400

1,000 1,600 1,008

250 50 250
10,060 19,000 10,000



EPGRT # 111 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGE 32

REFARED: 30 JULY 1945 DEFT: 047 AS OF 30 JULY 1785
AHBULANCE
rUND: D1t
BENERAL FUND

FRXPROPUSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET#¥ Y]
ACTURL EXPERD. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FilOR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROFOSED REYISED AOOFTED

TRENSFERE QUT

5,000,040 5,000.00 a,000 0 0064724 TRAN TO AMBULANCE RES, FUMND 5,000 5,000 5,000
5.000.9 5,000.00 5,000 0 TOTAL TRANSFERS CUT 5,000 5,000 9,000

CAFITAL GUTLAY

1,027.00 1,648,25 4,600 G 0045813 NEW COMMUNICATIONS EGUIFHENT 4,500 4,500 4,00
417,14 942,82 1,809 0 DOGSBBD HAJOR REFAIRG & REFLACENENTS 2,858 2,85 2,853

50 36 g 0 0065390 ENT 11 D PROGRAN 15,000 15,000 15,000
1,444.14 2,591.07 7,405 0 TOTAL CAPITAL OUTLAY 72,35 22,38 23,34
D,081.79 102.827.79 120,490 8 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS 138,460 139,008 139,009
12,380.79 102,822.79 120,490 0 YOTAL DEFARTHENT 139,460 139,028 139,670

62



CITY O THE DALLES
Annual Budget

1985-1986

ACCOUNT

DEPT: Ambulance

DESCRIPTION

CCDE: 047

CODE ITEM EXPLANATION

62373 Gas, 0il, Etc. Increased costs in gas usage, more
responses.

62414 Meals out of town transf. Increased meals due tc additional
calls,

65813 Communications Bquipment Portable radic unit for reserve
ambulance. Recording tapes trade—in
reserve for Communication Center.

65880 Major Repairs & Replacements Bag-valve mask units and parts.

#¥% (EMT-2D Program)

Portable suction unit. Pediactics
Mast (Mast III1 A.T.). Portable flow
meters. Vacuum splint kits.

**Training and Equipment needed to
start program and continue education
for the year (this would allow
defibrillation in the field providing
better medical care for heart stoppage
patients) .

63



CiTY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985~1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Communications CODLE: (048

FINANCE SOURCE

The Communication Department's operating budget is derived from the Ceneral Fund.

SERVICES

The Comnunication Department is responsible for dispatching all City of The
Dalles Police, Fire, and Ambulance equipment. The Communication Department also
dispatches units for the Wasco County Sheriff's Department, Sherman County
Sheriff's Department, Wasco Rural Fire Protection District, and Public Works
Department.

The Communication Department serves as an answerling service for the City of The
Dalles Street, Water, and Sewer Departments as well as off duty city personnel.

The Communication Department operates the State Law Enforcement Data System
computer for ten (10) criminal justice agencies in the area as well as an
in~house computer system.

The Communication Department assists citizens of both the City of The Dalles and
Wasco County areas with information as well as directing them to appropriate
departments or agencies as well as answering questions about a variety of
subjects.

The Communication Department operates the 911 emergency phone system that serves
not only the citizens of the City of The Dalles but also residents of Wasco
County as far away as Browns Creek and Friend.

PERSONNEL

The Communication Department persconnel consists of five (5) full-time operators
and one (1) part—time operator.

We are able to give our citizens fast, efficient service with a limited number of

perscnne] .
HIGHLIGHTS
The City of The Dalles and other agencies of Wasco County are studying the

possibility of merging the Communication Departments of those agencies in order
to provide the citizens of Wasco County better service.

64



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Communications CODE: 048
Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1982~83 1983-84 1984-85 Classification 1985~86
100,035 107,118 116,199 Personnel Services 117,220
9,938 13,219 13,825 Supplies & Maintenance 14,935
- 20,379 2,854 Capital Outlay 4,000
109,974 140,716 132,878 TOTAL, 136,155

65

420G |&



CITY OF THE DALLES
ANNUAT, BUDGET

DEPT: Communications

CODE: 048
BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PROPOSED ADOFTED BY
MCONTHLY ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SATARY SALARY * PERSONNEL SERVICES *% SALARY SALARY EODY
2 Communications Officers 1,374 32,976
1 Communications Officer 1181/1229 14,604
1 Communications Officer 1229/1277 14,988
1 Communications Officer 1,181 14,172
TOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 76,740
Part-time & Temporary 5,000
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMFORARY 5,000

PAYROLL EXPENSES:

Long Term Disability 866
Sccial Security 5,410
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 10,537
Industrial Accident 237
Retirement 14,140
Life Insurance 2590

TOTAL PAYROILL EXFENSES 31,480

66



FORT F 1 CITY OF THE DALLEE FAGE 33

REFARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFT: 043 A5 OF 39 JULY 19515
COMKUNICHTIONS
FUND: Q11
GENERAL FUND

EAAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET#¥4 & G0
ACTURL EXPEND, HISTORY CURRERT LINE
FriOR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  E5T YR E¥P {TEW  DEBCRIPTION FROPDSED RENISED ROOFTED

RERUIREHENTS

PERGONAL BERVICES

71,326.40 73,453.8 76,743 0 0040111 REGULAR SALARIES 77,440 6,740 76,740
£,138.12 §,778.13 a, 000 0 0040112 PART TIHE/TEMF/DT SALARIES 7,004 7,000 7,000
o4,575.33 24,666.48 35,758 O 00A&DITS FAYROLL EXPENSES 36,072 31,480 31,480

140,034.85 107,118,472 147,659 0 TOTRL PERGONAL SERVICES 122,813 117,120 137,22
MRTERTALS AND BERVICES

AL 1,284,463 1,400 0 00AZEOL BFFICE SUPPLIES 1,600 1,608 £, 800

171,99 147,00 5G40 9 0042331 SPECIAL DEFY. SUPPLIES 300 500 By

743732 501,08 1,500 0 0062347 GENERAL ERUIFWENT HATRTERMICE £,700 1,700 4,00

53§, ? G GUATT84 RADID REPALR fi o

67



LRORT § 111

REFARED: 39 JULY 1935

AOTUAL EXFEND, RISTORY

PilGf-2

9,937.07

L0
00

Fi10R~1

13,218,

40

715,82

o
PRAFS

CITY OF THE DALLES

OEFT: 043
COMMUNICATIONS
FUND: Q11
BRUERAL FUND

HERPROPOSED/REVISED/F IHAL BUDGET*%%
CURRENT LINE
BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION

FRGE 34

A5 OF 30 JULY Loug

A 00

FROPOSED REVIGED AUEFTED

7,700 G DOG2405 COMMUNICATIONS

750 0 30a2411 TRAINIMG & CONFERENCES

i 0 0062412 MEMBERSHIF DUZS/LUBSCRIPTIONS
1,004 O 0DEZAZE UTILITIES

309 0 0082481 MISCELLANEOUS £XPENSES
13,825 0 TOTHL HATERIALS AND SERVICES

CAPITAL OUTLAY

500 0 0065011 PURCHASE NEW OFFICE EQUIFMENT
2,204 O O04GE1T HEW COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT
2,054 0 TOTAL CARTTAL OUTLAY

134,378 i TOTAL REBUIRTHENTS
134,578 0 TOTAL DEPARTHENT

8,000 a,600 2,000
g a0 890

e BE 0

el Cond T
1,800 1,390 Laaud
409 460 A0
14,535 14,935 14,935
700 700 740
7,300 3,360 3,500
4,500 1,000 4,009
141,447 13,155 135,108

141,447 136,155 136,155



RESCURCES

LIBRARY FUND

Actual Resources Current Estimated
1982-83 1983-84 1984~-85 Resource Classification 1985-86
68,889 80,352 City General Fund 81,780
68,889 80,352 County General Fund 81,780
5,718 13,442 Received from State Grant 24,668
Treaty Oak 3,000

143,496 174,146 TOTAL GENERAL, FUND 191,228

ADDITIONAL FUNDS

9,500 9,500 City Revenue Sharing 9,500
9,500 9,500 County Revenue Sharing 5,500
19,000 19,000 TOTAL ADDITIONAL, FUNDS 19,000
162,496 193,146 GRAND TOTAI, ALIL, FUNDS 210,228




CITY OF THE DALL¥S
Annual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Library CODE: 049

FINANCE SOURCE

The City of The Dalles-Wasco County Library is g tax supported department of the
City which is Operated by the City with the County paying 50% of the operating
costs. Such a joint venture enables this department to serve all Wasco County
residents, The City owns the building andg property. 7The Tibrary receives $6,000
in library materials which are purchased by Treaty Oak Commmnity College Service
District to Support its curriculum and placed in the public library collection.
In addition, Treaty OQak is contributing $3,000 towards the salary of the Resource
Librarian. The remainder of the Resource ILibrarian's salary, mirus $3,000 paid
by the Library, is paid for by a $24,668 1.8cA (Library Services and Construction
Act) grant.

PERSONNET,

The Library has a full-time staff of 4, which includes the Librarian, Public
Services Supervisor, Clerk and Clerk Typist. The Resource Librarian is a full
time position shared by Treaty Oak and the Library. Part-time positions include
four Clerks and a Custodian.,

SERVICES

The function of the Library is to provide a full-service Operation for the
County's residents ang for those residents who pay an annual fee., The Library
also serves as the college library for Treaty Oak. Services provided include
bocks, magazines, films, records, cassette tapes, large-print books, books on
cassettes, children's story hours, children's film Programs, reference
assistance, art exhibits, interljbrary loan services, outreach services, a public
nmeeting room, instructional tours for classes and community groups, and special
displays.

H IGHLIGHT_S_

Punding for the Assistant Librarian position is not. included in the 198584
budget., A Supervisory posit.ion (Public Services Supervisor) and part of the
Resource Librarian's salary ($3,000) have been added. A 4th part-time clerical
position was added to the Library's budget when the Library extended its hours to
include opening on Mondays. The book budget included in this budget is
approximately 1/2 of the amount recommended by the Oregon State Library,

79



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Library CODE: 049

Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1982-83 1983~84 1984-85 Classification 1985-86
103,883 87,574 120,896 Personnel Services 150,395
58,613 53,015 58,808 Supplies & Maintenance 59,833

~ ~ 13,442 Debt Service -

- 13,884 - Transfers Out =

= 1,843 = Capital Outlay =
162,496 156,316 193,146 TOTAL 210,228

71

(A



CITY OF THE DAILES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Library

CODE: 049
BUDGET ['OR NiY1' YEAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SALARY SALARY * PERSONNEIL: SERVICES * %k SALARY SATARY BCDY
1 Librarian 2,190 26,280
1 Assistant Librarian 1229/1277 14,892
1 ILibrary Clerk 1,166 13,992
1 Library Clerk/Typist 1,211 14,532
1 Library Coordinator 1,650 19,800
TOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 89,496
Part-time & Temporary 23,09
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 23,797

PAYROLL EXPENSES:

Long Term Disability 1,011
Social Security 7,987
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 7,436
Industrial Accident 274
Retirement 20,104
Life Insurance B 290
TOTAL PAYROLI, EXPENSES 37,102

72



PORT & 111

REFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUARL DXPEND. HISTORY

Ful0R-2

57 ,764,00
7,857.50
24, 61.43

‘AT man 07
193,882,93

7ML AN
KPR

£,533.04
LaG =Y

Fl

RI0R-1

50,136,464

&

At

i fad
ffﬁUUu

79

CITY OF THE DALLES

OEPT: 049
LIBRARY

FurD: D1t
GENERAL FUND

RAXPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET##=

CURRENT LLINE
RUDGET £5T YR EXP 1TEH DESCRIPTION FREFOSED
REQUIRERENTS
FERSONAL SERVICES
73,572 O 006DEYY REGULAR SALARIES 8y,822
23,797 O 0060112 PARY TIHME/TEMP/OT SALARIES 39,792
93,527 O DOAQLYE PAYROLL CHPENSES 36,943
120,5%4 0 TATAL PERSONAL HERVICES 157,557
HAETERTALS AND SERVICES
3,200 0 0042301 OFFICE SURPLIES 3,700
1,000 O 0062311 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 1,200
b, Al 4 DOA2I52 BLDG & GROUNDS MATNTENANCE 1,500
St O 0042341 OFFICE EQUIRPHENT HAINTENANCE 505

PAGE 30

A5 OF 30 JULY 1943

3,700

1,29
1,500

AR
LU

47,4
23,7
74

e

74

oy 7

02



EFORT # 111 CITY OF THE DALLES PAGE 36

REFARED: 30 JULY 19835 DEFT: 049 A5 OF 30 JULY 1935
LITERARY
FUiDs 0l
ENERAL FUND

FAXPROPOSED/REVISED/F THAL EUDGE 49 A 06
ALTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LIKE
FRIGR-2 PRIGR-1 BUDGET  EST YREX®  ITEM  DESCRIFTION PROPOSED  KFVISED  ADORTED
51,96 £99.75 75 0 0062367 CENERAL EQUIFMENT MAINTENANCE 759 750 250
420,38 04,32 0 0 0042373 GAS, DIL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS 0 i
390,00 12.50 250 0 0062381 EQFT. & MEETING ROOM RENTALS 750 250 250
2,457.40 2,629.73 3,000 § 0062405 COMMUNICATIONS 3,000 2,500 2,459
313.38 $33.34 1,300 O 0062411 TRAINING & CONFERENCES 1,590 1,400 {400
743,37 190,00 260 0 0047417 MEMBERSHIF DUES/SUBSCRIPTIONS 250 750 50
2,956.05 2,488,483 3,000 D 0062413 LIBRARY PERICDICALS 3,800 3,300 1,300
75 698,38 14,493.85 2,108 O 0042418 LIERARY ROOKS & BINDING 73,641 22,653 22,603
320.19 530,67 750 G DOS2417 AUDID VISUBL MATERIALS 759 500 509
7,580,50 {,000.00 3,000 G 0062471 INSURMICE AHD BONDS 3,900 3,000 3,000
¢,611.83 13,451.53 13,000 b D0SZ473 UTILITIES 17,000 17,000 17,000
522.07 897.53 1,500 0 0062424 LIERARY CATALOGING SERVICES 730 20 15

74



[PORT & 111 CITY GF THE DALLES

REPARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFT: 049
LIBRARY
FURDs 011
BENERAL FUND

HHRPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGETH#%

ACTUAL EXFERD. KISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-Z PRIOE-1 BUDGET  EBT YR EXF ITEd  DESCRIFTION
79774 737,70 00 0 0042481 HISCELLANEOUS EXPENSES

60007 03, 015,25 U808 0 TOTAL MATERIALS AND SERVICES

DERT BERVICE

$3,000.00 9 13,000 0 0063502 PRINCIFAL DUE ON CITY BONDS
1,326.00 .04 4432 0 0043601 COUPON IWY DUZ ON CITY EONDS
14,326.00 A0 13,442 ] TOTAL DERT SERVICE

TRANSFERS OUT

R 13,984.00 ] 0 0064710 TRANSTER TO DERT SCRVICES

il 13,884,050 0 0 TOTAL TRANSFERS DUT

FROPDSED

62,671

0

o

0

FRGE 37

A3 OF 30 JuLY 19:45

REVIGED

el

{

& 00

ADGFTED

&, 000

07,833

e



LPORT ¥ 11 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGE 38

REPAKED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 047 f5 OF 30 JULY 1935
LTERARY
FUND: D11
GEMERAL FUND

RURPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL GUDGETH#4 B 00
ACTUAL EXFEMD. HISTORY URREHT LIKE
FrIOR-2 FRIGR-1 BUDGET  EST YR E¥P PTENM  DESCRIFTION PROFOSE REVISED ADOFTED

CARITAL DUTLAY

00 1,042,465 o 0 0065811 PURCHASE REY OFFICE EQUIFHENT 0 0 9
A0 1,642.65 ] 0 TOTAL CARITAL OUTLAY ) it G
176,822,00 156,315,480 173,144 0 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS 2,228 210,728 210, 2:9
176,622,010 156,315.80 175,144 ) TOTAL DEFARTHENT 220,228 210,223 210,209

%, 156, 274.0;

<z
P3
L
-2
o
=]
L
poig
o
-

2,006,804 0 TOTAL FURD 2

- cne tme o men e
793,788 2,708,488 2,785,400

76



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

ACCOUNT

DESCRIPTION

DEPT: Library CODE: 049

CODE ITEM EXPLANATION

62352 Building Maintenance Decrease due to not having the
building stained this vear.

62362 General Eguipment Maintenance Decrease due to not having to budget
for replacement of the burglar alarm.

62413 Periodicals Maintains current periodical
subscriptions. Increase establishes
multiple year subscriptions with one
third of the titles expiring each year
for long term savings.

62418 Books and Binding Amount budgeted is approximately one
half of the amount recommended by the
state standards.

62423 Utilities Increase due to the library increasing
its hours to include opening on
Mondays, plus an increase for
inflation.

62424 Cataloging Services Decrease resulting from fewer book

77

purchases. Cost is based on a
processing fee of $0.99 per book.



LRORT # 112 CITY DF THE DALLES FAGE 39

REFARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEPT: 051 5 OF 30 JULY 1445
WATER UTILITY FUMD-REVENUE
FUND; 012
WATER UTILITY FUND
¥ARPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET*## A 00
ALTUAL CXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LIRE
PRIOR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTICH FROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED
REVENUE

[THER REVENUE

113,383,400 233,702.22 180,000 D 0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE 251,758 251,758 254,758
10,978.00 24,549.57 13,000 ¢ 0040521 IMTEREST ON SAVINGS 15,009 15,000 15,000
00 00 7,500 0 0043227 SRIF REFUMDS i ) i)
41,774.84 22,306,407 38,000 0 0044394 MISC, SALES AMD BERVICE 20,909 20,400 20,090
&,800,25 &7,017.2%2 7,000 0 0044355 INTERDEPARTHENT REVENUE 15,000 {0,000 15,000
740,437 .44 P44,270.15 240,000 0 0044401 CUSTOMER SERVICE CHARGES 920,000 0,000 52,000
2,687.47 16,140.54 13,000 0 0044403 RAIM EXTENSION CHARGES 15,000 15,000 15,000
A0 .00 2,400 G 0044404 WATER HYDRANT REPLACEMENTS 7,000 7,000 7,800

0 35,181.54 30,000 O 0044405 TIMBER RECELFTS 20,000 25,000 25,000

78



LRPORT 4 11

REFARED: 20 JULY 1945

CTURL EXPEND, HISTORY

Fi10R-2

1,136,062.70

FRIOR-1

1,343,833, 40

CITY OF THE DALLES
DEFT: 0%
WATER UTILITY FUND-REVENUE
012
WATER LTILITY FUND

FUND:

EAXPRDPOSED/REVISED/FIHAL BUDGET##%

CURRENT LINE
BUDGET  EST YR EX®  ITEM  DESCRIFTION
27,000 0 0047732 REC'D FRON WATER RESERVE FUND
0 O 0048727 ENGINEER TIME OH ABSESBED FJT
1,262,900 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE
1,262,500 ] TOTAL REVENUE

79

1,768,758

1,268,758

5 OF 30

1,268,758

AR
\r"ri'\.?{'_ “r@

JULY 1985

<



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Water Treatment & Supply CODE: 061

FINANCE SOURCE

The revenues to finance this department are obtained from sales of water,
interdepartment revenue, installation charges of main and service lines, sale of
City owned timber from the Watershed Reserve, and miscellaneous service sales
such as bio-laboratory examinations, etc. All revenues are shared with the Water
Distribution Division of the Department of Public Works.

SERVICES

The basic and chief responsibilities of the Department are the production of a
SAFE and ADEQUATE water supply from the mountain water sources on a consistent
basis, to effectively wonitor and manage all resource activities of the Watershed
Reserve, both Federal and Municipal, and to coordinate these management
activities with other agencies involved in the cooperative management venture in
The Dalles Municipal Watershed Reserve. It is the responsibility of the
Department to conduct quality chemical, physical, and microbiological analyses of
these raw and finished water sources and those of the municipal water
distribution system to assure compliance with both State and Federal Water
Quality Standards in providing for Public Health. Coordination and cooperation
in the affairs of water production is essential with the Water Distribution
System to effect management control, efficiency, and economy in water service
operations.

PERSONNEL

There are three divisions functioning within the Department and present staff
consists of the following positions:

DIVISION OF WATER TREATMENT DIVISION OF BIO-LABORATORIES

Water Quality Control Supervisor — 2/3 Water Quality Control Supervisor - 1/3
Certified Treatment Operator - 3-1/2 Staff Microbioclogist = 1
DIVISION OF WATERSHED MANAGEMENT DEPT OF WATER SUPPLY & TREATMENT

Asst. Department Director i | (Composite of Three Divisions)
Certified Utility Operator =1, Department Director -1

In addition to the above staff positions, the Department employs a full-time
part-time secretary, and necessary part-time/temporary staff to assist in
maintenance activities in Watershed & Treatment Plani operations. The Department
shares the services of a full-time operator with the Water Distribution System
such that this person functions 6 months of a given year at each location. The
Department is in charge of managing the affairs of timber rescurces and the
contract terms that apply to Pacific Forest Consultants as our tinmber resource
censultants.

80



Water Treatment & Supply Page 2 Commentary
HIGHLIGHTS

This budget will provide for the continued and consistent water production from
Wicks Treatment Plant, enhance resource activity management of the Watershed
Reserve, and support Water Quality Control as monitored by the Bio-ILaboratories
Division.

In new requirements in treatment process control and water cquality contrcl the
Department will be providing for contimuous application of corrosion corrective
chemicals that will provide for reduction of the economy investment loss through
loss of main transmissions and in-residence plumbing. The mountain source is
naturally corrosive and the treatment processes contribute to this negative
factor. Corrosion indexes are controlled by requlatory mandates and in this
consideration we must apply corrective measures.

Use of polymers such as we apply in our treatment processes have been (ound to
have & very significant perscnal safety risk in handling. Recent toxicity
studies have presented real evidence that dust particulate from polymers using or
associated with acrylamide monomer in an unreacted state has oncogenicity
toxicity potentials. It is absolutely necessary that. safe means of protection
from exposure be provided in polymer use and to keep the material from being
airborne. Protective measures have been instituted at Wicks Plant, however, it
is essential that we remove this chemical equipmeni out of the plant control room
as the residual of polymer unfixed is not only in the air but found on every
picce of equipment and laboratory ware we have. Removal 1s the only resclve.
This budget provides for the constiuction of a room to the existing alum storage
room to house both the polymer feed-mix equipment and the calcium hydroxide
feeder so that no dangers are posed to operations staff or to operaticns
equipment from chemical residuals of either chemical. The building addition will
have dimensions of 18' x 26' and of concrete block construction.

This budget provides for the continued necessary transportation system
construction and maintenance within the Watershed Reserve to function for
administrative use and removal of timber products. This budget specifically
addresses installation of necessary tubing and construction of a road access
across the existing spillway of Crow Creek Dam. This construction will complete
the intertie of the new access constructed on the opposite end of Crow Creek Dam
in the FY 84-85 budget. The budget also provides for survey of property lines
necessary to timber harvest activities to prevent encroachment.

This budget will provide for the addition of @ new 4 x 4, 3/4 ton pickup unit for
Watershed Maintenance, patiol and administration activities. 7The Department
intends to convert the existing 3/4 ton 1976 Ford pickup to a fire pumper unit
for use in maintenance and brush disposal activities in the Reserve.

Zero based budget methods were used in the preparation of this budget and our
previous experiences in this method has eliminated 'contingency fat' in line
items of prior years.

TOTAL RAW WATER SCURCE TRIATED AT WICKS TREATMENT PLANT IN FY 1983-34:
) 1,675,550,000 Gallons
TOTAL I'INISHED WATER DELIVERED TO THE CITY FROM WICKS PLANT IN FY 1983-84:
1,534,962,000 Gallons

81



CITY OF THE DAILES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Water Treatment & Supply CODE: 061

Actual Expenditures Current Fstimated
1982-83 1883-84 1984-85 Classification 1985-86
281,856 314,605 Personnel Services 306,326
84,586 122829 Supplies & Maintenance 140,399
9,283 6,576 Transfers Qut 6,800
47,382 61,500 Capital Outlay 91,324

- 13,483 Contingencies & Balance 19,283

423,107 518,993 TOTAL 564,132

32




CITY OF THE DALLES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Water Treatment & Supply

CODE: (61
BUDGET FCR NEXT YFAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SALARY SALARY * FPERSCONNEL, SERVICES ¥k SALARY SATARY BODY
1 Director 2,637 31,644
1 Assistant Director 2,217 26,604
1 Water Quality Control Supvr 1846/1947 22,866
1  Staff Microbiologist 1,888 22,656
2 Certified Operators 1,788 42,912
1 Certified Operator 1,591 19,092
1 Uncertified Operator 1522/1584 18,760
TOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 184,534
Part-time & Temporary 43,573
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 43,573

PAYRCLIL, EXPENSES:

Iong Term Disability 2,085
Social Security 13,011
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 19,417
Industrial Accident 5,851
Retirement 37,391
ILife Insurance 464
TOTAL PAYROLL, EXPENSES 78,216

83



FORT § 14l

AEFRRED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEMD. HISTORY

FRIOR-2

244,85%.31

i
§ 7 i
Ledo7.13
AR
U
AT NAG
42, L

FRI10R-1

269,520,

aE
&

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEFT: 061
WATER TREATWENT & SUPFLY
FUND: 012

WATER UTILITY FUND

¥AAPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGETH¥X
CURRENT LINE
WOGET  ESY YR EXP O ITEM  DESCRIFTION

REQUIREHENTS

FERGORAL SERVICI S

171,737 0 O050111 REGULAR SALARRIES
33,787 0 00a0112 PART TIND/TEHP/DT GALARIES
87,081 D 0DADL%L FRYROLL EXPENSES
314,600 b TOTHL PERGOMSL SERVICES
HATERLIALS AND SERVICES
100 ¢ 00582241 NOTICES & PUBLICATIODNR
1,800 0 0042301 OFFICE BUPPLIES
1,204 O 0062311 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
M O D0AZR2T CHEWITAL & LAR SUPPLIER

84

A5 OF 30 JULY 1948

B GO

FROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED

33,260 43,573 43,573
71,151 78,217 78,217
35,50 306,326 304,328
250 250 Ry
1,800 1,800 ol
1,200 1,200 i,200
79,736 79,770 7



APORT # 14 CITY OF THE DALLES FREE 42

REFERED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: Q81 A5 OF 30 JULY 1
WATER TREATMENT & SUPRLY
FUND: 017
WATER UTILITY Fulg

HHAFROPOSED,/REVISED /T INAL LLDGET#34 & 0D
ACTUAL EXFEND, HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FiIOR-2 FRIOK-1 BUDGET ~ EST YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIFTION PROPDSED  REVISED  ADOPTED
1,698.94 .00 D D 0062331 SPECIAL DEPT. SUPFLIES 0 9
2,829.20 2,644.04 5,000 0 0042352 BLDG & GROUNDS MAINTENANCE 5,000 5,000 5, D
00 .00 400 0 0082351 OFFICE ERUIPHENT HAINTENANCE 600 400 401
2,584,99 5,357, 40 6,500 0 0047362 GENERAL EBUIPHINT MAINTENANCE 8,000 8,000 8,0
765,20 55.91 500 0 0042343 SHOP TOOL & SHOP TOOL REPAIR 750 750 759
140,45 131.42 550 6 0042364 RADID REFAIR 500 560 5
1,794.39 7,147.94 3,000 0 0042371 VEHICLE PARTS AND SERVICE 3,500 3,500 3,500
7748 620,97 500 0 0052372 TIRES AND TIRE REPAIR 0 1,000 1,00
3,511,460 2,890.5 4,250 0 0062373 GAS, DIL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS 4,250 4,750 3,259
59.70 48,00 100 0 D04238L EGPT. & MEETING RDOM RENTALS 106 190 §i34
{,401.89 1,493.87 1,300 D 0062405 COMMUNICATIONS 1,800 1,800 § ;000
1,352.41 /527,43 1,925 0 0042411 TRAINING & CONFERENCES 2,000 2,000 2,409



REFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTURL EXFEMD. BISTORY

FilGR-2

82.00

17,093.41

2,200.00

£y

40

7,992 77

FRIOR-1

290,00
70,230.74
1,860.76
577.87

1,851,02

LEIT Ur IHE DALLES

DEFT: (41
WATER TREATHMENT & SUPRLY
FUND: 012

HATER UTILITY FUND

#4AFROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL RUDGET#4+

CURRENT LINE
BUDGET  EST YR EYF ITEM  DERCRIPTION
300 0 0082417 XEWRERSHIF DUES/SURSCRIFTIONS
19,700 0 Q062423 UTILITIES
24175 0 0062431 CLOTHING -NEW, REPATR &CLEAN
a0 & 0042481 MISCELLANEOUS EXPENSER
2,000 0 D0&2E1L WATER DEPT SHARE FIRE PATROL

122,829 9 TOTAL HATERIALS AND SERVICES
TRANGFERS OUT
2,974 0 0064711 TRANSFER TO GENERAL FUND
0 0 0044717 TRANSFER TO ENERGY DEPT,
2,500 0 0064730 TRAN TO UNEMFLOYMENT ING EES
1,500 0 0064751 JOINT USE OF MEM & EQUIFMENT
6,574 9 TOTAL TRANSFERS OUT

FAGE 43

A3 OF 30 JULY 1545

A 00

ADBRTED

300 300 309
72,104 22,104 22,104
2,175 2,175 2,175
500 500 500
800 4,300 4,200
139,399 140,399 140,399
7,800 2,500 7,800
b D 9
2,500 1,500 2,500
1,500 1,500 1,500
4,500 4,500 4,800



LRORT & 11

'REFARED: 30 JULY 1785

ACTURL EXPEND, HISTORY

FiI0R-2

16,110.59
.60
00
00

Y 5
21,441.48

FRIOR-1

L0

.09

00

16,874.41

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEPT: 041

WATER TREATHENT & SUFPLY
FUMD: 012

WATER UTILITY FUND

HRAFROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH# ¥

CURFERT LIME
BUDGET P UTER DESCRIFTION
CAFITAL DUTLAY
9 0065801 PURCHASE LAND/BLDG/EASERENTS
20,700 0 0085803 THPROV TO BLDG OR ADDITIONS
2,200 0 0085811 PURCHASE NEW OFFICE EQUIPHENT
1,400 D 0085813 NEW COMNUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT
0 0 0063823 PURCHASE WEW TRUCK/P1CKURS
3,300 0 0053328 OTHER BACHINERY & EGUIFHMENT
g 0 0065825 CROM CREEM WATER STUDY
7,800 0 0065344 WATERBHED CNSTAMAINT SUPPLIES
20,300 0 CGDA5E4AT WATERSHED ROAD CNST & MAINT.
3,700 O Q055845 TIMBER HGMT & REFDRESTATION
0 0 0045030 HAJOR REPAIRS & REPLACENENTS

87

PROPOSED /

31,000
3,700

.G

EVISED

§

28,524

PAGE 44

A5 OF 30 SULY 1935



CSPORT # 111

REPARED: 30 JULY 19783

ACTUAL EXFEND. HRISTORY

FrI0R-2

FRIOK-1

09
09
120,150,067

429,150.07

CURRERT
EUDGET

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEFT: 041

WATER TREATHENT & SUPPLY
Funog: 012

HATER UTILITY FUND

#44FROPOSEN/REVISED/F INAL BUDGLT*%%

PRGE 4%

A% OF 30 JULY 1945

LINE
EST YR EXP  ITEW  DESCRIFTION PROFOSED  REVISED
9 TOTAL CAFITAL DUTLAY 91,324 91,324
CONTINGENCIES
0 0066900 OPERATING CONTINGENCIES 7,780 19,263
0 TOTAL CONTINGERCIES 7,380 19,283
5 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS 564,137 564,132
5 TOTAL DEFARTHENT 504,132 584,137

ao4, 152

CJA oy
o684, 15



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985~-1986

ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION

DEPT: Water Treatment & Supply CODE: 061
CODE ITEM EXPLANATION
321 Chemical & Laboratory Supplies Treatment chemicals, laboratory

reagents, instruments, glassware,
culture supplies, report forms.

423 Utilities Electrical enerqgy use for the
Treatment Plant, Wicks Well, and
Security lighting. Garbage Disposal &
rental.

511 Watershed Patrol Services Provide fire patrol as mandated by the
State of Oregon and Air Security
Patrol for Reserve Enforcement.

803 Improvements & Additions to Watershed Buildings Maintenance,
Buildings - New Construction Paint maintenance for Wicks Plant and
Reservoirs, addition to Wicks Plant
for Lime-Polymer Feed Applications.

823 Purchase New Trucks & Pickups New 3/4 ton, 4 x 4 pickup for
Watershed Maintenance & Patrol,

846 Timber Management & Reforestation  Timber reconaissance supplies,
mapping, survey instruments,
seedlings, permits, timber haul fees,
soils stabilization, public relations
brochures, survey fees.

Further detail may be reviewed ofline code descriptions by referencing line item
narrative for FY budget 1985-86 for the Department of Water Supply and Treatment
submit ted separately to the Budget Ceommittee.

89



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Water Distribution CODE: 062

FINANCE SOURCE

Water Distribution primary revenues for 1985/86 will consist of the monthly water
use charges and watershed tinber receipts. Other revenues are water main
extensions, service renewals/new services, and interdepartment use of men and

equipment.
PERSONNIL,
(1/3) Director of Public Works/ (1) Department Supervisor
City Engineer (1) Service Specialist
(1/3) Assistant City Engineer {3) Equipment Operator I1/Certified
(1/3) Account Clerk (1) Equipment Operator 11
SERVICES

The responsibility of the Water Department includes providing a constant, safe
water supply in sufficient quantity at peak demands for the consumer, plus ample
supply for fire protection. The basic source of the City water is the City
Watershed and the storage accumulated behind Crow Creek Dam. The City
supplements from four main wells: Marks Well, Jordan Street, Mill Creek Wells,
and Lone Pine Well.

HIGHLIGHTS

All portions of the 1980 3.5 million dollar bond issue are complete and in
service. Two new pressure regulating valves have been installed on the Garrison
Street reservoir feed system. Responses to demand in the largest service area
will be better meet then with the old 14th-16th Street reservoir system.

The systems analysis has been postponed to 1985-86, due to the completion of the
Garrison Street reservoir.

90



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Water Distribution CODE: 062
Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1982-83 1983-84 1984-85 Classification 1285-86
251,470 250,259 262,922 Persconnel Services 256,751
101,937 B7,966 130,650 Supplies & Maintenance 115,730
49,855 47,340 46,380 Debt Bervice 55,340
63,401 94,197 106,299 Transfers Qut 80,300
58,219 28,890 154,800 Capital Qutlay 173,900
- e 42,856 Contingencies & Balance 22,605
524,882 508,652 743,907 TOTAL 704,626

91




CITY OF THE DALLES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Water Distribution
CODE: 062

BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1985-86

PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHILY ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL  GOVERNING
SATARY SALARY * PERSONNEL SERVICES bkl SALARY SATARY BCODY

33% Public Works Dir/City Eng 2,763 11,052
33% Asst. Dir/Asst City Eng 2,319 9,276
1 Water Dept Supervisor 2130/2217 26,256
4 Certified Cperators 1,788 85,824
1 Uncertified Operators 1546/1610 19,192
333 Account Clerk 4,844
TOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 156,444
Part-time & Temporary 20,900
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 20,500

PAYROLL EXPENSES:

Long Term Disability 1,872
Social Security 13,157
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 16,502
Industrial Accident 10,000
Retirement 37,452
Life Insurance 424
TOTAL PAYROLL EXPENSES 79,407

92



PORT & 138 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGE 44
AEPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: 042 AS OF 30 JULY 1565
RATER DISTRIBUTION
FUND: 012
HATER UTILITY FUND

ERAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET*3# A OO
ACTUAL EXPEND. RISTORY CURRERT LINE
Fl10R-2 FRIOR-1 BUDBET  EST YR EXF 17EM  DESCRIFTION FRUFDSED REVISED AGOFTED
REGUIREHENTS

PERGOMAL SERVICYS

170,753,908 169,424.52 162,142 0 0080111 REGULAR SALARIES ol 264 154,444 136,444
10,124.43 13, 703.43 20,500 i 0060112 FART TIHE/TEMF/OT SALARIES 20,900 20,900 20,900
70,590.10 68, 108.55 77,880 0 (060195 PRYROLL EXPENSES 70,912 79,407 77,407

#51 469,81 250,258.90 262,922 0 TOTAL PERGONAL SERVICES 249,0%6 256,751 256,751

HATERIALS AND SERVICES

414,53 75541 1,000 0 004Z301 DFFICE SUPPLIES 700 900 200
£,488.37 7,034,20 3,600 0 00562371 CHEMICAL & LAE SUPFLIES 3,530 3,734 3,534
1,35.17 21,501 .58 42,000 9 DOAZIAL SFECIAL DEFT. GUFFLIES 26,000 26,000 28,000

G470 Bt 0 0 Q02341 CONSTRUCTION BUPFLIES ! 4 G

93



EFORT & 114

REFARED: 30 JUL
ACTUAL EXPEND,
Fi10k-2

7,333.78

471.77

30,234

CURRENT
BUDGET

2,000
2,000
=00
9,000
/500
12,000
o
2,500
1,000

350

ad

45,000

1,000

EST YR EXP

CITY OF THE DALLE

DEFT: 042

HATER DISTRIBUTION
012

WATER UTILITY FUND

FURD:

RAEPROPORED/REVISED/F INGL BUDGET#¥#
LINE

TTEM  DESCRIFTION

0 0DA23L2 BLDG & GROUNDS MAINTEMANCE
0 0042362 GENERAL EQUIFHENT MAIRTENANCE
0 00873463 GHOP TOOL & SHOP TOOL REPAIR

0 0042371 VEKICLE PARTS &ND SERVICE

D 0062372 TIRES AND TIKE REFAIR

0 0062373 GAS, OIL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS
D 0042401 WATER & SEMER REFUND ACCOUNT
0 0042405 COMHUNICATIONS

0 DOAZA1L TRAINING & CONFERENCES
0 0062412 NEMBERSHIF DUCS/SUESCRIPTIONS
0 DOS4Z3 UTILITIES

0 0042431 CLOTHING -NEW, REPATR &CLEAH

94

FROFOSED

1,000
13,750
1,000
590
43,700

1,200

A8 OF 30 JLY

REVISED

FAGE 47

1943

{,000
LG
43,700

e

L, 200



CPORT & 111

REFARED: 34 JULY 1985

101,937.12

49,000.00
0

9,355.00

00

49 ,855,00

40,000.,00
459,00~

6,126.00

1,700,580

47,246.00

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEFT: 042
BATER DISTRIBUTION
FUND:  £12

WATER UTILITY FUND

SAXPROFOSED/REVISER/F

CURRENT LIHE
BUBGET  EST YR EXP TTEH

1AL BUDGET*ex

DESCRIFTION

0 b 00462480 WICROFILHING
Va0, 650 0 TOTAL BATERIALS AND SERVICES
DEET SERVICE
40,000 O 0063502 PRINCIFAL DUE ON CITY BONDS
0 0 0063520 INTEREST ON 1747 WATER GONDS
4,680 O 0063601 COUPDN INT DUE OM CITY RDNDS
1,709 9 0082620 STREET ASSESSHENTS
46,330 { TOTAL DERBT SERVICE

95

FROFOSE

FAGE 48

K3 OF 30 JULY 1995

A O

REVISED

ALOFTED

145,730 115,730
45,000 45,000
3,240 3,240
00 00
6,400 by bl
Co Tan CE 7AM
S gl dudy 34



LFURE ' o4l

(EFARED: 30 JULY 1935

Fd

e

7,476,

fp

w AU

4
il

wdn

W05

. HISTORY
PRIOR-1

54,999.00

6,500,060

00

27,000,00

CURRENT
BUBBET

53,299
7,500
2,500

27,000
9,000

13,000
30,000
3,000

06

LiTT U It UnLLED

DEFT: 0&2

HATER DISTRIBUTION

FURD: 012

WATER UTILITY FUMD

HHPROFOSED/REVIS

EST YR EXP

0

FIHAL BUDGET##*
LINE
ITEW  DEGCRIPTION

TRANSFERD OUT

Q064711 TRANSFER TO GENERAL TUND
0064714 TRAN TO 5T & STORM SEMER FUMD
D044730 TRAW TO UNEMPLOYHENT IN3 RES
0064734 TRARGFER TO WATER RESERVE

0064751 JOIHT USE OF MEN & EGUIFNENRT

TOTAL TRANSFERS DUT

CAPITAL DUTLAY

0053300 WATER HATH-AGSESSED BY OWHERS

ODATE0A REW WATER HAING/REPLACEMENT

0045005 CONSTRUCT NEW HYDRANT &VALVES

0085813 PURCHASE NEW OFFICE EQUIPHENT

96

PROFOSED

80,300

5,000
47,400
7,000

aod

fRbL 4y

£3 OF 30 JULY 1949

REVISED

53,300
9,50
2,500

9

19,080

40,300

ADOFTED

=T
LY



EPORT 4 1 CITY OF THE DALLES PAGE G0

KEFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: (o2 AS OF 30 JULY 1945
WATER DISTRIBUTION
FUb: 012
BATER UTILITY FURD

*4APROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET#¥ A 00
ACTUL EXPEND. KISTORY  CURRENT LINE

FRIOR-2 PRIOR-L  BUDBET  EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIFTION PROPOSED  REVISED  ADOFTED
10,609.5 11,173.30 14,300 0 0065823 PURCHASE NEW TRUCK/FICKUFS £,000 8,000 8,000
3,092.93 7,393.65 4,000 0 0045328 OTHER MACHINERY & EQUIPHE 6,000 6,000 6,000
00 239.50 30,000 0 0065833 FROFESSIONAL SERVICES 30,000 30,600 36,080
36,772,32 753,54 9 G 0065330 MAJOR REFAIRS & REPLACENENTS 0 0 y
00 00 40,000 0 0085881 LONTRACT/CBNTRACTORS PAYNENTS S0,006 86,060 6U,60
§8,219.00  46,887.81 154,800 0 TOTAL CAPITAL DUTLAY TR0 174,900 373,900

CONTIHGENCIES

00 D0 42,858 O 0064700 OPERATING CONTINGENCIES 77,260 22,405 22,405
00 L0 42,85 0 TOTAL CONTINGERCIES 27,260 I2,605 22,409
RD4,862.47  G0R,651.9& 743,907 0 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS 04,626 04,828 704,62
LR4, B8 G, 851,94 Yo T 0 TOTEL DEFARTHENT 08,4624 Foa 624 ThA 6%
947,588.96  720,802.03  1,242,90 0 TATAL FUMD 1,268,708 1,060,758 1,268,750

97



CITY OF THE DALIES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION

DEPT: Water Distribution CODE: 062
CODE ITEM EXPLANATION
65804 New Water Mains/Replacement Various main upgrading, altitude valve

intermediate reservoir, Garrison
Street and intermediate reservoir
irrigation system. $47,400

65823 Purchase New Truck/Pickups Replace unit #31 with mid-size
pickup. $8,000

65828 Other Machinery and Equipment Construct Chlorine Building at
Garrison. $6,000

65833 Professional Services Perform water distribution "systems
analysis"™. $30,000

65881 Contracts/Contractors Payments Repaint inside Columbia View Heightls
Reservoir. $60,000

98



BONDED DEBT STATEMENT OF 1567 GENERAL OBLIGATION WATER BONDS FOR 1985-1986

Bonds Principal Principal Interest Principal
remaining due due Total remaining Year of
after 6/30/85 1985/86 1985/86 due after 6/30/86 pay out
$ 90,000 $45,000 53,240 $48,240 $45,000 1986-87

This Bond Debt Obligation is to be paid as a portion of the Water Distribution section
of the 1985-86 City Budget. This debt obligation is for the construction of Crow Creek
Dam and other System Improvements of 1967-68.

99



EFGRT § 111

HEFARED: 30 JULY

ACTUAL EXFEND.

T W 5
Filge-2

14,330,00
787.00

00

6, 445,44
59, 068,49
.09
456,506.94
37,504.92

O

1785

4.00-

00

.00

vl

00

523,151,
3,717,

55,000,

4

00

CURRENT

Tt aked
BUuGE |

64,000
800
7,500
5,000

40,000

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEPT: 053

WASTENATER REVENUE

FUND: 012

WRETEWATER FUND

FAAPROPOSED/ REVISED/F INAL BUDRET##x

LIND
VTEH DESCRIPTION

REVERUE

(THER REVENUE

0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE
0040521 INTEREST On S4VINGS
(043227 SAIF REFUNDS

COA4374 MISC. SALES AHD BERVICE
0044375 INTERDEFARTHENT REVENUE
0044596 CONNECTION FEES

0044401 CUSTOMER SERVICE CHARGES
0044403 HAIN EXTENSION CHARGES

0044732 REC/D-GENERAL REVENUE SHARING

100

PROFPESED

30,000
0
560,000
10,000

0

PAGE 51

A5 OF 30 JULY 1935

86,000
2,000

0

4,009
30,0600
9

nat, 000
16,000

i}

30,000
]

550,000



EFORT § 11

PREFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND. KISTORY

FRICR-2

70,000,00

FRIOR-

.00
5,000.00
00

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEFT; 053

WARTERATER REVERUE
FUND: 013

WASTEWATER FUHD

HHAPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL GUDGET##4
CURRENT LIKE
BUDGEY  EST ¥R £¥p ITEH  DESCRIFTION

b O 0047724 RECD FROM RESERVE FUND
13,000 U 0047733 REC'D PUHPING RESERVE FUND
0 0 0048727 ENGINEER TINE ON ASSESSED FJT
714,080 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE
714,080 0 TOTAL REVEMUE

107

727,000

Al €
FAGE w2

fo OF 30 LY 1985

727,000



CITY OF THE DALLES
Anmual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Wastewater Treatment CODE: 063

FINANCE SOURCE

Wastewater Treatment revenues for 1985/86 will consist of the monthly sewer use
charge, miscellanecus sales and services, and proceeds from the U.S. Army Corp of
Engineers settlement due to increased effluent pumping, cauvsed by Bonneville Pool

fluctuatiocns.

(1) Plant Supervisor (1) Lab Assistant

(1) Labk Technician {2) Plant Operator
SERVICES

The responsibility of the Department is to operate and maintain the Wastewater
Treatment Plant in an efficient and economical manner and in compliance with the
Federal and State laws and regulations as prescribed by the NPDES discharge
permit. This budget was prepared assuming the following influent parameters.

Average daily flow - 2.6 MGD
Average total suspended solids —~ 160 mg/liter
Average total BOD - 200 mg/liter

HIGHLIGHTS

This year, the wastewater treatment facility budget has been separated from the
wastewater collecticn budget.

Personnel at the treatment facility have been reduced by two from 1985-85.

The wastewater plant engineering evaluation scheduled for 1984-85 has been
postponed until 1985-86. This evaluation will identify present cost saving
procedures which might be implemented as well as allow the City to predict future
plant expansion costs and requirements should the current plant design loadings
be exceeded either through future population or industry growth.

102



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater Treatment CODE: 063

Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
1982-83 1983~84 1984-85 Classification 1985~86
355,121 346,030 365,850 Personnel Services 169,777
122,771 109,484 130,600 Supplies & Maintenance 76,050

= = = Debt Service -

68,972 85,426 120,465 Transfers Out 27,000
21,409 35,042 58,000 Capital Cutlay 32,800

- - 39,165 Contingencies & Balance 18,230

568,273 575,982 714,080 TOTAL 323,857

103




CITY OF THE DALLES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Wastewater Treatment

CODE: 063
BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY  ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL  GOVERNING
SALARY SALARY * PERSCNNEL SERVICES *% SALARY SALARY BODY
1 Chief Plant Operator 2,217 26,604
1 Asst. Plant Operator 1,808 21,696
1 ILab Technician 1,864 22,368
2 Certified Plant Operators 1,788 42,912
33% Account: Clerk 4,644
TOTAL RIGULAR SALARIES 118,224
Part—time & Temporary 5,000
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 5,000

PAYROLL EXPENSES:

Long Term Disability 1,283
Sccial Security 8,010
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 12,413
Industrial Accident 3,532
Retirement 25,669
Life Insurance 290
TOTAL PAYROLL EXPENSES 51,1897

104



EFORT + 113 CITY OF THE DALLES FARE 3

REFARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFT: 063 A5 OF 30 JULY 1985
WASTEWATER TREATHENT
FUHD: 013
WASTEWATER FUND

¥HAPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET#: A 0D
ACTUAL EXPERD. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FrIgR-2 PRICR- BUBGET  EST ¥R EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROPOSED REVISED KDOFTED
RERUIREMENTS
FERGONAL SERVICLS
247,7435.21 244, 446,85 242,170 O 0060111 REGULAR SALAREES 113,880 143,530 113,580
3,624.13 7,088.83 19,300 0 0060112 PART TYHE/TEMP/OT SALARIES 5,000 5,000 5,000
103,775.40 74,474.03 113,380 0 D0&LLFE FAYROLL EXPENSES at, iy o1,1%7 81197
eI b L 346,029.71 365,850 0 TOTAL FERGONAL SERVICES 170,007 167,797 169,777
MATERTALS AND SERVICES
43456 664,74 1,100 0942301 QFFICE BUPFLIES a0y 00 500
7,421,864 8,6/3.42 8,300 0 0042321 CHEWICAL & LAE SUFPLIES 4,700 6,700 6,700
366,92 G, 54775 8,700 0 0062331 SPECIAL DEFT. SUFPLIES 250 250 250
la. 450, 00 7 § 0042341 CONSTRUCTION SURFLIES 0 J )



ACTUARL EXPEND,

156,55
7,924.47
1,794,95

11,124,277

HISTORY
FRIOR-1

3,008,
12,487,
Bhl

13,8%9.

P-J

y 379,35

4

41

ol

01

bl

CURRENT
BUDGET

CITY OF THE DALLES

OEFT: 043

WASTEWATER TREATHENT

Fub: 013
EWATER FUND

WAS

SHAPROFOSED/REVISED/F INAL RUDGET#%4

EST YR EXF

LINE
VIEW  DESCRIFTION

0062352 BLDG & GROUNDS MAINTENANCE
0062262 GENERAL EQUIFMENT MATNTENANCE
0062363 SHOP TOOL & SHOR TOOL REPRIR
0042371 VEHICLE FARTS AND SERVICE
0052372 TIRES AND TIRE REFAIR
09462373 GRS, OIL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS
00462401 WATER & SEMER REFUND ATCOUMT
20462405 COMMUNICATIGNS

Q052411 TRAINING & COMFERENCES
0062412 MEMBERSHIP DUES/SUBSCRIPTIONS
O06282F UTILITIES

0042431

CLOTHING -NEW, REFAIR &CLEAM

106

FROFDSED

200
46,200

700

REVISED

1,500
7,300

250
2,900

1,800

T

44,200

Fo0

A 00

ADOFTED

<2
(=)
>

.

g
o

T3
>
=



wFURY F 111

REFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL CAPEND. WISTORY

preioR=2 PRIOR-1
00 00
122,770.44  109,464,30
34,400.00 36,288,00
=, 000,09 6,5006.00
.00 10,000.00
.00 .00

30,371.75

B9, 4246.23

CURRENT
RUDGET

0

130, 400

LitY UF [HE DALLES

DEFT: 043

HASTENATER TREATHENT
013

WASTEUATER FUND

FUMD:

HHRFROFOSED/REVISED/F IHAL RUDGETH#%
LINE
1TEW  DESCRIFTION

O 0042480 HICROFILMING

] TOTAL WATERIALS AND SERVICES

TRANSFERS OUT

O 0064711 TRANSFER TO GENERAL FUND

0 00&4714 TRAN TO 8T & STORM SEMER FUND
0 DO54720 TRANSFER TO BUILDING RESERVE

O DOKATED TRAN TO UNEMPLOYMENT IHS RES

0 0064751 JOINT USE OF MEN & EQUIFHENT

0 TOTAL TRANGFERS ouT

167

25,000
2,004

9

77,000

FRGE 5%

3 OF 30 JULY 745

74,050

37,000

]

76,050



T R

o Fu

E

ACTUAL EXPEND.

PRIDK-2

21,409.04

RRED: 30 JULY 1985

HISTORY
FRIOR-1

7.20

7.40
1,020,63
.00

.00
5,404.45
.00
22,047.00
5, 548,50

DEPT: 043
UASTEWATER TREATHENT
FUND: 013

WASTEWATER FUND

SUXPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL LUDGET*%#

CURRENT LIHE
BUDGET  EST YR EXP  TTEM  DESCRIFTION
CAFITAL DUTLAY
7,500 o Q045799 SEMER MAIN-ASSESSED RBY CUNERS
10,000 0 DOAGEO4 MEW SEMER MAINS/REPLACEMENT
300 0 G050BL1 PURCHASE NEW OFFICE EQUYPHENT
0 0 ODAERLI NEY COMMUMICATIONS EGUIRMENT
0 G 0045823 PURCHASE NEW TRUCK/FICKUPS
it { COATEZE OTHER HACHINERY & ERUIPHENT
20,000 0 004323 FROFESHIOMAL SERVICES
0 0 0065380 MAJOR REPAIRS & REPLACENERTS
20,000 0 DOAUBRL CONTRACT/CONTRACTORS PAYHENTS
af, 000 9 TOTAL CARITAL QUTLAY

108

FROFOSED
0
]
)
b
0
¢
20,000
12,800
9
32,800

S OF 30

REVISED

20,000
2,800

2

Frug )

JULY 1785

fGh

ADOFTED

20,000

12,800



EFORT ¥ 111 CITY OF THE DALLES PAGE 57

REFARED: 30 JULY 1943 BEPT: 043 A5 OF 30 JULY 1945
WHSTERATER TREATHENT
FUND: 013
HRSTEMATER FURD

#4%PROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL EUDGET 4+ A 00

ACTUAL EXPEND. WISTORY  CURRENT LINE

108 -2 FRIOR-1  EUDGET  EST YR ENF  ITEN  DESCRIPTION FROFOSED  REVISED  ADORTED

CONT INGENCIES

00 039,165 O 0064700 OFERATING CONTINGENCIES 18,000 18,230 18,210

08 00 39,165 i TOTAL CONTINGENCIES 1,000 18,230 18,7%

S4B,272.97 975,982.12 714,080 0 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS 323,057 33,35 353

566,272,57  575,782.12 714,080 0 TATAL DEFARTHENT 323,857 33,857 323,89

199



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget

1985-1986

ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION

DEPT: Wastewater Treatment CODE: 063
CODE ITEM EXPLANATICON
64428 Transfer for Future Plant Reserve transfer for future plant
Inprovements improvements. $25,000
65833 Professional Services Wastewater treatment plant engineer
evaluation. $20,000
65880 Major Repairs and Replacements 1) Replace chlorine eguipment. 2)

110

Replace methane gas equipment. 3)
Repair MCC rcof. $12,800



CITY OF THE DALLES
Anmual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Wastewater Collection CODE: 067

FINANCE SOURCE

Wastewater collection primary revenues for 1985-86 will consist of the menthly
sewer use charge. Other revenues are inter-department use of men and equipment
and to a minor degree main extension charges.

PERSONNEL
(1/3) Director of Public Works/ (1/3) Assistant City Engineer
City Engineer (1/3) Account Clerk
(1/2) Assistant Director of Public Works (2) Equipment Operator III
SERVICES

The responsibility of the department is to operate, maintain, and expand the
collection system in an efficient and economical manner and in compliance with
federal and state laws and regulations as established by the Department of
Environmental Quality.

HIGHELIGHTS

This year, the wastewater collection budget has been separated from the
wastewater treatment facility budget. All administrative and overhead costs have
been included in the wastewater collection portion of the budget.

A new sanitary sewer main will be installed on Old Dufur Road out to Morton
Street. A long needed expansion.

A storm sewer separation project is scheduled in the downtown area.
The department will continue to develop a collection system maintenance program
using T.V. inspections and grouting to reduce infiltration of groundwater and

formulate a program for scheduled main up~grading and replacement as funds are
available.

111



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
19851986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater Collection CODE: 067

Actual Expenditures Current bstimated

1982-83 1983~-84 198485 Classification 1985-86
Personnel Services 125,399
Supplies & Maintenance 27,700
Transfers Cut 121,273
Capital OQutlay 73,450
Contingencies & Balance 55,321
TOTAL 403,143

112



CITY OF THE DALLES

ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Wastewater Collection
CCDE: 067
BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SALARY SALARY * PERSONNEL SERVICES *%k SALARY SALARY BODY

33% Public Works Dir/City Ing 2,763 11,052
50% Asst. Public Works Dir. 2,319 13,914
33% Asst. City Engineer 2,319 9,276
33% Account Clerk 5,211 4,844
2 Heavy Equipment Operators 1,808 43,392

TOTAL ROGULAR SALARIES 82,478

Part-time & Temporary 13,100

TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 13,100

PAYROLI, EXPENSES:

Long Term Disability 932

Social Security 5,816

Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 8,406

Industrial Accident 1,925

Retirement 18,640

Life Insurance 202

TOTAL PAYROLL EXPLENSES 35,921

113



R N I LR L LR TS Sy o) T UL Ju

REFRRED: 30 JULY 19783 DEFT: 0a7 5 OF 30 JULY i%495
WASTEMATER COLLECTION
FURD: 013
URSTENATER FUND

HOAPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGETH#3# & 00
ACTUAL EXPEMD. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 PRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROPDSED REVISED ADOFTED
RERUIRENENTS

PERSONAL SERWICES

A0 .00 D D 06060111 REGULAR SALARIES 82,770 82,478 87,478
00 .20 ) O 00&0112 PART TINE/TEMF/OT SALARIES 7,060 7,000 7,00
0 D0 D 0 0D0601YS PAYROLL EXFENSES 37,755 35,921 Lk

00 A0 0 9 TOTAL PERSONAL SERVICER 27,525 123,397 125,399

MATERIALS AND SERVICES

) A0 ) 0 0062301 OFFICE SUPPLIES S0 500 00
RhA 00 i 9 G0AZIEL SPECIAL DERT, SUPPLIES 9,200 7,200 7,000
D0 By 9 0 00623462 GEMERAL ERUIFMENT HAINTENANCE 1,500 1,000 1,500
20 00 6 0062383 SHOP TOOL & SHOP TOOL REPAIR 250 250 h

114



Lrung G 154

REFARED: 30 JULY 1933

ACTUAL EXPEND, HISTORY

FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1
00 00
RiY A0
09 00
00 00
00 A0
200 00
00 00
.09 .00
Rits 00
.00 .08

Libe Ul Irie BALLED

DEFTy 047

WASTEUATER COLLECTION
FUib: @13

WASTEMATER FUND

HAAPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL RUDGETH#
CURRENT LINE

GUDGET  EBT YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION FROPOSED
0 0 0002371 VEHICLE PARTS AND SERVICE & 400
0 0 0082372 TIRES AND TIRE REPAIR g 200
D 0 0042373 GAR, OIL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS 3,000
H 0 0042401 WATER & SENER REFUND ACCOUNT 300
0 D 0082405 COMMUNICATIONS 2,400
9 0 GOA2411 TRAINING & CONFERENCES 300
0 0 0062412 MEMBERSHIF DUES/SUBSCRIPTIONS 200
0 0 0042423 UTILITIES 1,650
0 0 D0&I43L CLOTHING -REM, REPAIR &CLEAM 400
0 0 TOTAL HATERIALS AMD SERVICES 30,700

115

FAGE 5%

A5 OF 30 JULY 1945

37,700

A OD



tPURY # 111

HEFARED: 30 JULY 1585

ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY

FRIGR-2

.09

00

W

00

PRIOR-1

00

00

.00

00

.00

A0

S0

49

0

00

CURRERT
BUDGET

LLIT UF IHE DALLES

DEFT: 047

WASTEWATER COLLECTION
FUND: 013

GHETEWATER FUND

FAXPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET#¥%
LINE
EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION

TRANSFERS OUT

0 0044711 TRANSFER TO GENERAL FUND

0 0064714 TRAN 70 8T & STORM SEWER FUND
f 0084730 TRAN TO UNENPLOYMENT INS RES
0 0054751 JOTNT USE OF HEN & EQUIFMENT
O 0064743 TR T0 WASTE COLLECT RESERVE

0 TOTAL TRANGFERS OUT

CAFITAL DUTLAY

§ O0AGT7Y SEMER MAIN-ASBEGSED BY OMNERS

0 0085804 NEW SEVER HRINS/REFLACEMEMT

9 0063311 PURCHASE NEW OFFICE EQUIPMEMT

0 0085833 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

1186

FROFOSED

4,773
7,500
1,000

50,000

19,900
10,000
450

1,500

A5 OF 30 JLY 1985

REVISED

4,773
9,500
1,000

50,000

20,000

19,000

19,000

£
e
L

—
wn
e
=3

f DO

ADOPTED



SPORT & 1 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGRE 61

tFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: D47 #5 OF 30 JULY 1985
WASTEWATER COLLECTION
FUND: 013
UASTEWATER FUND
$X4FROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGETH# fi 00
ACTUAL EXFERD. HISTORY CURRENT LIKE
Frlok-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EBT YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION FROFUSED REVISED EDOPTED
Rl 09 i 0 00438Q0 MAJOR REFAIRS & REPLACEMENTS 1,500 1,500 1,500
.00 09 0 G 0063881 CONTRACT/CONTRACTORS PAYHENTS &0, 400 al, 000 30,200
.00 00 g ) TOTAL CARITAL OUTLA 73,450 73,450 73,430
CONTINGENCIES
408 .00 ] O 0064700 GPERATING CONTINGENCIES 3,195 35,321 SE, 4™
00 .00 0 0 TOTAL CONTINGENCIES 90,175 WS G0y 371
B 00 9 i TOTAL REQUIREMENTS 403,143 403,343 403,143
R .00 9 0 TOTAL DEPARTHENT 403,143 403,143 453,143
0H, 0T S2aNEEAT TL§.03 £ TEYAL FUND 727,000 72,90 7.9

117



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION

DEPT: Wastewater Collection CCDE: 067
CODR ITEM EXPLANATION
647 Transfer to Equipment Reserve Reserve transfer for future equipment

needs. $20,000

65806 New Sewer Mains/Replacement Repair old sanitary sewer mains.
$10,000
65881 Cornttract/Contractors Payments T.V. inspection of sewer lines,

grouting, root control, separate storm
sewers from sanitary downtown.
$50,000

118



UKD F 111

REFARED: 30 JULY 1945

ACTURL EXPEMD, HISTORY

FRI0R-2

17,239.83
46,199.92
199,500, 06

5,000,40

5, 000,50

FRIOR-L

7,034.54
36,326.71
{25,000,00
6,500.00

5,500.00

Liil U iHe DALLES

DEPT: 054

STREET & STORM SEMER KEVENUE
FUND; 014

STREET & STURM SEWER FUND

FEAFROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET##
CURRENT LINE
WUDGET BT YR EXF el DESCRIPYION

REVENUE

OTRER REVERUE

70,000 0 (040101 LEGINNING BALANCE
4,000 0 0040571 INTEREST OH HAVINGS

130,000 0 DO4IZZI STATE MATOR VEHICLE FUMND
7,400 ¢ 0043227 SAIF REFUNDS
§,000 ¢ 0044394 HISC. SALES AND SERVICE
30,000 G 00443975 INTERDEFARTHMENT REVERUE

200,000 O 0045732 REC’D-GENERAL REVEMUE SHARING
7,500 O 0047712 RECEIVED FROM WATER FUHD
7,500 O 0047743 REC'D FRON WASTE WATER TRTHT.

119

FROFOSED

76,000
5,000

213,000

FAGE 62

A5 OF 30 JULY 1945

76,000
5,000
213,000
0

7,500

5,090

70,000

<

74000
50,000

234,500



EFORT § 11

HEFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND. RIGTORY

FRIOR=2 PRIDR-1
107,592.98  106,340.57
50,285, 57 30,641.69
16,366.00 .00
.00 .00
£9,000,00 .09
00 1,139.00
S73,551,43  560,872.43
57355043 500,872.63

CiTY OF THE DALLES

DEFT:

054

STREET & STORM SEMER REVENUE

FUND:

014

STREET & STORH SEWER FUND

#ARPROPOSED/REVIBED/F INAL BUDGET 3

CURRENT

BUDGET  EST YR EXP
95,000 D
25,000 9

0 0

30,000 4

0 0

0 D

492,500 H
472,500 0

LINE
ITEM  DESCRIFTION

Q0A771% REC/D FROM | CENT GAL GAS TAX

0047720 REC'D FROG THPROVEMENT FUND
Q047721 REC'D FROM BFEC STORM SEMER
Q047725 REC'D FROM EQUIP RESERVE
0047726 REC'D FROM QTS0 FED FUND

0048727

ENGINEER TIME ON ASSESSED PJT

TOTAL OTHER REVENUE

TOTAL REVENUE

FROPOSED

100,006
25,@6@

0

724,000

REVISED

100,000

25,000

PRGE &3

& Gl

ADOFTED

<



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Street & Storm Sewer CODE: 064

FINANCE SOURCE

The Street and Storm Sewer Departments prime revenue for 1985-86 consist of the
City's local share cof the State gasoline tax, the local one-cent per gallon gas
tax, and federal revenue sharing*. Other revenue sources not predictable are
interdepartment use of men and equipment and receipts from local street
improvement projects where public works personnel and equipment. are utilized to
perform the construction.

*At this writing it appears federal revenue sharing will be discontinued after

1986.
PERSCNNEL
(1/3) Director of Public Works/ (1/3) Account Clerk
City Engineer (1) Equipment Maintenance Foreman
(1/2) Assistant Director of Public Works (1) Equipment Operator II
(1/3) Assistant City Engineer (4) Equipment Operator II
SERVICLES

Responsibilities of this department include street and storm sewer maintenance,
street painting, construction and reconstruction of streets and sewers, support
staff for other departments or agencies, for fire control or emergency flood work
and winter street maintenance, i.e. sanding and plowing.

HIGHLIGHTS

Widening work began on Brewery Grade in 1984-85. Another phase of this project
will be accomplished in 1985-86.

Preparations are being made for the replacement of the West 9th Street and West
Gth Street bridges over the next few years.

Some major street rehabilitation will be accomplished in 1984-85, however, the
outlook for 1985-86 and future years is not good.

CONCERNS

Other funding sources for street maintenance must be secured. Major street and
storm sewer rehabilitation projects needing tc be accomplished exceed available
revenues. Money is not being saved, the costs are only being delayed.

121



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985~1986

SUMMARY

DEPT: Street & Storm Sewer CCDE: 064
Actual Expenditures Current Estimated
198283 1983-84 1984-85 Classification 1985-86
229,209 251,346 264,570 Personnel Services 263,333
136,592 88,228 94,325 Supplies & Maintenance 109,825
- 4,525 4,525 Debt Service 4,525
89,379 90,238 69,000 Transfers Out 159,000
12,859 38,056 246,251 Capital Cutlay 173,600
- - 13,829 Contingencies & Balance 13,987
468,039 472,393 692,500 TOTAL 724,270

122




CITY OF THE DALILES
ANNUAL BUDGET

DEPT: Street, Storm & Sewer

CODE: 064
BUDGET FOR NEXT YEAR: 1985-86
PRESENT PROPOSED ADOPTED BY
MONTHLY ANNUAL MONTHLY ANNUAL GOVERNING
SALARY SALARY * PERSONNEL SERVICES Rk SALARY SALARY BODY
33% Public Works Dir/City Eng 2,763 11,052
50% Asst. Public Works Dir. 2,319 13,914
33% Asst. City Engineer 2,319 9,276
33% Account Clerk 1,211 4,644
1 Heavy Equipment Cperator 1,808 21,696
3 Equipment Operators 1,739 62,604
1  Equipment. Maintenance Supvr 1899/1970 23,214
1 Equipment Operator 1478/1546 18,348
TCOTAL REGULAR SALARIES 164,748
Part—-time & Temporary 20,000
TOTAL PART-TIME & TEMPORARY 20,000

PAYROLL EXPENSES:

Long Term Disability 1,864
Social Security 13,040
Health, Vision & Dental Ins. 18,076
Industrial Accident 9,537
Retirement 37,278
Life Insurance 434
TOTAL PAYROLL EXPENSES 80,229

123



REFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 064 A5 OF 30 JULY 19u5
STREET AND STORM SEMER
FUND: €14
STREET & STORM SEWER FUND

FREPROPUSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET##¥ A 00
ACTUAL EXPEND, HIBTORY CURRENT LINE
PRIDR-Z FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EBT YR EXP $TEW  DESCRIPTION FROFOSED REVISED ADOFTED
REQUIREHENTS

FERSONAL SERVICCS

164,238.71  167,726.18 149,248 0 0040111 REGULAR SALARIES 167,862 163,104 143,104

2,697,409 10,171.42 13,190 0 0060112 PART TIME/TEMP/UT SALARIES 20,906 20,000 20,600

£2,773.50 73,947.97 82,122 0 0060195 FAYRDLL EXFENSES 74,402 80,229 a6,229

009,709.20  RL,345.57 284,570 D TOTAL PERSOMAL SERVICES 24460 283,333 243,313

MATERIALS AND SERVICES

511,983 906,97 1,100 0 0062301 OFFICE SUPPLIES 1,100 1,100 £,100

19,743,125 26,413.00 27,225 § 0042331 SPECIAL DEPT. SUPRLIES 26,750 26,750 26,77
11,734,34 G0 D D 0047332 STREET OTSC FOR SIGNS 0 D
13,458, 2 7,846.9% 4 O 0O&234L CONSTRUCTION SUFFLITS g 6

124



EPORT & 144 CITY BF 7uE DALLES FABE 45

REFARED; 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: 044 A5 OF 30 2oy 158
STREET AND 570RH SEWER
FUND: 014
STREET & STomy SEWER Funp
H5‘F‘R‘DF—‘DSE[}/F:EU]SED/I-'IH&‘:I_ BUDGE T s A G0
ACTUAL EXPEND, RISTORY CURRERT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRIOR~1 BUDGET o7 YREXF  ITEM DESCRIFTION FROFOSED REVISE AB0PTED
5, 983.24 1,755,461 4,700 G poézasy BLDG & GROUNDS MAINTENANCE 27,075 27,075 27,075
14,800.19 10,94 0 0 0082340 GENERAL EQUIPMENT HAINTENANCE b 0 g
1,143.15 3,365,520 3,130 0 0062383 sHop TOGL & suoe TOOL REFAIR 3,500 3,509 3,500
5,976,23 21,332.12 14,000 0 éran VEHICLE FaRTS RND SERVICE 15,000 1%,000 153,000
2,547,820 1,437.02 3,000 0 0062372 TigEs AND TIRE REFAIR 3,500 3,506 3,500
23,884.05 19,054.55 28,000 0 0042373 GA5, I, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS 20,099 20,300 0,409
2,233.84 2,545.80 4,000 0 0062405 COMMUNTCAT ONg 3,560 3,500 3,500
305,66 342,74 1,200 0 0042414 TRATHING 4 CONFERENCES 1,209 1,%9 1,200
125,14 139,83 230 0 D0g2412 HEMBERSHIF DUES/SUBSCE?PT}UHS aaf 250 259
4, 257,03 9,733.02 4,500 0 0062423 UTILITIES 6,004 4,800 8,005
1,3%8.22 1,7946.54 1,700 0 0062431 CLOTHING -NEW, REPAIR &CLERN 1,750 1,780 H
00 80 g 0 0062400 HICREFILKING 0 0 i

9



JFURT F 111

REFARED: 30 JULY 1935

ACTUAL EXFEMD, HISTORY

FRIDR=2 PRIOR-1
136,592.14 £9,229.34
00 4,525,00

00 §,525,90
78,8%0.00 75,000.00
.00 .00
19,000.00 .00
40,468,57 £3,893.73
40 1,344.45

: .00
%9,378.57 96,238.18

CURRENT
BUBGET

26,500

2,500

=1

40,000

49,000

Lt oy

DEFT:

fia4

IHiE URLLED

STREET AND STORM SEUER

FUND:

014

STREET & STORM SEMER FUND

RRAPROPOGED/REVISED

0

JFIHAL CUDGETH# %
LINE

ITEN  DESCRIPTION

TOTAL BATERTALS AND SERVICLS

DERT SERVICE

TOTAL DERT SERVICE

TRANSFERS QUT

0064711 TRANSFER TO GENERAL FUHD
0064730 TRAN TO UNEMPLOYKENT INS RES
0064737 TRAN TO PUERLIC MDRKS RESERVE
Q064750 JDINT USE OF HEN & EQUIPHMEN
0064745 TRANSFER PROFESSICRAL SERVICE

OOATRA TROT0 BRIDGE SEFLATENENT FUND

TOTAL TRANSFERS cUT

PROFOSED

109,825

ene

EIFJJ..L(

2,500
20,000
50,000

6

)

42,008

{59,000

FRGE &6

A5 OF 30 JULY 1993

REVISED

109,825

£nT
» vl

159,000

5

i 90

<>

ADOPTED

40,500

159,000



EFURED § 111 CITY OF THE DALLES PREE &7

WEPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: (644 fS OF 30 JULY 784
STREET AND STORM SEMER
FLND: 014
STREET & STORM SEWER FUMD

SHEPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL GUDGET#44 fDD
ACTURL EXPEND. HISTORY CURREHNT Lin
Fil0R-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION ‘ FROPOSE REVISED KDGRTED

CARITAL DUTLAY

00 124,03 7,500 0 00AGBO7 CONST NEY STORM SEHER HATHS a0, 600 30,960 a0, 009
00 1,030,463 o090 0 0O06GBIL PURCHASE NEW OFFICE ERUIPHENT 309 200 300
2,808.96 00 71,300 0 0055828 OTHER MACHINERY & EGUIFMENT 18,900 18,009 13,009
00 1,183.45 7,600 0 008533 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES o, 000 00 EPRAHS
00 26,420,783 a8, 251 O 00a5E41 STREET CONSTRUCTION SUFPLIES 15,660 15,000 15000
0 4,415,584 20,000 & 0065842 STREET CNST-ASSESSED FJTS 25,000 25,000 25,900
By S0 ] O 0065830 MAJOR REFAIRS & RKEFLACEMENTS 0 i g
L) 4,081.24 94,500 0 0045B31 COMTRACT/CONTRACTORS FAYMENTS b, 300 50,300 60,309

2,458.90 38,050.47 246,25 0 TOTAL CAPITAL OUTLAY 173,600 173,500 173,504

L27



SPORT § 1l CiTY OF THE DALLES PRGE 48

-3

BEFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: D& A5 OF 30 JULY 1585
STRE

Fldb: 01

:‘,

STREET & ST0RM SEMER FURD

4
ET AND STORH SEWCR
4

$44PROPOSED/REVISED/F 1AL FUDBETH* & 00
ACTUAL EXPERD. HISTORY  CURRENT LINE

FRIOR-2 PRIGR-L BUDGET  E5T YR EXF VIEW  DESCRIFTION FROFOSED REVISED ADOFTED

CONTINGERCIES

00 00 13,82 0 0066900 OFERATING CONTINGEHCIZS 12,56 13,717 13,70
00 00 13,829 0 TOTAL CONTINGENCIES 12,586 13,717 13,717
168,038.80  472,392.78 492,500 0 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS 724,000 724,000 724,000
40,038.80  472,392.78 492,500 0 TOTAL DEPARTHENT 724,000 724,000 724,000
468,038,810  472,392.78 492,500 0 TOTAL FUND 724,000 724,000 724,000

128



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION

DEPT: Street & Storm Sewer

CODE

ITEM

CODE: 064

EXPLANATION

62352

64737

64765

65807

65828

65881

Street and

Building Maintenance

Transfer to Fublic Works Reserve

Transfer Professional Service

Construction New Storm Sewer Mains

Other Machinery and Equipment

Contract/Contractor Payments

1) Re-rcof main shop building - roof
is 20 years old and leaking. 2)
Install new shop lighting - improve
lighting, reduce energy costs.
$22,200

Reserve transfer for future eguipment
replacement. $20,000

Reserve transfer for future bridge
replacement W. 9th and W. 6th at Mill
Creek. 1560,000*

Install storm sewer on 0Old Dufur Road
from Thompson to Morton St. (contract)
$50,0QQF

Replace 1966 Ford 10 yd dump truck
with newer used diesel 6-8 yard truck.
$18,000

1) Brewery Grade widening, Phase 11
Scherrer property. 2) Construct new
wheel chair ramps. 3) Storm sewer
camera inspection and grouting. 4)

‘State-Highway street striping.

1$60,300 )

Storm Sewer 1985-86 Budget Ceneral Revenue Sharing Projects.

Project Summary

Bridge replacement proegram
Re-roof public works shop

0ld Dufur Road storm sewer
Brewery grade widening phase II

[esBE N o) BN & ) B SN RIS B

Total cost GRS projects 1985-86

129

Install new lighting public works shop
Purchase (1) 6-8 yard dump truck

City cost, defective sidewalk projects (wheel chair ramps)
Street and storm sewer maintenance

$234,500



ALFURT # 114

PREPARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT
FRIOR~2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET
73,630.00 27,556.30 24,734
1,%04,00 1,952.07 2,000
00 1, 454,00 0
] 30.00 )
8,384,100 7,383.10 9,200
§,150,50 250,99 1,200
3,031.54 2,433,85 28,000
5,000.00 00 9
D0 11,500,00 20,008

LUIY Uk fHE DPALLES

3

PORT - REVENUE
i

ATRFORT FUND

RRAPROFOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET*##

LINE
STYROEX®  ITEM  DESCRIPTIGH PROFOSED
REVERUE
OTHER REVERUE
0 0040101 EEGINNING BALANCE 0
0 0040321 INTEREST ON SAVINGS 0
O 0044256 GRANTS G
0 0044374 MIBC. SALES AND GERVICE 50
0 D044531 RENTAL RECEIFTS 12,700
O 0044532 AGRICULTURE & INCOME 250
O 0044533 SALE OF GASOLINE 99,000
0 0044401 LAND SALES 0
0 0047711 REC’D FROM GENERAL FUMD 0

139

A5 OF 35

REVISE

<o

59,000

b

12,700

oy



LUkt # 111 CITY OF THE DALLES FAGE 70

WEFARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFT: 055 A5 OF 30 SULY 1985
ALIRFORT - REVENUE
FUMD: 015
AIRFORT FUND

SHFROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET*H¥ f 00
ACTUAL EXFEND, HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRI0R-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET ~ EST YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIFTION FROPOSED REVISED ROGFTED
43,059.64 oh,762.12 84,634 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE 72,009 73,000 000
43,057.64 o, 762,12 84,4634 0 TOTAL REVENUE 72,004 72,060 72,000



CITY OF THE DALLES
Annual Budget
1985-1986

COMMENTARY

DEPT: Alrport CODE: 065

FINANCE SOURCE

The Airport is a self supporting facility with revenues for operation and
maintenance derived from building and ground rentals, aviation fuel sales, and
any carry over balance. Rental income is generated from several sources:
monthly tiedowns and hangar rentals, the Federal Aviation Administration (FAA),
Maranatha Aviation, Ltd., Chuck's Air Service, a grazing lease, and a vegetation
cutting permit.

PIERSONNET,

Ceneral operations and airport management are maintained by contract with an
airport manager. General finance administration remains with the City Manager.

SERVICES

The Dalles Municipal Airport is operated for the general public and provides an
airfield facility for general aviation purposes. Based aircraft are owned by
pilots from Wasco, Sherman, and Deschutes Counties in Oregon, and Klickitat and
Skamania Counties in Washington.

Aircraft landing facilities are provided free of charge to all aircraft. Fueling
is accomplished from ready supplies of three grades of aviation gasoline.
Mechanical services are provided by Chuck's Air Service. The Flight Service
Station, operated by the FAA, provides up-to-date weather information, check—in
for flight plans, and general notices to airmen (NOTAMS).

HIGHLIGHTS

The Airport is currently operating under a new management concept. The City is
directly involved in the management of the facility and receives all the revenues
and meets all obligations. The-program—is_working quite-well, better—than—
antdeipated=—Revenues are-maintaining a steady increase-menth—to=month as—tie-
weater im}_Ji_ VEST

Efforts will further be directed toward economic development this fiscal year.
The preparation work required for this will be funded out of airport revenues.



cPORT # i1

REPARED: 30 JULY 1933

ACTUAL EXPERD. HISTORY

FrloR-2

L0

\
L0

PRIOR-1

A
1))

R

00

CURREN
RUDGET

200
0

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEFT: 085
AIRFORT

FGND: 015
AIRFORT FUND

HAXPROPOSED/REVISED /FINAL BUDGETH#
LINE
EST YR EXF  ITEM

DESCRIFTICH

i

At
rm

FEQL

=0

EHENT!

PERSONAL SERVICLS

0 0060112 PART TIME/TEMF/OT SALARIES
0060195 PAYROLL EXPENSES

0 TOTAL FERSCHAL SERVICES

CONTRACTUARL SERVICES

O 0051215 CONTRACTUAL SERVICES

0 TOTAL CONTRACTUAL SERVICES

133

FAGE 71

A5 OF 30 JULY 1945

PROPDSED REVISED
{ H
D ]

i} 4
14,000 16,000
14,000 16,000

& 00

ADOPTED

()

16,000

16,000



N I S TR T [ piEi L

REPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: 0435 A5 OF 30 JULY 1945
AIRPORT
FURD: 015
HIRPORT FUND

HARPROFOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET#¥# R
ACTUAL EXFEND. KISTORY CURRENT LIHE
FRIOR-2 CRTOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR LR ITEX  DESCRIPTION FREPOSED REVISED ADOFTED

HATERIALS AND SERVICES

83,74 137.31 o009 § 0062331 SPECIAL DEPT. SUPPLIES 0 9 B

b, 643,52 1,558,114 7,000 0 00462352 BLDG & GROUNDS MAINTENANCE 1,009 5,000 Ly 000
00 48.05 o0 0 0082E7L VEHICLE PARTS AND SERVICE 0 0 i

§0.40 10.00 38,060 0 0082373 GAS, BIL, DIEBEL, LUBRICANTS 25,509 25,500 25,500
167,83 283.07 400 § 0042505 COMAUNICATIONS 00 500 e
416,70 25.00 100 § 2062411 TRAINING & CONFERENHCES 00 ol a0
1,560.00 1,900.00 7,000 § 0042421 IMSURANCE AND BORDS 6,000 4,000 b,
4422085 4,783.57 4,000 0 0062473 UTILITIES 3,000 2,000 4,000
o811 896,45 11,500 0 0062481 WISCELLAREQUS EXPENSES 300 300 ALY
14,209.39 7.241.54 b4, 850 0 TOTAL MATERTALS MHD SERVICES 36,000 34,000 36,000

134



REFARED: 30 JULY 1983

ACTUSL EXPERD. HIGTORY

HI10R-2

FRIOR-1

00

23,800,00

DEFT: 065
AIRFORT

FURD: 015
ALRFORT FUND

RARpROPCGIED/REVISED/F INAL BUDDET#s#
CURRERT LINE
BUDBET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION

TRAENGFERS DUT

f 0 0064741 TRANSFER TO GENERAL FUMD

9 0 TOTAL TRANSFERS OUT

CAFITAL DUTLAY

8,000 O 0045303 IHPROV TO BLDG OR ADDITIONG
{ 0 0D4EB1O AIRFORT FED/ST HATCHING FUNDS
7,784 0 0065828 OTHER MACHINERY & EQUIPNENT
) 0 0055864 ALRPORT WATER FJT
17,784 0 TOTAL CAFITAL DUTLAY

135

A5 OF 30 JULY 1%45

& D0

PROFOSED  REVISED  ADOFTED
0,000 20,000 20,000
20,000 20,000 20,000

0 0 )
0 5 0
0 0 )
0 0 b
0 0 0



ERORT # 11

WEPARED: 30 JULY 1983

ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTDRY

FRIOR-2

.00

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEFT: 065
ATRFORT

FUND: 015
AlRPORT FUND

X#4PROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET##%

CURRENT
FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXF DESCRIFTION
CONTINGENCIES

09 0 0 0066700 OPERATING CONTINGENCIES

00 9 0 TOTAL CORTINGENCIES
31,741,548 4,584 0 TOTAL REGUIRCHENTS
31,741,348 34,854 0 TOTAL DEFARTHENT
31,741.56 94,504 0 TOTAL FURD

136

72,000

FRGE 74

AS OF 30 JULY 1985

0

72,000

0

TE000



wl IV W A aa

REFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTURL
Fi10R-2

201,010.60

20¢,016.00

07,602.00
9,906.99
7,817.00
4,500,00

.00

ad
o1

i)
o]

AFEND. HISTORY

FRIBR-1

196,159.34

CURRENT
BUDGET

100,000

VA W e Rkl

DEFT: 0354
PRRES & RECREATION REVENUE
FURD:s 014

FARKS AND RECREATION FUND

¥4EPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET#xx

LINE
ST YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIFTION
REVEHUE
TAYES

0 0040010 TAXES FOR CURRENT YEAR

i TOTAL TAXES

THER REVENUE

0 0040101 BEGINNING BALAMCE

O 0040102 RACK THAEZS AND INTEREST

0 O040LZL INTEREST ON BAVINGS

<

D04E211 COUNTY SRARE OF RECREATION

0 0043227 SKIF REFUNDS

G 0044235 GIFTS AND DORATIONG

137

0

4

G

P UL id

AS OF 30 JULY 1945

& 00

mn"

REVISED ADGFTED

Lle)

)

<D

D

L)

<>



tPORT & 111

REPARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND. HIBTORY

FE10R-2

239.71
649.25
{,693.75

PRIOR-1

550,00
00

1,727.25

375,443.57

LIt our Nk pnsLL
DEFT: 054

FARKS & RECREATION REVENUE
014

FARKS AND RECREATION FUHD

FUHD:

FEEROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL RUDGET#¥#

K5 OF 30 JULY 1743

CURRERT LIHE
BUDGET  EST YR EXP 1TEM  DESCRIFTION FROFOSED REVISED AOOFTED
3,500 0 0044330 ATHLETIC FIELD USER FEES D 9

17,000 0 (044331 PARK NATATORIUN FEES G 0 2
0 0 0044394 H1GD. SALES AND SERVICE 0 0 0
1,320 0 0044520 PARKS SHI BUS REVENUE 9 0 9
1,000 0 0044531 RENTAL RECEIFTS 0 f i
147,320 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE 0 ) 0
343,456 0 TOTAL REVENUE ] 0 3

13¢



SrUnd § AL LIIY UF iHE DRLLES PRGE 77

SEFARED: 30 JULY 1785 DEFT:  (Q6b #5 OF 30 JULY 1985
FARKS AND RECREATION
FUND: 014
FARMS AND RECREATION FUND

XAFROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET#4% A 0O
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTOR CURRENT LINE
PiI0K=2 PRIOR-1  BUDGET  EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROPOSED  REVISED  ADOFTED
REBUIREHENTS

FERSORGL BERVICYS

41,542.00 40, 208,00 44,008 0 00&D111 REGULAR SALARIES 0 0 0
49,407 .67 43,734.45 31,638 G 0040112 PART TIHE/TERP/CT SALARIES 9 9 0
18,0082 22,203.18 26,978 D Q06015 PAYROLL EXPENSES ] 0 0
109,253,479 105,665,466 124,024 0 TOTAL FERSONAL SERVICES 0 f 9

HATERTALS AND SERVICES

i,399.18 802,67 600 0 0042301 OFFICE SUPPLIES 0 0 0

12,5500 4,073,587 4,130 & 0062321 CHEMICAL & LAE SUPRLIES 0 0 4
4,614.87 T,261.99 4,247 O 0082331 SPECIAL DERT. SUPFLIES 0 0 &
R S 13,473.40 11,850 G Q0AZ3EE ELDG & GROUNDS MATHTENANCE 0

1329



FURT # L1t

JEPRRED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND. RISTORY

FRIOR-2

4,035.34
503,48
45,23

1,430,149

{,509.40

PRIOR-1

7,421.27

1,446.64

~ud

423.5

.00
2,500.00
=0,578.73

343,94

CURRENT
BUDGET

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEPT:

(64

FARKS AND RECREATIOW

FUND:

014

FARKS AND RECKEATINON FUND

¥¥EPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL RUDGETx¥

3T YR EXP

LINE
TTEH

DESCRIPTION

0052342 GEMNERAL EGUIFHENT MAINTENANCE
0067371 VEHICLE FARTS AHD SERVICE
0062372 TIRES AND TIRE REFAIR

0042373 GRS, QIL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS
0062405 COMMUMICATIONS

0042411 TRAINING & COMFERENCES
0062412 MEMHERSHIF DUES/SURSCRIPTIONS
0062421 INSURANCE AND BOMDS

00562423 UTILITIES

0062431 CLOTHING ~NEW, REPATR ACLEAN

TCTAL HATERIALS AHD SERVICES

FROFOSED

A5 OF 30 JULY 1945

REVISED

<>

)

b

0

0

A DO

ADCFTED



eFURT F 111 CIIY UF [HE DALLER FAGE 77

REFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 066 85 OF 30 JULY 1949
PARKS AND RECREATION
FUND: 016
PARKS AND KECREATION FUND
¥HFROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET*#¥ A 00
ACTUAL EXPEND. MISTORY CURRENT LINE
PII0R-2 PRI0K-1 RUDGET  EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROPUSED  REVISED  ADGPTED

TRANSFERS GUT

00 6, 0346.00 39,500 0 0043719 TRANSTER TO CARITAL FUND 0 g !
00 09 2,500 0 0044730 TRAN 7O UNEMFLOYMENT INS RES ] 0 9
00 5,836,400 42,000 D TOTAL TRANSFERS QUT D 0 )

CAFLTAL DUTLAY

R 00 0 0 0065801 PURCHASE LAND/ELDG/EASEHENTS 0 B D

6,774, 2 13,500.00 55,000 0 0045303 INPROV TO BLOG OR ADDITIONS i 0 9

00 .00 D 0 006SB14 BRD GRANT-THOMP PARK INMPROVE 0 0 4

3,410.00 .00 o 0 0045323 PURCHASE NEW TRUCK/PTCKUFS 0 0 9

.00 2,450,00 5,300 0 0065828 OTHER MACHINERY & EQUIFMENT b ? i

.0 .00 i 0 0045880 MAJOR REPAIRS & REFLACEMENTS 0 0 3
15,3084, 24 22,9504 46,300 ¥ TOTAL CAPTTAL OUTLAY g

141



R S T Liid Wi INe UPLLEO AL dy

REFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 064 #5 OF 30 JULY 1965
PARKS AND RECREATION
FUND: 014
PARKS AND RECREATION FUND

*¥APROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDBET#%# ARG
ACTUAL EXFEMD. HISTORY CURKENT LINE
FRI0R-2 rRI10R-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEW  DESCRIFTION FROFDSED REVISED ADOFTED
CONTINGENCIES
00 00 11,774 0 0044900 OFERATING CONTINGEWCIES 0 0 0
00 0 11,7748 ) TOTAL CONTINGENCIES 0 0 9
203,364,867 247,731.42 343,486 0 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS { 0 G
203,364,867 227,731,412 383,404 b TOTAL DEFARTHENT 0 4 b
203,364,467 227,931.42 343,448 4 TOTAL FURD 0 { 3

142



FURGD # 111

REPARED: 39 JULY 1985

ACTURL EXFEND. HISTORY

108~

A0

FRIOR-1

00
1,794,648
71,970.00
31,970,00

55,234,438

CURRENT
BUDGET

30,000
b

0

30,000

CLEY UF THE DALLES

DEFT:

057

ENERGY

FUND:

017

ENERGY FUND

HNAPROFOSED/REVISED/F IHAL BUDGETxx

LINE
1TEH

DESCRIFTLION

REVENUE

OTHER REVEMUE

0040101 REGINNING RALANCE
0040521 INTEREST On SAVINGSR
0047711 REC/D FROM GENERAL FUND

0047712 RECETVED FROM WATER FUND

TOTAL OTHER REVENUE

TOTAL REVENUE

143

4,300

RS OF 39

REWIGE

PAGE 81

L

-

1935

| ==
&=

400

ADOFTED

) LTATAY
o, 006

5,000



crust # 114 LTl UF ({IE URiLED FRUE 8¢

REFARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFY: 0% A5 O 30 JULY thas
EMERGY
Fudb: 017
ERERGY FUND

¥EAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL EUDBETH4¥ A 0O
ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE .
PRIOR=2 PRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROFDSED  REVISE ABOFTED
REQUIRENENTS

FERSONAL SERVICES

00 10,736.47 9 0 0060111 REGULAR SALARIES 0 0 0

0 10,735.49 0 0 TOTAL PERSONAL SERVICES 0 0 9

MATERIALS AMD SERVICES

090 359.%5 ) 0 0062301 OFFICE SUPPLIES 9 0 &
.00 00 0 0 0052405 COMHUNICATIONS 0 1} i
iy 44,00 ¢ 0 0082411 TREINING & CONFERENCES it 9 ¢
0 374,95 & 0 TOTAL HATERIALS AND SERVICES 0 i i

144



B CITY OF THE DALLES FABE 43

EFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 057 A5 OF 30 JULY 1985
ENERGY
FUND: 017
ENERGY FUMD

AHAPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET#% & 00
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRIOR~1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED

CAFITAL DUTLAY

00 10,536.76 30,000 0 0065835 SPEC STUDIES/ENGINEERING SERY 5,000 3,000 5,000
.00 10,386,746 30,006 0 TOTAL CAPITAL QuTLay 5,000 5,000 3, 000
CONTINGERCIES
R .00 g b 0066700 OFERATING COMTINGENCIES 0 ] 0
e 00 i 0 TOTAL CONTINGENCIES G 0 J
00 21,718.19 30,000 i TOTAL RERUIREMENTS 5,000 3,006 5,000
B0 21,718,270 30,080 f TETAL DEPARTRENT 5,000 9,000 2,000
Bl 1,718.20 30,044 ) TOTAL FUmD 3,000 5,960 %, 000

145



Lruni % 41l

HEPARED:T 30 JULY 1983

ACTURL EXPEND. WISTORY

FrIOR-2

340,821.00
.00

.00

.00
87,448.88

293.95

FRIOR-1

563,204,30-
.00
.00
.00

41,429.50

CURRERT
BUDGET

0

143,000
325,00
£0,000
2,000
50,000
3,000

0

LiiT UF ik VALLLED

DEPT: 070

1HPROVEHENT

FUND: D20

THFROVEHENT FUND

*AXPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET##¥

LN
LTEN

D040101

0040521

0044500

0044501

DO45E0L

0045502

0045503

0045304

0043508

DESCRIFTION

REVENUE

OTHER REVENIE

BEGINNING BALANCE

INTERERT O SAVINGS

SALE OF WARRANTS

SALE OF RODRDS

THPROY PRINCIPAL NON-BONDED

THPRAY INTEREST NOW-BONDED

THPROV PRINCIPAL BONDED

IMPROY INTEREST ON BORDED

THFROV TRAN FROM DTHER FUNDS

146

0

!
144,000
200,964
50,000
2,000
100,000
3,000

0

FRSE B4

f5 OF 30 JULY 1985

0

0
144,000

e
209,000

50,000

0

A 0o

SDGPTED

g
144,000
200,000
50,000
7,00
100,000

cn LA
o, 0g



EFURT § 111

“WEFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTURL EXPERD. HISTORY

FRIOR-Z

§,000.00

4,000.60

FRICR-1

324,393.04-

324,393.04-

3,000.00

3,000.00

L o
?;d 5

]
~J
cn
en
()

CURRENT
EUDGET

613,000

613,000

4,000

4,000

2,000
D)

CiTY OF THE DALLES
DEFT: 070
| HPROVEHENT
029
JHFROVENENT FUND

FUND:

#AAPROPOSED/REVISED/FIRAL BUDGET#H*
LINE
ITEW  DESCRIFTION

0 TOTAL GTHER REVEMUE
] TOTAL REVENUE
REGUIREHENTS

CONTRACTUAL SERVICES

0 0061201 REGULAR AUDITING

0 TOTAL CONTRACTUAL SERVICES

HATERTALS AND SERVICES

0 0052141 MOTICES & PUBLICATIONS

G 0062474 BOND SMLE [XFENSES

i TOTAL MATERTALS AND SERVICES

147

FROPDSED

544,000

FAGE 85

S OF 30 JULY 1985

REVISED

546,000

fi 00

ALOFTED

946,000

B,0na



ACTUAL EXPEND, &

Fr10R-2

136,304,073

00
.08

14,456.93

17,040.47

ARRENT
BUDGET

L=

0

fi

{

CITY OF THE DALLES

DEFT: 079

FUND: 029

FAPROVENFRT

IPROVEMENT FUND

ARFROPOSED/REVISED/F IHAL BUDGET#xx

EST YR EXF

0

0

0

¥

LINE

TRANSFERS Ot

0064401 TRAN TO DERT FUND-FRIN DUE
D064402 TREN T0 DEET FLND INT DUE
0064604 TRAN TO .1, TR STREET/SFYER
0064712 TRANSFER TO WATER FUND
0064713 TRAN TO 5EW TRTHT/SANT SENER

0064746 TRANSFER ENGINEERING SERVICES

TOTRL TRANSFERS U7

148

FROPOSED

0

0

o

AEYISED

0

0

0

<5

0

h

<o

e



DT L B S A

h

HEPARED: 30 JULY 1983

ACTUAL EXFEND. HIGTORY

FRIGR-2

R
00
00

18,564.,08

FRIOR-1

37,500.00

1,907.50

CURKENT
BUDGET

)
20,000
20,000
70,000
13,100

373,000
30,000

36,300

613,500

LIl] WP D UALLED

DEFT: 070

THPROVENERT

FLHD: D2

IHPROVENENT FUND

ERRPROFOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET**#

EST YR EXF

)

LINE
ITEN

0065801

0065804

0065306

0045824

0065871

(06GRE2

0045883

065884

ERCRIFTION

CAFITAL CUTLAY

PURCHASE LAND/ELDG/EASENENTS

NEY WATER MATNS/REPLACEMENT

NEY SEYMER MATNS/REFLACEMERT
SIDEWALKS/CURES THPROVEMENTS
PROJECT ADWIMISTRATIVE COSTS
IHFROVENENTS BY CONTRACTORS
IHPROV FUND-NEY STREET CORST

IHFROV FUND-FJT ENGINEER COST

TETAL CAPITAL DUTLAY

TOTAL RERUIREMENTS

149

16,009
20,000
70,000
70,000
18,000

250,000
56,000
46,000

Fhbk  d/f

AG OF 30 JULY 19835

10,009
20,000
70,000
70,000

18,000
250,000

50,000

44,000

10,000
20,000
70,004
74,000
16,000

259,004



HEPARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY
FiICR~2 FRI0R-1

CURRERT
BLDGET

oEPT: 070

THPROVEMENT

FUND:z 020

THFROVERENT FURD

A¥APROFOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDRETHx¥

EST YR E¥P

LINE
ITEH

613,000

0

DERCRIPTION

TOTAL FUND

150

A5 OF 30 JULY 1983

& 0
PROPDSED  REVISED  ADOPTED
546,000 544,000 544,000



WEPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 071 45 OF 30 JULY 1985
FAA ATRFORT
FUND: 021
FFA AIRFORT GRANT FUND

RA%FROPOSED/REVISED/F IMAL BUDGET##s A 00
ACTUAL EXPEND. HIGTORY CURRENT LIKE
FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXF  ITEM  DEGCRIFTION PROPOSED REVIGED ADOPYED

REVEHUE

BTHER REVERUE

0 00 11,348 0 0040101 REGINNING BALANCE i b
A0 £37.50 400 0 0040521 INTEREST ON SAVINES 0 ]
00 121,877.35 3,000 0 0044254 GRANTS 0 Q
0 .00 0 O 0044395 [NTERDEFARTMENT REVENUE 0 O
00 22,500,00 1,644 O 0047717 RECYD FROM AIRFORT FUND ] &
D0 244,816.85 16,392 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE ) 2
Ry 244,816,853 16,37% 0 TOTAL REVERUE 0 g

151



WEPAREDs 20 JULY 1983

ACTUAL EXPEND, HISTORY

FRIOR-2

00

00

L0

FRIGR~1 EUDGEY  EST YR EXP ITEN  DEGCRIFTION
REQUIRERENTS
CONTRACTUAL BERVICES
.09 ] 0 0061201 REGULAR AUDITIRG
§.22 2,439 0 0041212 SFECIAL LEGAL SERVICES
9.22 2,489 9 TOTAL CONTRACTUAL SERVICES
WRTERIALS AND SERVICES
24.02 325 0 0062331 SPECIAL DEFT, SUPPLIES
24.07 3 0 TOTAL WATERIALS AND SERVICES

DEFT: 071
Fhn AIRPORT
FURD: D31
Fih AIRPORT GRANT FUND

$AXPROPOSED/REVISED/FTHAL BUDGETH#
CURRERT LINE

152

<

£S5 OF 20 JULY 1985

]

0

o]

b



REFARED: 30 J

n
L2 e

¥ 19835

ACTUAL EXFERD. RISTORY

FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1
00 725.12
00 55.53
.00 935,51
00 1,716.16
00 4,054, 32
00 227,485.00

N
R

Led
—
~d
fad
=
Cnd
)

CURRENT
BUDBET

4,350

]

DEFT: 07¢

Fih ATRPORT

FUND: £21

FFA AIRPORT GRANT FUND

HHAPROFOSED/REVIGED/F INAL BUDGET##%

0

LINE

TRANSFERS OUT

0044730 INSFECT FURD TRAN TG 5T FUND

0064731 INGPECT FUND TRAN TO SEW FUND

0044782 INSFECT FUND TRAN YMATER FUND

TOTAL TRANSFERS DUT

CAPITAL OUTLAY

0065031 ENGINEERING & DESIGH

004551 CONTRACT/CONTRACTORE PAYHENTS

TOTAL CAPITAL DUTLAY

PROFOSED

0

<

£S5 OF 30 JULY 1945

<>

0

0

A G0

<

(-]



Poreeras xS

‘WEFARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFT: 071 #5 OF 30 JULY 1985
FAA AIRPORT
FUND: 021
PR RIRFORT GRANT FUMD

FAAFROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL EUDGETS## )
ACTUAL EXPEND. HiSTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXF  ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROPOSED  REVISED  ADQFTED
CONT INGENCTES
00 .00 0 0 0066900 OFERATING CONTINGENCIES D 9 5
00 .00 0 0 TOTAL CONTINGENCIES 0 g 6
A0 233,488.72 16,392 0 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS 0 6 f
00 233,483.70 14,392 0 TOTAL DEPARTHEHT f 0 b
G0 233,408,72 18,393 9 TOTAL FUND 0 0 9



DEPT: 072
SFECIAL STORM SEWER
FUND: 022
SPECTAL SEWER SYSTEMS FUND

REPARED: 30 SULY 1985

RAEPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL RUDGETH¥%
ACTUAL EXFEND. RISTORY CURRERT LIHE
FRIOR~2 PRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEH

DESCRIFTION

REVENUE

(FHER REVERUE

30,854.00 00 D 0 0040101 REGIMMING BALANCE
3,740,249 G0 0 0 0040521 INTEREST ON SAVINGS

152,427.00 0D i O 0047210 REC/D FROM BFA

§92,253.28 a0 0 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE

192,753,23 .00

Lt
<

TOTAL REVERUE

155

0

]

A5 OF 30 JULY 1943

4 00

0 o
i 4
0 g



UKD 3 111

AEFARED: 30 JULY 1783

ACTUAL EXPEND. RISTORY

o RO
30,366.00 .00
30,866.00 00
10,566.00 .00
10,366.00 .00
30,866.01 0

CURRENT
RUDGET

o>

LY UF IHE URLLES

RERT: 072
SPECIAL STORM SEMER
FUND: 022
SFECIAL SEYER SYSTEMS FURD
¥UNPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL RUDGETH#¥*
LINE
EST YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROPOSED

REQUTRERENTS

TRANSFERS OUY

0 0064720 SFEC STORM FUND-TRANSFER OUT 0
) TOTAL TRAMNSFERS OUT ¢
0 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS 0
D TOTAL DEFARTHENT 0
0 TOTAL FUND 0

156

#5 OF 30

FAGE 95

JULY 1983

A 00
-REUISED_ “QDGPTED~
) 5

0 0

0 0

0 D

0 2



REFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY

FRIOR-2

70,777.87

~J

¥50,777.8

13,326,00
3,794.87
4,334.53

.00
113,439.40

(2n ATp D
m;,-a;.ﬁ.d@

PRIOR-1

00

44,762,535

G0

113,685.00

L0

DERT:

FUND:

CURRENT
BUDGET  EST

46,680

115,000

1hg 777

iy T
,L‘,!-..;U

073
DERT SERVICE
02%
DEET SERVICE FUND

YR EXP

>

(s ]

<

(e

EEXPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET*A%

LINE

ITEM  DEGCRIFTION
REVENUE
THKES

D040010 TAXES

FOR CURRENT YEAR

TOTAL TAXES

OTHER

REVENUE

0040101 BERIHNING BALANCE

0040102 BACK TAXES AND INTEREST

o0A0521 INTEREST DN SAVINGS

D047712 RECEIVED FROH WATER FURD

0048750 DERT FUND STATE DFFICE RENT

0048780 DERT FURD G0 WATER IHP EOHD

157

FROPOSED

240,000

5,050
4,000
4,500
48,24
115,000

123,000

AS OF 30 LY 1938

260,000

260,000

5,050
6,000
4,509
43,245

415, 060

260,000

5,09



LFURG # 144 L1IT UF IHE URLLES FAGE 94

“HEFARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFT: 073 B5 OF 30 JULY 1545
DERT SERVICE
FUND: 023
DEET SERVICE FUMD

EXAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET#¥# i L0
ACTUSL EXPEMD, HISTORY CURRENT LIKE
FRIGR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED
14,326.00 13,884.00 13,442 O DOABTRY DEET FUND TRNSF-GF LIRRARY ) ) i
47,853.00 A4 ) 0 0043797 DLET FUND 1947 WATER BOMDS 0 9 1
394,002.80 179,416.11 314,302 0 OTAL OTHER REVEWUE 303,770 303,770 303,799
b44,785.567 179, 414624 371,425 0 TOTAL REVENUE 363,77 583,790 63,70
REGUIREHENTS

DEBT SERVIGE

13,000.00 13,0400.00 13,000 0 (063507 PRINCIPAL DUE ON CITY BONDS 0 0 i)
40,009,090 L0 49,000 0 0083515 PRINCIFAL 1967 WATER RONDS 45,000 45,000 45,000
80, 000.00 00 75,000 0 0083516 PRINCIFAL 1780 WATER BONDS 105,000 105,008 105,000
85,000,490 70,400.90 70,000 O CGO6351T FRIN REVEWUE BUNDS/STATE OFF 5,000 75,660 75,000
7,E55.00 00 4,580 D 0063520 INTEREST DN 1947 WATER BONDS 3,240 3,740 3,240
327,2837.59 4 344,043 0 0043521 INTEREST ON 1700 WATER BONDS 208,655 276,455 274,

158



REPRRED: 30 JULY 1963

ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY

FRIOR~2

47,718.75
1,326.00
{,119.40

Gfh, 236,05

FRIOR-1

42,267.50

884.00

128,114.55

CURRENT
BUDGET

40, 250

DEFT:

FUND:

*HEPROPOSED/REVISE

073
DERT SERVICE
023

DERT SERVICE FURD

LIHE

EST YR EXF TTEN

O DO6INZZ

0 0063501

0 0C4341Y

/7 INAL BUDGETH##

DESCEIFTION

A3 OF 30 JULY 1945

INT-BTATE OFFICE BLDG REVERUE

COUFON THT DUE ON CITY EONDS

TRUSTEE FEE STATE OFFICE ELEG

TOTAL DERT SERVICE

TOTAL RERUIRENENTS

TOTAL DEPARTHENT

TOTAL FLWND

159

FROPOSED REVISED

36,873 34,075

) 4]

2,000 2,000
563,790 543,790
Gh3,7%0 3,770
563,790 03,7570
63,77 63,790

i

A 0D

AGUFTED

<



2ed0,519.00

L0

ACTUAL EXFEND, HISTORY
#i0R~

FRIDR-1

1,969,419.08
1,698.14
124,542,71
163,330.36

DEFT: 074

WATER THFROVEMENT EOND 1980
FUND: 024

WATER IHFROVEMENT LOHD 1980

HAXPROPOSED/REVISED/FIHAL BUDGET##x

CURRENT LINE
BUDGET  EST YR EXF  ITEM  DESCRIPTION
REVENUE
TAYES
b 0 Q040010 TAYES FOR CURKENT YEAR
D 9 TOTAL TAXES
OTHER REVENUE
1,300,000 D 0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE
0 D 0040102 BACK TAXES AND INTEREST
104,000 0 0040524 INTEREST DN SAVINGS
8 0 0044401 CUSTONER SERVICE CHARGES
1, 485,05 ) TOTAL OTHER REVENUE
1,404,000 0 TOTAL REVENUE

160

PROFOSED

1,200,000
N
o

108,262

45 OF 30

REVISED

L=

1,308,262

1,200,000

<>

1,308, 7

10T
l,‘lﬁ',i-“l‘-



“REFARED, 30 JuLy 1985

ACTUAL EXFEND, 1
FRIOR -2

00

1370Ry
FRIDR-1

=

CURRENT
SUDGET

DEFT,

CITY oF THE DALLES

074

RATER IHPRUUEHEHT BOAD 1950
FUND:  gag

.

WATER IHFRDUEHENT BOND 195

**PRDPOSEDKREUI
LIKE

W 1TEM

SED/E Tnal BUDGE T3

REGUIREHENTS

DERY SERV g

0 0oazson FRINCIPaL DUE oy CITY g

i

0 0043491 COUrgy InT pYp ON CIry EOp

0

=

l6]

05

D3

Fé

A5 OF 24 JULY

FROPOSED

REVISED

L

100,000 4,



PREFAREUS S0 JULT 1Yo

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY

FRIOR-2

109,434.55
49,688.44
.00

540,503.,42

FRIDR-1

12,512.00
32,991.24

17.93

941,510,583

CURRENT
BUDGET

0
15,000
6,000

200,000

221,000

1,183,000

1,404,000

ety U4
WATER IMFROVEMENT GOND 1980
FUND: 024

HATER IMPROVEMENT ROND 1980

¥3¥FROFOSED/REVISED/FINAL RUDGET#
LINE
5% YR EXP O ITEM

DESCRIFTION

CARITAL DUTLAY

0 DO6GB0L PURCHASE LAND/RLDG/EASERENTS
0 D04GE3L ENGINEERING & DESICGN

O DDASE7L FROJECT ADRINISTRATIVE COSTS
0 D08SBIL CONTRACT/CONTRACTORS PAYMENTS
0045399 B0 WATER BOHD-PJT CONTIHGENCY

0 TOTAL CARITAL OUTLAY

CONTIMGENCIES

O 00646551 UNAFPROPRIATED BALANCE

9 TOTAL CONTINGENCIES

TOTAL REGUIREHENTS

0 TOTAL DEFARTHENT

20,000
0
80,000
0

1,108,262

1,308,242

A5 OF 30 JULY 1985

REVISED

A
J

1,108,262

1,108,262

3 AN LT
L,uUd,LLﬁ

4
1,308,262

A 00

ARGPTED

1,108,262

1 a2
1000, L0d



FEPARED: 30 JULY 1985 OEFT: 074 A5 OF 30 JULY 1945
WATER THFROVEMENT BOND 1980
FUND: 024
WATER THFROVEMENT BOND 1980

¥4APROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGETx# A 00
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 PRIOR-1  BUDGET  E5T YR EXP  ITEH  DESCRIFTION FROFOGED  REVISED  ADOFTED
759,927.03  1,348,415.73 1,404,000 i TOTAL FUND 1,308,262 1,309,262 1,308,262

163



REFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 075 AS OF 30 JULY 1965
SELECTIVE ENFORCENENT
FUND: 025
SELECTIVE ENFORCENENT PROJECT

*EEPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGETH:¥ & 50
ACTURL EXFEMD. KISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRICR-2 FRIOK-1 BUDGET BT YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROFOSED REVISED ABOFTED
REVENUE

UTHER REVENUE

7,776.00- 14,281.42- O 0 0040101 BEGINNING EALANCE 0 0 3
74,653.00 7,048.00 0 O 0044236 GRANTS { 0 4
66,857,00 7,233,462~ ¢ ) TOTAL OTHER REVEWUE 0 0
44,857,900 7,258, 62- 0 0 TOTAL REVEMUE G { ]

REQUIREMENTS

164



WEFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTURL EXFEND. HISTORY
PRIOR-1

FRIOR~2

68,551,279

413.29

09

45,05

R

9

CURRENT
BUCGET

DEFT: 075

SELECTIVE ENFORCEMENT

FUkD: 025

SELECTIVE ENFORCEMENT PROJECT

FAAFROPDSED/REV ISCO/F INAL BUDGET##%

EST YR EXF

0

LIKE
ITEW  DESCRIFTION

PERGONAL BERVICES

0060111 REGULAR SALARIES

0 Q060175 PAYROLL EXPENSES

TOTAL PERSONAL SERVICES

MATERTALS AMD SERVICES

0062411 TRAINING & CONFERERCES

TOTAL HATERIALS 4MD SERGICES

TRANSFERS GUT

0 0064711 TRANSFER TO GEHERAL FUND

TOTAL TRANSFERS oUT

165

Lo

AS OF 20

<

0

JULY 1938

£



REPARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFT: 0735 A5 OF 30 JULY 1743
SELECTIVE ENFORCENENT
FUND: 023
SULECTIVE ENFORCEMERT FROJECT

XXEPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL GUDGETHu2 00
ACTURL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-Z FRIOR-1 BUBGET  EST YR EXP ITEW  DESCRIFTION PROFOSED REVISED ADOPTED

CAPITAL DUTLAY

.00 00 9 0 0045821 PURCHASE NEW CARS & AGSEBSORY f 0 G
00 00 0 D G06T8E8 BTRER MACHINERY & ERUIPHENT { D 0
L0 00 t 0 TOTAL CAPITAL DUTLAY ] 9 d
63,764,058 4,740.38 0 ) TOTAL REQUIREMENTS 0 { i
64,756,508 4,740,308 0 ¢ TOTAL DEFARTHENT 0 0 2
5,744.58 4,740,383 0 b TOTAL FUND t D 9

166



AEFARED: 30 JULY 1980

ACTUAL EXPEN

FR10R-2

180.09

300.00

04

« HIGTORY
FRIOR-1

DEFT: 074
CRIKE PREVENTIOR
FUND: 028
CRIHE PREVENTION PROGRAM FUND

SEAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL RUDGETH
CURRENT LIHE

BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION
REVENUE
OTHER REVERRE
1,760 0 0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE
] O 0040521 INTCREST ON GAVINGS
D O 0044355 GIFTS AND DONATIONS
300 0044258 BLOCK HOWE FUKDS
2,000 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE
2,000 t TOTAL REVENUE

167

PROFOSED

7,900

0

<>

ADOFTED

3,004



FEPARED: 30 JULY 1983

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY
ny

A0

00

00

15,400

=i
ca
.

PP
e

00

A0

84,95

R

FRIOR-1

A0

Ll

CURRENT
BUDGET

DEFT: 074

CRIME PREVENTION

Firbs 028

CRIME PREVENTION FROGRAM FUND

RAAPROPOBED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET#4¥

EST YR EXF

LINE
ITEM  DESCRIFTION

FEQUTREMENTS

HATERTALS AND BERVICES

e

0062301 OFFICE SUFPLIES

0043331 SPECIAL DEPT. SUPPLIES
0042361 OFFICE EQUIRPMENT HATNTENANCE
0062362 GENERAL EQUIFMENT MATNTENANCE
0062373 GAS, 0IL, DIESEL, LUBRICANTS
00462405 COMMUNTEATIONS

0R42411 TRAINING & CONFERENCES
0062421 INSURANCE AND EDNDS

0062423 UTILITIES

0062431 CLOTHIRG -NEZW, REPAIR &CLEAN

168

PROPOSED

600

0

300

0

aeo

200

g

REVISED

A

MoV

ALGPTED

K5 OF 30 JULY 1985

]

00

400



“REPARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPERD. HISTORY

FRIOR-2

198,06

DEFT: 074
CRIME FREVENTION
FUND: 024

CRIME FREVENTION PROGREM FUND

*AEPROFOSED/REVISED/F INAL RUDGETH##

CURRERT LINE
FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION
00 305 0 0052475 BLOCK HOME EXFENSES
225.99 200 0 0042431 WISCELLANEOUS EXPENSES
574,13 2,000 & TOTAL MATERIALS AND SERVICES
CARITAL QUTLAY
.00 0 0 0055828 OTHER MACHINERY & EGUIPHENT
00 G 0 TOTAL CARITAL CUTLAY
574,145 2,000 0 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS
274,45 2,060 i TOTAL DERARTMENT
574,15 i 0 TETAL TLND

169

FROFOSED

RS OF 30

REVISED

i

b

gl

JULY 1995

A 0

ADERTED

o>



“REFARED: 30 JULY 95

0 Oi7 oA
4l 945,00

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY
FRIOR-2 FRIOR-{
43800 2,942.90

1,605.,00 4,503.65
£0,700,00 16,320.00
42,943, 60

64,264, 55

LHY OF THE DALLFg

OEFT: 77
SEWER RESERVE Fop FUTURE PJT5
FUND: 027

SEWER DEPT SPECIAL RESERVE

170

FAGE 10y

A5 OF 30 JuLy 1985

HREROPOSED/REVISED, /£ TNt FUDGE Ts#x & 00
CURRENT LINE
BUDGET  EST YR EXP  pye DESCRIPTION FROFOSED  Revisep ADORTED
REVENUE
OTHER REVEN:E
65,943 O 0040101 ELOINMING paLance 70,000 70,000 70,000
8,000 O 0040521 INTEREST o savngs 5,000 5,000 5,000
15,000 O 0044396 CONNECTION Fers 10,000 10,060 10,000
B8, 943 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE 85,0600 85,000 25,000
88,743 0 TOTAL REVENUE 85,000 5,000 85,800



WEFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPERD. HISTORY

FRIOR-2

00

Ll

Fi1OR-1

00

CURRENT
RUDGET

DEFT: 077

SEMER RESERVE FOR FUTURE PUTS
027

SEWER DEPT SPECIAL RESERVE

FUND:

HARPROFOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGETH#%

LINE
EST YR EXP  ITEW  DESCRIPTION
REGUIREHENTS

CAPITAL QUILAY

0 0063891 RESERVE FOR FUTURE EXPANSION
0 TOTAL CAPITAL DUTLAY
0 TOTAL REBUIREMENTS

0 TOTAL DEFARTHMENT

0 TETAL FUND

171

FROFOSED

85,000

a5, 000

A5 OF 30 JULY 1985

A 00
SR AR
85,000 a5, 000
8, 000 85,000
gz,000 ql, 000
5,000 85,000

5,1}[’)0

45,000



‘HEFARED: 30 JULY 1965 DEPT: 078 A5 OF 26 JULY 1935
SLIDE AREA GRANT
FUND: D23
SLIDE AREA GRANT FUND

RRAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUBGET# ¥ b 0
ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY CURRENT LLIHE
FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDBET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION FROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED
REVENUE

OTHER REVENUE

00 00 10,000 0 0040101 BEGINNING EALANCE 0 0
.00 70,000.00 H 0 0044256 GRANTS 0 0
00 00 ) 0 0044375 INTERDEPARTHENT REVENUE b f
G0 70,000.00 19,000 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE i) 0
A0 70,000.00 10,000 b TOTAL REVENUE 0 0

172



REFARED: 30 JULY 1945

ACTURL EXFEND. HIGTORY

rRI0R-2

il

FRIOR-1

24.70

71,000,900

71,000.,00

074
SLIDE AREA GRANT
023
SLIDE AREA GRANT FUND

DEFT:

FUND 3

HIAFROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH2

CURRENT LINE
BUDGE EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIFTION
REQUIREMENTS
WATERTALS AND SERVICES
500 0 0067481 HISCELLANEQUS EXPENSES
a00 0 TOTAL MATERIALS AND SERVICES
CARITAL OUTLAY
7,500 O D0SGEAL ENGINEERING & DESIGH
7,500 0 TATAL CAFTTAL DUTLAY
10,000 D TOTAL REQUIREMENTS
15,000 9 TOTAL DEPARTHENT

o

TOTAL FUND

17 ana
20,040

173

FROPRSED

0

b

<>

A5 OF 30 JULY 1985

REVISED

f 0D



REFARED: 30 JULY 1983

ACTUAL EXPEND. RISTORY

FRIOR-2

104,545.00
10,086.00

248 ,874,00

364,475.00

FRIOR~

149,375,190
12,951, 24

056,459.00

CURRENT
BUDBGET

54,500
10,000

200,000

264,500

264,500

DEFT: 079

FEDERAL REVEHUE SRARING

FUND: 029
FEDEF

il REVENUE SHARIHG FUNDS

HAPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL EUDGET###

0

u

LIHE
VTER  DESCRIFTION

REVENUE

OTHER REVENUE

0040101 BEGINNING RALANCE
Q040521 INTEREST ON SAVINGS

0046253 FEDERAL REVEMUE SHARIRG FUNDS

TOTAL OTHER REVEWUE

TOTAL REVENUE

174

FROPLSED

29,000
10,000
745,000

A5 OF 30 JULY 1983

A 00

REVISED  ADOPTES
27,000 29,000
10,000 19,000
745,000 245,000

284,000 284,000



HERARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY

FRIOR-2

9,500.00
108,500.00
60,000.00

14,100,00

194,106,090

el
42;.
bk

,100.00

i

174,100.,00

PRIOR-1

9,500.00
£25,000.00
)

AL3.00

o
OJ

55,000,060

§5,000,00

272,913.00

272,913.00

DEPT: 079
FEDER#AL REVENUE SHARING
FUND: 02
FEDERAL REVENUE SHARING FUNDS
FRAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDBET¥#
CURRENT LINE
BUDGET EST YR EXP 1TEN DESCRIFTION
REQUIRENENTS
CAPTTAL OUTLAY
7,500 0 DO0GSEP4 R/5 HATCH HONEY/COUNTY BOOHS
13,000 O OD&3EYS R/S STREET REAPIR/HMATNTENANCE
it O D0SERTS R/S PURCHASE COMRUTER
40,000 O 0045877 R/S CITY HALL HISC pJTS
t § 0045878 R/S SEMER THFROV/PLANT HAINT
3§ b 0043900 R/5 PURCHASE HEW FIRE TRUCK
100,400 G 0065901 R/S BREWERY GRADE WIDENING
264,500 0 TOTAL CAPITAL DUTLAY
264,500 i TOTAL REGUIREMENTS
264,500 8 TOTAL DEPARTMENT

FROFOSED

74000

234,500

234,000

A5 OF 30 JULY 1983

REVISED

7y o

234,50

<

284,006

A DO

FOOPTED

7,500

d74. mhn
234,500

Lo}

Lae ]

584,000



AFMARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 079 A5 OF 30 JULY (%8
FEDERAL REVENUE SHARING
FUND: 029

FEDERAL REVENUE SHARING FUNDS

~3
Pl
n

XERPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET*#¥ & B0
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
PRIOR-2 PRIOK-1 RUDGET  EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROPOSED  REVISED  ADORTED
194,100.00  272,913.00 244,500 0 TOTAL FUND 64,000 294,000 294,000

176



KEFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: 080 A5 OF 30 JULY 1995
LAND CONSERVALON & DEVELOPHENT
FUND: 030
LAND CONSERVATION ADEVELOFYENT

HHEPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET## A 00
ACTUAL EXPERD. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
PRIOR-2 rRIGR-1 BUDGET  EST YR £XF ITEN  DEBCRIFTIGN FROFOGE REVISED ADOFTED
REVERUE
OTHER REVENUE
45,00 727.86~ &, 375 & 0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE 0 0
27.00 75,89 § 0 00400321 IMTEREST OH SAVINGS b 0
10,013.00 7,360.00 f 0 0044254 GRANTS b 0
§0,085.00 d,468.03 by 375 ) TOTAL OTHER REVERNUE 0 f
10,485,040 8,488.03 4,370 0 TOTAL REVENLE D 9

177

=S

>



ACTUAL EXP

FRICR-2

.00
10,146.60
.00

10,146,460

10 5%
Jatthadd

234,72
159,40

an

00

REFARED: 30 JULY 1965 OEPT: 030

LAKD CONSERVAION & DEVELOPHENT
Ukl 030
LAND CONSERVATION &DEVELDFNENT

$44FROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL EUDGETH

LR, RISTORY CURRENT LIKE

FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR DIF ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROFOSED
RERUIREWENTS
PERGONAL SERVICES
00 %870 0 0040111 REGULAR SALARIES 0
00 0 ¢ DCA0L1Z FART TIME/TEHF/OT GALARIES 0
.00 0 0 0040195 PAYROLL EXFENSES it
it 5,875 D TOTAL FERGDNAL SERVICES !
HATERIALS AND SERVICES
00 w0 § D0&2241 NOTICES & PUELICATIONS 0
3.48 i G 0082301 DOFFICE SUPPLIES 0
36,09 200 § 0042331 SPECIAL DEPT. SUPFPLIES 0
Ry g O 00A2301 EGPT. & MEETING RODM RERTAL U]
00 100 O 0082400 COMMUNICATIONS g

175

A5 CF 30 JULY 1785

it

& 00

ADGFTE

f



HEPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 080 aa OF 30 JULY 1583
LAND CONSERVALON & DEVELOPHENT
FURD: €30
LAND CONSERVATION SDEVELBFHENT

RRRPROPOSED/REVISEDR/FINAL BUDGETH## A 00
ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY CURRENT LIKE
FiR10R-2 PRIOR-1 BUDGET  ERT YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROPOSED REVISED ADORTED
333,75 10.00 100 D (062431 TRAINING & CONFERENCES 0] )

Bo4.40 o1.57 400 D TOTAL HATERIALS AND SERVICES D 0
11,013.00 o1.57 6y 375 0 TOTAL REQUIREHENTS 0 0
11,013.00 a1.57 6,375 D TOTAL DEFARTHENT ] 0
11,003.00 .57 6,375 D TOTAL FLHD 0 )

179



Ve A

FHEPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: 091 A5 OF 30 JULY 1985
TOURIST PRONOTIOR
FUND: 034
TOURIST PROMOTION FUND

HIEPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET#x¥ & ob

ACTUAL EXPEMD, HISTORY CURRENT LINE
Fr10R-2 FRIOR~1 BUDBET  EST YR EXP  ITEW  DESCKIPTION FROPOSE REYISED ADCFTED

REVENUE

OTRER REVEHGE
1,217.00 1,472.35 0 0 0040101 BEGINHING BALANCE 0 0 g

141,09 00 0 0 0080521 INTEREST ON SAVINGS 0 b 9

1,428,867 7,004,387 25,200 0 0047711 REC'D FROM GENERAL FUND 9 i 9
4,706,467 10,497.22 25,200 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE 0 i 9
8,786,467 10,4972.22 25,200 0 TOTAL REVERUE 0 ) 7

180



HEFARED: 30 JULY 1585

ACTUAL EXPEND, HISTORY

FRIOR-2

bylb6.51

FRIOR-1

12,250.73

12,356.73

12,250.73

~Ef 7
12,250.73

CURRENT
BUDGE

DEPT: 09

TOURIST PROMOTEION
FUND: D31

TOURTST FROMOTION FUND

FARPROPDSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH#¥
LINE
EST ¥R EXF 17EM

DESCRIPTION

RERUIREMENTS

HATERIALS AND SERY

0 0052437 CHAMBER OF COMM TOURIST PROKD

9 TOTAL MATERIALS AND SERVICES
0 TOTAL REGUIREMEHTS

g TOTAL DEPARTHENT

0 TOTAL FUND

181

PROFOSED

0

F

A5 UF 30 JULY 1985

REVISED

0

A 00

ADCFTED

o>

0



EPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: 092 AS OF 30 JULY 1923
FIRE EQUIPNENT RESERVE
FUND: 032
FIRE EQUIPHENT RESERVE FUND

#RAPROPOSED/REVIGED/FINAL BUDGETH## A 00
ACTUAL EXFEND. RIBTORY CURRENT LIKE
FRIOR-2 PRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIFTION FROPOSED REVIGED ADOPTED
REVENUE

OTHER REVENUE

£3,244,00 B3, 4594.08 106,445 0 0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE 7,500 7000 7,500
5,410,900 7,994.24 3,000 § 0040521 INTEREZST O SAVINGS 600 804 ey
15,000.00 15,000.00 15,000 0 0047711 REC'D FROM GENERAL FUND 15,000 153,000 15,000

B5,650.00  104,648.20  174,448 0 TOTAL DTHER REVENLE 23,00 23,100 23,100

£3,654,00  106,648.29  174,448 0 TOTAL REVENUE 23,100 73100 73,100

182



------ 1

FRbE 121

REFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 092 fs OF 30 JULY 1985
FIRE ERUIPMENT RESERVE
FUND: 032
FIRE EGUIFMENT RESERVE FUND

*AXPROPOSED/REYISED/F INAL BUDGET##x Ao
ACTUAL EXPEMD. HisTORY CURREHT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRICK- BUDGET  EST YR £yp VIEM  DESCRIPTION FROPOSED REVISED RUOFTE
REQUIREXENTS

CAPTTAL DUTLAY

.00 00 117,058 0 0085827 CAFITAL DUTLAY 0 0 0
R 00 7,59 O 0063893 RESERVE FOR FUTURE PROJECTS 23,100 23,1060 23,100
Ry 60 124, a45 9 TOTAL CAPITAL GUTLAY 23,180 23,100 23,100
ey .06 124,048 0 TOTAL REQUIREHENTS 23,100 23,1400 23,100
00 .00 124,648 0 TOTAL DEFARTMENY 23,100 43,109 23,809
i 00 124,448 0 TOTAL Flln 23,100 23,1060 23,100

183



HEFARED: 30 JULY 1945 DEFT: 093 &3 0F 30 JULY 1935
AMBULANCE RESERVE
FLMB: 033
AHEULANCE RESERVE FUND
RARPROPOSED/RCVISED/FINAL BUDGETH#:# A 00
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTCRY CURRENT LINE
FRIDR-2 FRIOR-1 SUDGET ST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROPDSED REWISED ADOFTED
REYENUE
OTRER REVENUE
58,384,487 46,510,067 G0,807 0 0040101 BEGINNING BRLANCE 25,500 25,000 29,040
3,126.00 4,290.26 1,800 G 6040521 IMTEREST ON SAVINGS 2,000 2,000 2,000
5,500.00 5, 000.00 5,000 & 0047711 REC’D FROM GENERAL FUHD 5,000 3,000 &, 008
44,510,467 0a,808.93 41,807 0 TOTAL OTHER REWENUE 32,000 32,008 32,000
36,510.87 05,308,973 61,807 i TOTAL REVENUE 32,000 32,000 2,000

184



REPARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEPT: 093 #5 OF 30 JULY 1985
AMBULANCE RESERVE
FUND: 033
ARBULANCE RESERVE FUND

$4¥PROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET### & 00
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
PR10R-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EX®  ITEM  DESCRIFTION FROFOSED REVISED ADOFTED
RERUIREMENTS

CAPITAL QUTLAY

00 D0 40,000 0 0065822 CARITAL OUTLAY 0 0 0
00 00 21,809 0 0045893 RESERVE FOR FUTURE FROJECTS 32,000 32,000 32,000
.00 D0 61,809 0 TOTAL CAFITAL OUTLAY 32,000 32,000 32,000
00 O 61,309 0 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS 3,000 32,000 32,000
00 00 61,809 0 TOTAL DEPARTHENT 32,000 32,000 2,000
06 D0 41,809 0 TOTAL FUND 32,000 32,000 32,000

185



REPARED: 30 JULY 1935

ACTURL EXPEND. HISTORY
FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1

$77,247.00  207,775.46
14,179.00 20,024, 10

16,350,00 14,100,900

0 27,000.00
207,776,495 243,897,536
267,776.00 268,899.55

CURRENT
BUDGET

232,774
20,000

2,000

DEFT: 094

WATER DEFT. CAPITAL RESERVE

FUMD: 034

WATER DEPT. CAPITAL RESERVE

$XHFROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL EUDGETH¥%

EST YR EXP

0

LIRE
ITEW  DESCRIFTION

REVERUE

[ITHER REVENUE

0040108 BEGIMNING RALANCE
0040521 INTEREET ON GAVINGS
0044374 CONNECTION FEES

0047712 RECETVED FROM WATER FUND

TOTAL OTHER REVENUE

TOTAL REVENUE

186

PROFDSED

296,900

22,000

&,000

326,500

A5 OF 30 JULY 19439

REVISED

94,900
22,000

8,000

()

ADOPTED



REPAKRED: 30 JULY 19785

L)

DEFT: 094

WATER DEFT. CARITAL RESERVE
FUMD: 034

WATER DEFT. CARITAL RESERVE

¥SAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL GUDGET##%

END. HISTORY CURREN LIHE
FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIFTION

REQUIREMENTS
TRANSFERS QUT

40 0 O 0084712 TRANSFER 70 WATER FUND

00 f 0 0064784 TRAN TO LANUELIDE FURD

00 0 0 TOTAL TRANSFERS OUT
CAFITAL DUTLAY

.90 i O 0045822 CARITAL OUTLAY

00 260,774 0 Q045651 RESERVE FOR FUTURE PROUECTS

00 260,774 D TOTAL CAFITAL DUTLAY

00 200,774 i TOTAL REQUIREMENTS

.00 260,774 0 TOTAL DEPRRTHENT

L0 280,774 0 TOTAL FUND

187

FROPOSED

3

236,900

324,700

£5 0F 30 JULY 1945

90,000

0
738,700

234,900

326,700

14

o
[aFy Nats
70,0409

736,50



REFARED: 30 JULY 1785

ACTUAL EXFEND, RISTORY

FRIOR-2

73,306.00
5, 606.00
.00

CURRENT
PRIOR-1 RUDGET
78,711.48 84,944
7,359.08 7,500
10,000.00 75,000
26,270,726 117,446
76,70.76 117,444

DEFT: 095
WASTERATER TREATHENT RESERVE
FUND: 035

WASTEWATER TRTHT RESERVE FUND

K¥4PROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL GUDGET*4#

LINE
EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION
REVEHUE

OTHER REVENUE

0 0040101 BEGIMNING BALANCE
0 0040521 INTEREST O SAVINGS

0 0047713 REC'D FROM WASTE WATER TRTHT.

0 TOTAL OTHER REVENLE

0 TOTAL REVENUE

188

FROPOSED

A5 OF 30 JULY 1989

B 00

REVISED

rDOFTED

129,971 129,271

16,000 19,000 16,040
25,000 2%, 000 25,000
164,270 184,371 184,274
164,271 164,270 184,271



DEFARED: T0 JULY 1983

ACTUAL EXFEND. RHISTORY

FRI0OR-2

FrIOR-1

CURRENT
BURGET

0
117,444

DEFT: 093

WASTEWATER TREATHMENT RESERVE
035

YASTEWATER TRTHT RESERVE FURD

FUNDz

FAAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINRL BUDBETH#¥
LINE
EST YR EXP ITEM

DESCRIFTION

REQUIRENENTS

CAPTTAL OUTLAY

0 0055822 CAFITAL DUTLAY

0 0065851 RESERVE FOR FUTURE PROJECTS

0 TOTAL CAPITAL DUTLAY
9 TOTAL REQUIREHENTS

0 TOTAL DEFARTHENT

g TOTAL FUND

189

PROFOSED

144,271

REVISED

0

164,271

164,271

& 00

ADOFTED



REPARED: 30 JULY 1983

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY

FRIGR-2

17,674,00
7,881.00
10,000,00

[~ ot <
0,050 00

PRIOR-1

45,555,641

3,995.2

DEFT: 0%6

FUBLIC WORKS RESERVE
FUND: 034

FUBLIC WORYS RESERVE FURD

$¥XPROFOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH#H

CURRENT LiMNE
RUDGET  EST YR EXF  ITEM  DESCRIPTION
REVEHUE
OTHER REVENUE
49,571 D (0401061 BEGINNING RALANCE
3,950 0 0040521 INTEREST OH SAVINGS
D O 0047714 REC'D FROM FUBLIC WORKS
3,531 i TOTAL DTHER REVENUE
3,531 0 TOTAL REVERUE

190

nnoEn
Ly

44,058

44,054

JULY 1963

U
22,091

44,031



HEPARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFT: 096 B9 OF 30 JUbY 1985
FUBLIC WORKS RESERVE
FUND: 034
PUBLIC WORKS RESERVE FUND

READROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET### A DO
ACTUAL EXFEND. RISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 PRIOR-1 RUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM ESCRIFTION PROPOSED REVISED ADCFTED
REGUIRENENTS
TRANGFERS GUT
00 00 30,000 0 0064714 TRAN TO ST & STORM SEMER FUKD 0 9
00 00 30,000 0 TOTAL TRANSFERS QUT 0 0

CARTTAL OUTLAY

.00 .00 0 D ODSSBIY CAPITAL DUTLAY b 0 0
.00 .00 23,531 0 0065851 RESERVE FOR FUTURE FROJECTS 44,051 14,051 44,051
00 .00 23,531 0 TOTAL CAFITAL ODUTLAY 44,051 44,031 44,051
00 .00 53,551 b TGTAL REBUIREMENTS 44,051 44,05 4,05
5 8 53,531 0 OTAL DEPARTHENT 44,05 44,05 34,05
B0 .00 53,53 0 TOTAL FUND 44,951 44,054 44,051

191



FEPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DERPT: 097 AS OF 30 JULY 1985
/

PARKS RESERVE
FUND: 037
rhrkS RESERVE FUND
HEHPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET#¥X A b
ACTUAL EXPEND, HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-Z FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EBT YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIPTION FROFOGE REVISED EHOPTED
REVEHUE
OTHER REVENUE
§,683.00 i0,423,28 11,000 0 0040101 BEGIHHING RALANCE 11,500 11,700 15,900
745,00 714.10 900 0 004DE2L INTEREST 0N GAVINES 75 730 S50
0 .00 0 0 0044393 PARK RES FHMT LIEU FRY PROFERT 0 0 |
16,423.00 11,237,358 11,700 D TOTAL GTHER REVENUE 12,650 13,650 2,830
10,423,060 11,337,338 1,900 0 TOTAL REVENUE 12,450 2,05 12,639

192



HEPRRED: 30 JULY 198%

00

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY
FRIDR-

FRI0R~1

9

CURRENT
BUDGET

0

11,900

DERT: 097

FARKS RESERVE
FUND: 037

FrRKE RESERVE FUND

REXPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET#4#
LINE

€8T YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION

REOUIREMENTS

CAFITAL OUTLAY

0 0065822 CAPITAL DUTLAY

0 GO&5E73 RIBERVE FOR FUTURE PROJECTS

0 TOTAL CAPITAL CUTLA

0 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS
0 TCTAL DEFARTHEN
{ TOTAL FURD

193

BS OF 30 JULY 1985

A GD

FROPOSED REVISED ALOFTED
4] 0 }

12,430 12,635 12,65
12,650 12,650 2,650
12,650 12,650 12,650
13,650 12,450 12,659
12,000 12,609 12,450



BCPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 073 A5 OF 30 JULY 1985
CIVIC BUILDING RESERVE
FUib: %8
CIVIC BUILDING RESERVE FUND

EAFPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET##¥ Y
CTURL EXFEND. HISTORY CURRERT LINE
PRIOR-Z PRIOK-1 RUDGET  EST YR EXP  ITEW  DESCRIFTION FROPOSED REVISED ALORTED
REVENUE

{OTHER REVEMIE

57 ,413.00 41,803.27 67,000 0 DOADI01 REGINNING BALANCE 72,000 ) 3
4,390,00 5,420,12 5,000 G 0040521 INTEREST ON SAVINGS 5,000 0 9
61,503.00 §7,273.39 72,000 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE 77,000 0 5
41,803.00 47,723.39 72,000 9 TOTAL REVENUE 77,000 ¢
REQUIRENENTS

194



REFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTURL EXFEND, HISTORY

FRICR-2

.00

FRICR-1

L0

CURRENT
BUDGET

DEFT: 078

CIVIC BUILDIKG RESERWE
Fukd: 038

CIVIC BUILDING RESERVE FUND

®ANFROFOSED/REVISED/FIHAL BUDGETH###

LINE
EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION

CAFITAL DUTLAY

0 Q045801 PURCHASE LAND/BLDG/EASENERTS

0 TOTAL CARTTAL OUTLAY
9 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS

0 TOTAL DEFARTHENT

0 TOTAL FUND

PROFOSED

REVIZED

)

i

<>

]

(o

)

Lo



"REPARED: 30 JULY 1985 OEFT: 099 A5 OF 30 JULY 1955
UMERPLOYHERT INS. RESERVE
FUND: 039
UNEMPLOYHENT INS. RESERVE FUND

RXXFROFOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH#s & Db
ACTUAL EXFEMD. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRIBR~1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION PROPOSE REVISED ADGRTED
REVENLE

(THER REVENUE

14,477.00 D434 .40 ) 0 0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE 12,000 £2,000 12,949
733,00 L0 0 0 004051 INTEREST ON SAVINGS 1,000 1,000 18
G0 00 H 0 0047710 REC/D WASTE WATER COLLECTION 1,000 1,000 1,009

L0 16,000.99 19,000 0 0247711 REC’D FROM GEMERAL FURND 10,009 10,000 10,506

B0 L0 2,500 0 0047713 REC'D FROW WASTE WATER TRTHT, 2,000 2,800 2,900

.00 .00 2,504 0 0047715 REC'D FROM STREET DEPARTHENT 2,500 2,004 2,500

A0 20 2,500 0 0047716 REC/D FROH WATER TREATHENT 2,000 2,500 2,300

B0 00 2,500 0 0047718 REC’D FROH WATER DISTRIBUTION 2,900 2,300 2,800

0 00 2,500 0 0047737 REC/D FROM PARKS & REC FUND 0 i §

196



HEFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 099 AT DF 30 JULY 1985
UNEMPLOYHENT INS. RESERVE
FUND: 939
UNENFLOYHENT INS. RESERVE FUND

FEPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDBETHx* & 00
ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION FROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED
15,210.00 15,434.40 22,500 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE 33,500 33,500 33,500
15,210,490 15,434.40 22,500 0 TOTAL REVEWUE 33,900 33,500 33,500

HATERIALS AND GERVICES

§,775.,21  15,379.55 22,500 0 0062420 RESERVE FUND-MATERIAL & SERV 13,500 33,500 33,500
3,715.70 1537955 22,500 0 TOTAL WATERIALS AND SERVICES 33,500 33,900 33,500
9,775.70 1537555 22,500 i TOTAL REQUIRENENTS 33,50 33,500 33,500
9,775.70 1537755 22,500 0 TOTAL DEPARTHENT 33,50 33,50 33,500
9,574 15,779.55 22,500 0 TOTAL FUND 3,500 33,500 33,500

197



KEPARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEFT: 081 A5 OF 20 JULY 1935
SPECIAL CORP OF ENG SEWER DEPT
FURD: 041
SiECIAL CORP OF ENG SEMER FUND

*AAPROPOSED/REVIEED/FINAL BUDGET%# (S
ACTUAL EXPEND, HIGTORY CURRENT LIRE
FRIOR-Z PRIOR- RUDGET  EST YR EXF  1TEM  DESCRIPTION FROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED
REVENUE

00 141,387.49 155,000 0 0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE 161,000 161,000 141,000
.00 15,114,648 16,000 0 0040524 INVEREST ON SAVINGS 15,800 15,000 15,740
00 00 b 0 0047210 REC'D FROM GFA 0 0 )
L0 176,502.47 145,000 ) TOTAL DTHER REVERUE 176,000 176,600 174,000
D0 17650247 145,000 9 TOTAL REVEMUE 176,000 176,000 174,000

198



MEFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: Q8! AS OF 30 JULY 1985
SPECIAL CORP OF EWG SEMWER DEFT
Fuld: 041

SFECIAL CORF OF ENG SEMER FUND
FUXPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH OO
ACTUAL EXFEND. HIGTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIDR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXF ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROPOSED REVISED EUCPTED

REGUIRENENTS

A 15,000.00 15,000 0 0064713 TRAN TO SEW TRTHT/GANT SEWER 15,000 15,600 13,000

Rl 5,000.00 3,900 & TOTAL TRANSFERS oUT 15,000 15,000 15,000

CAPLTAL DUTLAY

9 00 150,400 ¢ DDASBYI RESERVE FOR FUTURE PROJECTS 161,000 161,000 161,000
00 .00 120,000 0 TETAL CAPITAL DUTLAY 161,000 ial, 000 161,080
R 15,000,00 165,000 0 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS 174,000 174,000 27,00
R i) 15,009.00 163,000 D TOTAL DEPARTHENT 176,000 174,500 175,000
Rit 15,000.00 145,000 0 TATAL FUND 176,009 176,000 1?6.%&0

199



MEFARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPERD. HISTORY

FRIOR-2

FRIOR-A

CURRENT
BLDGET

0

47,530

49,000

DEPT: 034
SUIM POOL EATH HOUSE DEPT.
044

SWIM FOOL BATH HOUSE FUND

FLD:

XRRPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGETH#X
LINE

ITER  DESCRIPTION

REVENUE

DTHER REVENNE

0 6040101 BEGINNING BALANCE
D 0044256 GRARTS
O 0047727 REC'D FROM PARMS & REC FUND

0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE

0 TOTAL REVEMUE

200

PROPOSED

A5 OF 36 JULY 1985

REVISED

RHY

ADGRTED

L



REFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: 084 A5 OF 30 JULY 1985
SWIM POCL BATH HOUSE DEPT.
FUHD: D44
SWIH POOL BATH HOUSE FUND

¥4 ROPDSED/REVISED/F INAL RUDGET##% A 0
ACTUAL EYPEND, WISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 PRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YREYF  ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROPDSED  REVISED  ADOPTED
REQUIREMENTS

CAFITAL OUTLAY

00 .00 9,530 0 00ASBIL ENGINEERING & DESIGH 2 o 0
00 D0 82,000 0 0065881 CONTRACT/CONTRACTORS PAYHENTS 0 0
00 B0 91,53 0 TOTAL CAFITAL OUTLAY 0 0 G

CONTINGENCIES

00 50 5,000 0 0066900 QFERATING CONTINGENCIES 0 0 g
09 00 5,000 0 TOTAL CONTINGENCIES 0 0 ;
09 D0 58,5W 0 TRTAL REBUIRERENTS g ¢ ;
00 B0 94,530 0 TOTAL DEPARTHENT 0 0
80 D0 96,53 0 TGTAL FUND 0 i z

201



PREPARED: 30 JULY 1945 DEFT: 085
VIETNAN HEMORIAL FUND

FUND: 045
VIETHAM MEMORIAL FUND

#IAPROFORED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET##3

ACTURL EXFEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1 GUDGET  ERT YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION
REVENUE
THER REVENUE
00 25261.9% 2,400 G 0040101 BEGINNING BALNCE
00 68,44 120 0 0040521 INTEREST OM SAVINGS
00 175.00 380 0 0044250 GIFTS AND DONATIONS
G0 2,505.39 2900 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE
00 2,305.39 2,700 0 TOTAL REVENUE

202

FRGFDSED

A8 OF 30 JULY 1945

REVISED

& 00

ADOFTED



HEFRRED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY

00

00

6

L

00

an
L0

FRIOR-1

CURRENT
FUDGET

2,700

DEFT: 085

VIETNAN MENORIAL FUND

FUNDz

043

VIETHAN HEMORIAL FUND

®AXPROPOSED/REVISED/F THAL BUDGETH#%

EST YR EXP

LINE

VTEM

DESCRIFTION

REQUIRERERNTS

MATERTALS AND SERVICES

¢ 0052331 SPECYAL DEPT. SUPFLIES

9

006365

TOTAL MATERIALS

CREITAL QUTLAY

TOTAL CAFITAL O

1T
UL

D

TOTAL REQUIREMENTS

TOTAL DEPARTHENT

TOTAL FUND

203

Ay

0042472 STREET & TRAFFIC LIGHTING

SERVICE

0045830 THPROVEMENTS BY CONTRACTORS

L RESERVE FOR FUTURE FROJECTS

o3

PROFOSED

300

A5 OF 30 JULY 1985

REMISED

300



FEPARED: 30 JULY 1983 DEPT: 0BY

WATER DEPT EQ&FAC REFLACEMENT
FuND: 0479
WATER DEPT ERAFAD REFLACE FUND

$RRPROPOSED/REVIGED/FINAL BUDGETH¥
ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY CURRER LINE
PRIOR~2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEX  DESCRIPTICH

REVENUE

OTHER REVEMUE

00 .00 27,000 0 0040101 BEGINNING RALANCE

00 00 1,504 0 0040321 INTERESRT ON SAVINGS

U0 00 27,000 0 0047712 RECEIVED FROM WATER FUND
0o 00 35,500 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE

00 00 53,590 0 TOTAL REVEMUE

204

FROPOSED

A5 OF 20 JULY 1985

REVISED

ce '
o5,000

4,000

Y

AROFTED

[ 4
gl

0

0

4,400



REPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 089 #5 OF 30 JULY 1935
i WATER DEFT EGFAC REPLACENENT
FUND: 047
BATER DEPT EOAFAC REPLACE FUHD

#ARPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET 3 koo
ACTUAL EXPEMD. HISTORY CURRENT LIME
FRIOR-2 PRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST ¥R EXP ITEM  DEBCRIFTION PROPOSED REVISED ADOFTED

REBUIREHENTS

TRANSFERS CUT

D4 00 27,000 O 0064712 TRANSFER TO WATER FUND 0 7 0

GO R 27000 0 TOTAL TRANSFERS OUT 0

<>

CAPTTAL DUTLAY

00 00 28,500 0 Q085RYT RESERVE FOR FUTURE PROJECTS 57,000 59,000 57,0040
00 00 28,500 0 TOTAL CAPITAL OUTLAY 59,000 59,000 Y, 000

0D .00 55,500 0 TOTAL REGUIREMENTS 59,000 9,000 59,000
00 00 55,500 0 TOTAL DEPARTHENT 57,000 59,500 59,000
.00 .09 55,500 0 TOTAL FUND 9,000 59,000 59,00

205



FEPARED: 30 JULY 1533

ACTUAL EXPEMD. HISTORY

R10R~2 PRIOR-1
00 .00
00 290.99
.00 4,636.00
00 4,924.99
.09 6,926.99

DERT: 090

NATATORTUM CARITAL INP RESERVE
FUND: 050

HATATORIUN CAFITAL WP RESERVE

HAAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH::
CURRENT LIKE
BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION

REVENUE

OTHER REVENUE

by b3 0 0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE

00 O 0040321 INTEREST QW GAVINGS
39,500 0 0047737 REC'D FROM FARKS & REC FUND
56,636 0 TOTAL DTHER REVERLE

44,634 0 TOTAL REVENUE

206

on]
Lo ]

KE OF
FROPOSED REVISED
D
4]
0
0
0

JULY 1785

A O

ADOFTED

<n



FEFARED: 30 JULY 1995

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRERT
R fmee o R
.00 .00 46,636
00 .00 44,436
.00 .00 44,436
.00 .00 46,436
.00 00 45,834

DEFT: (090

RATATORIUM CARITAL IMP REBERVE
030

NATATORIUN CAPITAL 1HP RESERVE

FUMD:

EAXPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET#¥
LIHE
ITEN  DESCRIFTION

REGUIREHENTS

CAPITAL OUTLAY

0 D065822 CAFITAL DUTLAY

g TOTAL CAPITAL QUTLAY
0 TOTAL REQUIREHENTS

0 TOTAL DEFARTHENT

0 T0TAL FUHD

207

PROFOSED

A5 OF 30 JULY 1780

REVIZED

]

0

A D0

ALGRTED

i



TEFARED: 30 JULY 1985

CTURL EXFEND. HISTORY

FRIOR-2

FRIOR-1

.00

CURRENT
FUDGET

5,000

LEFT: 038

STATE HIST PRESERVATION GRANT

FUND: O3

STATE HIST PRESERVATION GRANT

REAPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET®#H
LINE

ERT YREXFP  ITEM  DESCRIFTION

REVENUE

OTHER REVERLE

D 0044236 GRANTS

0 TOTAL DTHER REVERLE
0 TOTAL REVENUE
REBUTREMENTS

FERSONAL SERVICES

O 0040L1L REGULAR SALARIES

O D0ADITE FAYROLL EXPENGES

0 TOTAL PERBONAL SERVICES

208

A5 OF 30 JULY 1783

PROPOSED  REVISED
4,000 4,060
4,000 4,000
4,000 4,600

0 6
b 0
0 9

A DG

ADOFTED



HEMRKED: 30 JULY 1¥dh veFl:  Odd fo OF 30 JULY 1785
STATE HIST FRESERVATION GRANT
FUD: 031
STATE HIST PRESERVATION GRANT

*AXFROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGETH# fob
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTERY CURRERT LIHE
FRIOK~Z PRIOR-1 BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION FROPOSED REVISED ROCFTED

CONTRACTUAL BERVICES

.00 .00 3,000 § 0061215 CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 4,000 4,000 4,600
00 00 3,000 0 TOTAL CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 4,000 3,000 4,000
00 .00 5,000 0 TOTAL REQUIRENENTS 4,000 4,000 4060
60 0 5,000 6 TOTAL DEPARTHENT 4,000 4,060 4,600
.00 00 5,000 0 TOTAL FUND 4,000 4,000 4,000

209



WEFAREDS S0 JULY 1Y% DEFIs 048 A5 OF 30 JULY 1995
L.E.D.CL §2
FUNDs 52
L.C.D.C, 42

+IXFROPUSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET*¥4 00
ACTUAL EXPEND. WISTORY  CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 PRIR-1  BUDGET  ESTYREXP  ITEN  DESCRIPTION PROPOSED  REVISED  ADORTED
REVENUE

OTHER REVERNUE

00 0D Jyud 0 0044256 GRANTS i it 9
00 A0 3,500 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE ] 0 0
00 09 3,300 0 TOTAL REVEMUE 0 0 )
REQUIREMENTS
CONTRACTUAL SERVICES
L0 L0 3,500 O (061215 CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 0 G
L0 00 3,300 0 TCTAL CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 9 0 )
00 L0 3,500 | TCTAL REGUIREHENTS b ] B
A0 .00 3,000 G FOTAL DF™ TMEHT 0 0 b

210



REPARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEPT: (B4 A5 OF 30 JULY 1983
L.C.D.C. #2
FUND: 032
L.C.0.C. %2
FAXPROPDSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH##3 A 00
ACTUAL EXPEND. HIBTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET 5T YR EXP ITEM DESCRIPTION FROPRSED REVISED ADOPTED
00 00 3,500 0 TOTAL FUND 0 0 9

211



FEPARED: 30 JULY 1983

ACTURL EXFEND, HISTORY

FR10R~-2 FRIOR-1
00 00
00 00
LG .00
] 00
.00 L0
.00 A0

OEPT: 087

D5LG GRANT
Fukds 053

05LG GRANT

*AAPROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL BUDGET##
CURRENT LINE

BUDGET  EST YR EXP  YTEM  DESCRIPTION
REVERUE
OTHER REVENUE
28,700 & 0044206 GRANTS
26,700 0 TOTAL OTHER REVERUE
28,700 Q TOTAL REVENUE
RERUIREMENTS
PERSONAL SERVICES
16,000 0 0040111 REGULAR SALARIES
6,240 0 0060195 FAYROLL EXPENSES
22,240 f TOTAL PERSONAL SERVICES

212

A5 OF 30 JULy 1983

FROPOSED RENMISED
0 0
0 )
0 9
0 0
{ ]
0 o

# 00

ADDFTED



HEPARED: 30 JULY 1785

ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY

FRIDR-2

.00

04

A0

FRIOR-1

00

00

.00

00

CURRENT
RUDGET

DEFT: 047
USLG GRANT
FURD: 053
OSLG GRANT

*ARPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL GUDGET# ¥
LIHE

EST YR EXP  ITEM  DESCRIPTION

MATERTALS AND SERVICES

0 0062418 LIBRARY BOOKS & BINDING

0 0052481 HISCELLANEOUS EXFENSES

9 TOTAL MATERIALS AND GERVICES

CARITAL QUTLAY

0 D0ASELY PURCHASE NEYW OFFICE EBUIFMENT

0 TOTAL CAPITAL DUTLAY
0 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS

0 TOTAL DEPARTHMENT

0 TOTAL FUND

FROPOSE

&5 OF 30 JULY 193¢

REVISED

]

<3

A Do

ADOFTED



TEFARED: 30 JulY 1985

ACTUAL EXFERD. RISTORY

FRIOR-2

00

00

CURRENT
FRIGR-1 BUDGET
A0 0
00 0
L0 0
090 0
.00 0

DEFT: 204

KELLY AVE LANDSLIDE DEFT,
FuNp: 034

KELLY RVE LANDSLIDE FUND

¥XXFROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL EUDGET
LINE

EGST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION

REVENUE

OTHER REVENUE

=

0040101 REGINNING BALANCE
0 0040321 INTEREST ON SAVINGS
0 0047732 REC'D FROM WATER RESERVE FUND

0 TOTAL DTHER REVENUE

0 TOTAL REVENUE

214

0
8,000

0,000

92,000

A5 OF 30 JULY 19935

93,000

f G0

ADOFTED

9
8,000
90,000



YEPARED: 30 JULY 1985

ACTURL EXPEND.

FRIOR-2

00

15

By

DEPT: 204

HELLY AVE LANDSLIDE DEFT,
FUNDs 034

KELLY AVE LANDSLIDE FUND

E¥APROFOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDRET##
CURRENT LINE
BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM

PERCRIFTION

REBUIREHENTS

THANSFERS QUT

0 0 0064751 JOINT USE OF MEN & EQUIPHENT
0 0 TOTAL TRANSFERS OUT

CAPITAL DUTLAY

9 O 0055831 ENGINEERTNG & DESIGN
9 0 0065881 CONTRACT/CGHTRACTORS PAYHENTA
0 0 TOTAL CAPITAL OUTLAY

a 9 TOTAL REQUIREMENTS
] 4 TOTAL DERARTHENT
0 TOTAL FUND

215

3,800

65,600

A5 OF 30 JULY 1985

25,00
45,000

98,000

RV

ATV
ﬂuuFTEE

........



{EFARED: 30 JULY 1985 DEFT: 203 A5 OF 30 JULY 1985
WASTEWATER COL REPLACEMNT FUND
FUND: 033
WASTERATER COL REFLACEHNT FUND

EXEPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH:# o
ACTUAL EXPEND, HISTORY CURRERTY | INE
FRIOR-Z PRIOR-1 EUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEK  DESCRIPTION FiROFDSED REVISED ADOPTED
|
REVENUE

OTHER REVENUE

00 00 0 2 0040101 BEGINNING BALANCE 0 b )
LU0 09 G 0 0040521 INTEREST OH SAVINGS 1,000 1,090 Lyutg
00 00 0 0 0047710 REC’'D WASTE WATER COLLECTION 20,000 20,000 20,060
’ e b i e e e e P e wm e ———— B e L S - -
00 : .00 0 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENUE 21,000 21,000 21,000

Ri 00 0 0 TOTAL REVENUE 21,000 21,000 21,000

216



YEFAREDs 30 JULY 1985

ACTUAL EXPERD. RISTORY

FrI10R-2

.00

FRIOR-1

00

DEPT: 204

8T ERIDGE REPLACEMENT DEFT,
FUND: 054

5T BRIDGE REPLACEMENT FUND

¥AXPROFOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGETH##

CURRENT LINE
BUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION
REVENUE
{THER REVENUE
0 0 004010 BEGINHING RALANCE
9 0 0040521 TNTEREST QN SAVINGS
0 D 0047714 REC'D FROM FUBLIC WDRKS
) 0 TOTAL DTHER REVENUE
0 9 TOTAL REVENUE

218

FROPOSED

&S OF 30 JULY 1985

REVISED

60,000

49,000



EPRRED: 30 JULY 1965 DEPT: 204 A5 OF 30 JULY 1985
5T GRIDGE REPLACEMENT DEFT,
FUND: D30
51 ERIDGE REPLACENENT FUND

KEAPROPOSED/REVISED/FINAL BUDGET¥4* A 0D
ACTUAL EXPEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 PRIOR-1 SUDGET  EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIFTION _ PROFOSE REWISED ADOFTED

REQUIRENENTS

CAPITAL OUTLAY

A0 .00 0 0 0045822 CAPITAL OUTLAY 60,000 40,500 43,000
00 .00 D 0 TOTAL CAPITAL QUTLAY 40,000 40,000 40,000
00 00 0 0 TOTAL RERUIREMENTS 65,000 40,000 50,000
00 00 0 0 TOTAL DEPARTHENT 40,000 40,000 £0,000
.00 00 0 0 TOTAL FUND 40,000 40,000 40,000

219



FEFARED: 30 JULY 1905

ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY

00

CURRENT LINE
PRIOR-1 BUOGET  EST YR EXF ITEW  DESCRIPTION
{EVEHUE
DTHER REVENLE
.00 14,000 0 0044236 GRANTS
00 0 0 0047709 REC'D FROM SENIOR CENTER DNC,
00 14,000 0 TOTAL OTHER REVENJE
00 10,000 0 TOTAL REVENUE
REQUIREMENTS

DEPT: 207

SENIOR CENTER GRANT DEFT,
FUND: 057

SENIOR CENTER GRENT FUMD

*¥APROPOSED/REVISED/F INAL QUDGETH##

220

FROPOSED

739,500
107,000

344,500

REVISED

346,560

JULY 1985

A 0

ADORTED

239,500

107,009

346,50



nl
=
a5
o0
r 1

: 30 JULY 19835 DEPT: 207 45 0F 30 JULY 1985
SENIOR CENTER GRAMT DEFT,
Fudb: 057
SENIDR CENTER GRANT FUND

HUEPROPOSED/REVIBED/F INAL BUDGET#u# A0
ACTUAL EXFEND. HISTORY CURRENT LINE
FRIOR-2 FRIOR-1 BUDGET ~ EST YR EXP ITEM  DESCRIPTION PROPOSED REVISED HOOPTED

CONTRACTUAL BERVICES

00 00 0 O 0061201 REGULAR AUDITING 1,500 1,500 1,500
.00 00 0 0 0061215 CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 7,000 7,000 7,000
00 00 0 0 TOTAL CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 8,500 3,500 3,501

CAPITAL BUTLAY

00 00 16,000 0 0045B3! ENGINEERING & DESIGN 3,000 3,000 3,000
00 A0 0 0 0063081 CONTRACT/CONTRACTORS PAYMENTS 332,000 332,000 332,000
0 .00 10,000 0 TOTAL CARITAL QUTLAY 335,000 335,000 I35, 000

221



